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Hocking, Calvin speak with FCA employees about canine companions and how they help people.

Fiat Chrysler recently went to
the dogs – and that was a very
good thing.

When Canine Companions for
Independence recently visited
FCA US’s headquarters last
month, the most popular repre-
sentative of the organization was
Calvin, a canine companion in

training, said Edward Cardenas,
Multimedia editor for Fiat
Chrysler.

“Why did he attract so much
attention?” Cardenas said. “It is
not often a puppy visits the office
during a workday.”

The mission of the organiza-
tion, which provides service

dogs to children, adults and vet-
erans with disabilities, or the on-
going partnership between Ca-
nine Companions for Independ-
ence and Chrysler, everyone in
attendance gravitated to him.

Calvin, and his volunteer

It was a Golden Day for Dog Lovers at FCA
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Detroit Three Auto Sales Mixed for 2017

FCA US in December of 2017
had sales of 171,946 units, an 11
percent decrease compared with
sales in December 2016 (192,519
units).

In December, retail sales of
150,772 units were down 3 per-
cent compared with the same
month in 2016 and represented
88 percent of total sales, said
FCA spokesman Jeff Bennett.

In line with FCA’s strategy to
reduce sales to the daily rental
segment, fleet sales of 21,174
units were down, as expected, 42
percent year over year. The
largest planned volume reduc-
tion in December fleet sales
came from the Jeep brand,
which reduced its fleet sales
number by 75 percent year over
year.

Fleet sales represented 12 per-
cent of total FCA US December
sales.

The Chrysler Pacifica minivan
posted an 8 percent year-over-

FCA Sees Slight
Decline in Sales

For the Year

There was good news for Ford
and fans of the F-150 pickup
truck.

Edmunds, the car shopping
and information platform, and
the Consumer Technology Asso-
ciation (CTA), the producer of
Consumer Electronics Show
(CES), named six of the seven
winners of the inaugural Ed-
munds CES Tech Driven Awards,
with the F-150 taking top honors
in the Most Innovative Truck cat-
egory.

The awards, announced Jan. 4,
recognize the automakers at CES
that have developed the most
forward-thinking vehicles and
technology features available for
car buyers to purchase in 2018,
said CES spokeswoman Leah
Polk.

The seventh award category
honors the most transformative
new concept vehicle or automo-
tive technology announced at
CES, and the winner will be
named during the show.

“CES has become a premier
venue for automakers to debut
and showcase their most pro-
gressive visions for the future of
mobility,” said Alistair Weaver,
Edmunds v.p. of editorial and ed-
itor-in-chief.

“The winners of the Edmunds
CES Tech Driven Awards repre-
sent some of the most innova-
tive thinking in automotive and
celebrate the technologies that
are transforming personal trans-
portation.”

The winners of the 2018 Ed-
munds CES Tech Driven Awards
are:

• Most Innovative Truck: Ford

Edmunds Names
F-150 ‘Most

Innovative Truck’

General Motors delivered
3,002,241 vehicles in the United
States in 2017, including more
than 1.3 million trucks and
965,090 crossovers.

In the process, GM set new an-
nual sales records for pickup and
crossover deliveries, electric ve-
hicles sales, average transaction
prices and more. GM also re-
duced year-end inventories more
than its target. Inventories were
752,554 units, down 90,000 from
a year ago.

Days supply was 63 days, said
General Motors spokesman Jim
Cain.

Chevrolet has been GM’s most
powerful growth engine, Cain
said. The brand delivered year-
over-year retail market share in-
creases in 2015, 2016 and 2017.

Since the end of 2014, Chevro-
let’s retail share has grown from
10.2 percent, according to Polk
registration data, to an estimated
11.2 percent.

GM crossover deliveries were
up 17 percent year over year,
driven by record sales of the
Chevrolet Equinox, Traverse and
Trax, as well as the Buick Envi-

sion, Buick Encore and GMC Aca-
dia.

GM grew its retail share of the
crossover market more than any
other automaker, according to
the latest J.D. Power PIN esti-
mates, Cain said. GM’s retail
share grew 1.6 percentage points
to 13.1 percent. The only other
major automaker to gain retail
share was up less than one point.

Chevrolet became the indus-
try’s fastest-growing crossover
brand in 2017 based on retail
market share, with the all-new
Equinox and Traverse gaining
more than one point of share in
their respective segments. Equi-
nox retail deliveries were up 21
percent and Traverse was up 31
percent. The Trax was up 5 per-
cent.

Crossovers helped Buick deliv-
er its best calendar year sales
since 2004. The Buick Encore de-
livered its best year ever. It has
been Buick’s volume leader for
three straight years.

Crossovers now account for
more than 80 percent of Buick’s

Trucks Drove GM Sales

The numbers are in for Ford in
2017, and they are good.

“December capped off a
record year for Ford brand SUVs,
making it eight consecutive
years of Ford brand sales leader-
ship. F-Series had an unbeliev-
able year as we sold nearly
900,000 pickups, with strong
high-end truck demand as cus-
tomers continue to opt for our
latest technology and equipment
packages,” said Mark LaNeve,
Ford vice president, U.S. Market-
ing, Sales and Service.

Demand for F-Series was
strong all year, with customers
requesting the newest technolo-
gies in our high-series trucks.
High-series Super Duty and new
2018 F-150 trucks pushed overall
F-Series ATPs to a new record
level of $47,800 per truck, $3,400
higher than a year ago, LaNeve
said.

And in 2017 Edge sales totaled
142,603 vehicles, representing a

December Caps
Off Good Year

For Ford
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The 2019 Corvette ZR1 is coming to the 2018 Detroit Auto Show.

Now that January is upon De-
troit, people are getting ready for
the 2018 North American Interna-
tional Auto Show (NAIAS), and
that’s good news for Corvette
fans.

GM spokesman Tom Read said
that one of the new vehicles that
will be on display at the show is
the the 2019 Corvette ZR1 and
the the ZR1 convertible, the first
ZR1 drop-top since the original
1970 model-year ZR1.

On sale in the spring alongside
the Corvette ZR1 coupe, the ZR1
convertible emphasizes Corvette’s

iconic proportions and functional
sculpture, highlighting the seam-
less transition between the exte-
rior and interior.

The ZR1 coupe will carry a
suggested retail price of
$119,995, while the ZR1 convert-
ible will start at $123,995 (prices
include destination charge, but
exclude tax, title and other deal-
er fees).

“The new Corvette ZR1 convert-
ible is a supercar in all respects,”
said Mark Reuss, executive vice

NAIAS Show Gives Locals
Chance to See New ’Vette
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Starting in the beginning of De-
cember General Motors Co.
rolled out the automotive indus-
try’s first commerce platform for
on-demand reservations and pur-
chases of goods and services.
With Marketplace, drivers can
now order and pay for their fa-
vorite coffee – and much more –
on the way to work with a simple
tap on the dash.

Marketplace allows customers
to order food, find the closest
gas station to save on fuel, and
make dinner reservations on the
go, said GM spokesman Vijay Iy-
er.

This means Marketplace gives
drivers of eligible Chevrolet,
Buick, GMC and Cadillac vehicles
the opportunity to more safely
interact with a growing number
of their favorite brands in retail,
fuel, hospitality, food, hotel and
transportation through the in-ve-
hicle touchscreen.

Marketplace, Iyer said, also
features a “Shop” section dedi-
cated to offers specific to GM ve-
hicles, for instance purchasing
Wi-Fi data, discounts for an oil
change or deals on General Mo-
tors accessories. Simple on-
screen notifications can identify
relevant offers.

“The average American spends
46 minutes per day on the road
driving. Leveraging connectivity
and our unique data capabilities,
we have an opportunity to make
every trip more productive and
give our customers time back,”
said Santiago Chamorro, vice
president for Global Connected
Customer Experience, GM.

“Marketplace is the first of a
suite of new personalization fea-
tures that we will roll out over
the next 12 to 18 months to near-
ly four million U.S. drivers.”

Leveraging the embedded 4G
LTE connectivity, Chamorro said
GM is adding Marketplace to mil-

lions of existing 2017 and 2018
model-year cars, trucks and
crossovers that have compatible
infotainment systems, with con-
tinued rollout to compatible new
vehicles.

A separate data plan is not re-
quired to use Marketplace.

“For most retailers and con-
sumer brands the daily commute
is the only time not accessible in
a consumers’ day,” said Chamor-
ro. “Marketplace gives mer-
chants the ability to more safely
engage with drivers and passen-
gers in a meaningful way that
provides true value for our cus-
tomers.”

Marketplace is designed to be
used while driving, Iyer said. It
uses machine learning from real-
time interaction data, such as lo-
cation, time of day and a driver’s
established digital relationship
with third-party merchants, to of-
fer highly personalized experi-
ences.

Adhering to industry distract-
ed driving guidelines, as well as
GM’s strict in-house safety guid-
ing principles, Chamorro said
GM designs its in-vehicle sys-
tems to minimize manual interac-
tions, helping drivers keep their
eyes on the road and their hands
on the wheel.

GM lets customers buy 4G LTE
Data packages, extend their On-
Star subscription or receive of-
fers for certified service, parts
and accessories for their specific
vehicle, Iyer said.

The first brands accessible
through Marketplace include:

• Starbucks offers another
convenient way for customers to
order ahead and enjoy their fa-
vorite handcrafted beverage or
food item. And as part of the
Starbucks Rewards program,
members enjoy more value by
earning Rewards towards free
food and drink. (Early 2018)

• Dunkin’ Donuts will help cus-
tomers start their day off right
through an experience that al-
lows DD Perks members to pre-
order and pay onscreen for their
favorite coffee and donut, at
their preferred pickup location.

• Wingstop will allow you to
skip the wait by re-ordering your
favorites and paying ahead, so
you can get home in time for the
big game

• TGI Fridays will let cus-
tomers schedule a table reserva-
tion for them and their closest
friends and family when they
need a break from the week.

• Shell will enable the excep-
tional driver experience, provid-
ing ease of payment and savings
with INSTANT GOLD STATUS in
the Fuel Rewards program. Cus-
tomers’ closest Shell station will
be identified and station ameni-
ties showcased among the
largest fuel station network in
the U.S., with the ability to pay
in-dash coming soon.

• ExxonMobil will quickly lo-
cate Exxon and Mobil fuel sta-
tions with details of what they of-
fer, route you there and get you
back on the road faster.

• Priceline.com gives drivers
access to hundreds of thousands
of hotels and exclusive hotel sav-
ings on the go.

• Parkopedia allows drivers to
find, reserve and pay for parking,
all at the click of a button.

• Applebee’s ensures cus-
tomers are never too far from
Eatin’ Good in the Neighborhood
whether close to home or miles
away with the ability to locate
their nearest restaurant, order

featured menu items and reorder
recent favorites through the con-
venience of their vehicle’s touch-
screen.

• IHOP makes it easy for
guests to enjoy hot, fresh all-day
breakfast favorites like fluffy but-
termilk pancakes on the go,
thanks to safe and secure on-
dash ordering and location serv-
ice capabilities that help search
and find the nearest restaurant
for pickup.

• delivery.com empowers the
neighborhood economy by en-
abling customers to order online
from their favorite local restau-
rants, wine and spirits shops,
grocery stores and laundry and
dry-cleaning providers.

To allow merchants to effi-
ciently and quickly integrate
their content as part of the in-ve-
hicle Marketplace ecosystem, Iy-
er said General Motors is work-
ing with three main platform
partners: Xevo (www.xevo.com)
in Seattle, Washington; Con-
versable (conversable.com) in
Austin, Texas; and Sionic Mobile
(www.sionicmobile.com) in At-
lanta. Merchants interested in
Marketplace can contact the
above platform partners or email
General Motors at Market-
place@onstar.com.
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BECKY
DOYLE
is now at…

DETROIT’S #1 CHEVY DEALER IN MIDTOWN
is now available for customers at the Ren-Cen

Contact me for the Best Chevy Deal!
BeckyD@JamesMartinDetroit.com

Direct: 313.875.0507
Main: 313.875.0500

6250 Woodward Ave.
Detroit

2017 TRAX LT

LEASE FOR

$129*PERMONTH

24MONTHS
$999DOWN

All rebates to dealer includes Chevrolet, Buick or GMC lease loyalty. Payment plus tax, title, doc fee, license and
acquisition fee $595 and downpayment $999. Requires GM Employee discount. 10,000 miles year. Disposition fee may
be required at lease turn in. With approved credit. Expires 1-12-18

10K MILES PER YEAR
STOCK #89184

2018 EQUINOX LT

LEASE FOR

$212*PERMONTH

36MONTHS
$999DOWN

10K MILES PER YEAR
STOCK #89185

2018 SILVERADO
1500 LT DBL CAB

LEASE FOR

$226*PERMONTH

24MONTHS
$999DOWN

10K MILES PER YEAR
STOCK #89183

GM ‘Marketplace’ Tech Turns Car Into Market

Marketplace is a platform that allows shopping from a car.

DETROIT (AP) – Ford says it
will repair any coolant leaks that
might be found in more than
200,000 recalled vehicles that are
at risk of catching fire.

The repairs, detailed in com-
pany documents posted by U.S.
safety regulators in December,
come 10 months after the com-
pany said it would only install a
coolant level sensor “with sup-
porting hardware and software.’’

In March, the automaker an-
nounced that it would recall the
vehicles because their tur-
bocharged engines can overheat
if coolant is low, causing cylinder
heads to crack and spew oil. At
the time, Ford had reports of 29
engine fires with no injuries.

In a Dec. 13 letter to dealers,
Ford said mechanics should
check the cars for coolant leaks.
Any repairs will be part of the re-
call, the letter stated.

The December letter to deal-
ers said parts are available for
Escapes but will not be ready for
the other vehicles until January
or February.

Ford Ordering
Recall Over

Coolant Issues

DETROIT (AP) – Electric car
maker Tesla Inc. has again fallen
short of production goals for its
new Model 3 sedan.

The Palo Alto, California-based
company made 2,425 Model 3s in
the fourth quarter. That’s only a
fraction of the 20,000 per month
that CEO Elon Musk promised
last summer when the car first
went into production.

The company exceeded its
overall sales targets, delivering
101,312 Model S sedans and
Model X SUVs in 2017, up 33 per-
cent over 2016.

But all eyes are on the Model
3, which is Tesla’s first lower-
cost, high-volume car and is cru-
cial to its goal of becoming a
profitable, mainstream automak-
er. Tesla at one point had more
than 500,000 potential buyers on
the waiting list for the Model 3.
In a statement Jan. 3, the compa-
ny thanked those buyers “who
continue to stick by us while pa-
tiently waiting for their cars.’’

Tesla says it made significant
progress in reducing unspecified
production bottlenecks toward
the end of the fourth quarter. It
now expects to be making 10,000
Model 3s per month at the end of
the first quarter and 20,000 Mod-
el 3s per month at the end of the
second quarter.

But the company said it’s fo-
cusing on quality and plant effi-
ciency, not just meeting volume
targets.

Michelle Krebs, an executive
analyst for the car buying site
Autotrader.com, said Tesla
would have been better served
by not announcing such lofty
production targets initially.

Tesla is Still
Short of

Sales Goals

http://www.detroitautoscene.com
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trainer Fran Hocking, are local
representatives for Canine Com-
panions for Independence and
shared anecdotes about being
part of the organization.

“I picked Canine Companions
because of their history of breed-
ing quality dogs and their train-
ing program,” said Hocking, of
Wixom, who is now training her
fifth puppy for the organization.
“If I was going to donate my re-
sources and my time to raise a
puppy, I wanted to make sure it
was really free to the recipient.”

Calvin is one of more than 200
Canine Companions for Inde-
pendence puppies who are in the
midst of 14 to 18 months of train-
ing with volunteer puppy raisers
such as Hocking. These puppy
raisers provide basic obedience
training, socialization and care.

The 42-year-old organization
has a presence in all 50 states,
with more than 3,000 volunteers

nationwide and more than 5,200
placements of a person and a
dog during that time, Cardenas
said.

One of Calvin’s peers, a gold-
en/Labrador retriever cross
named Foley, is being featured in
an online social initiative by
Chrysler and Canine Compan-
ions for Independence to chroni-
cle his growth and raise aware-
ness for the organization’s “Give
a Dog a Job” campaign.

“(These dogs) enhance the
lives of children, adults and vet-
erans with disabilities by provid-
ing them highly trained assis-
tance dogs by helping them with
practical everyday tasks as well
as providing unconditional love,”
said Danielle Scerbovsky, devel-

opment director, Donor & Corpo-
rate Engagement for Canine Com-
panions for Independence.

Scerbovsky, who shared the in-
formation about the organiza-
tion’s history, mission and reach
with FCA employees, also took
time to recognize the contribu-
tions of Hocking and other volun-
teers.

“We couldn’t do it without
these volunteers,” she said.
“They cover food. They cover vet
checks, obedience classes and
more. That is a substantial sav-
ings for our organization.”

To learn more about the part-
nership between Chrysler and
Canine Companions for Inde-
pendence, and to donate, visit
www.driveindependence.org.
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SERVICE PICK-UP & DELIVERY TO DOWNTOWN EMPLOYEES

YYoouurr OOnnllyy
VVaalleett GGMM DDeeaalleerr
Only 6 Blocks From Downtown & GM RenCen

$3995 OIL CHANGE & TIRE ROTATION
Includes up to 

5 qts. of Dexos Oil VALET PICK-UP OR SHUTTLE PICK-UP/DELIVERY

866-225-1775
www.jeffersonchevrolet.com

2130 E. JEFFERSON AVENUE
6 Blocks East of the GM RenCen • Detroit

SERVICE HOURS: Mon-Fri 7am-6pm
CLOSED SATURDAY & SUNDAY

***WHILE FLEX CASH LASTS.

GM
Hamtrack Plant

SHOWROOM HOURS:   MON. & THURS. 8:30AM-8PM / TUES., WED. & FRI. 8:30AM-6PM /

N

2017 IMPALA  LS Stk#17155

SAVE OVER $8,000NOW
$20,899

WAS
$28,945

PW/PL
KEYLESS ENTRY
AM-FM-XM STEREO
ONSTAR

NOW
$26,995

WAS
$35,290

3.6 V6 DI, VVT
POWER SUNROOF
AM-FM-XM STEREO
KEYLESS ENTRY 
WITH REMOTE START

ONSTAR

2017 CRUZE LTHATCHBACK Stk#17107

SUN & SOUND PACKAGE
8WAY POWER SEAT
HEATED SEAT
BOSE SPEAKER SYSTEM

2017 BLOW OUT SALE

IMPALA  BASED ON GM EMPLOYEE PRICING JUST ADD TAX, TITLE, DOC FEE, ALL REBATES TO DEALER INCLUDE GM LEASE LOYALTY AND PURCHASE PROGRAM***.  EXP. 1/31/18

CAMARO BASED ON GM EMPLOYEE PRICING JUST ADD TAX, TITLE, DOC FEE, ALL REBATES TO DEALER INCLUDE CHEVROLET LOYALTY,  GM TARGET MARKET  CASH OFFER***.  EXP.
1/31/18

CRUZE  BASED ON GM EMPLOYEE PRICING WITH WELL APPROVED GM FINANCIAL LEASE CREDIT.  JUST ADD TAX, TITLE, DOC FEE,  ALL REBATES TO DEALER INCLUDES GM  LEASE
LOYALTY AND PURCHASE PROGRAM*** . EXP. 1/31/18

NOW
$16,795

WAS
$25,440

2017 CAMARO 2LT Stk#17010

SAVE OVER $8,200

SAVE OVER $8,6000

The interior of the 2019 Corvette ZR1. The 2019 ZR1’s exterior has taken the Corvette to the next level.

tive vice president, Global Prod-
uct Development, Purchasing
and Supply Chain. “Few others
can challenge the ZR1 convert-
ible’s power and speed while of-
fering the exhilaration of top-
down motoring.”

The performance and technol-
ogy introduced on the Corvette
ZR1 coupe carry over to the new
ZR1 convertible. The strength of
the Corvette’s aluminum chassis
means the only structural
changes in the convertible are
accommodations for the folding
top and repositioned safety belt
mounts. The power top can be
operated remotely or while driv-
ing up to 30 mph.

“The ZR1 convertible is a no-
compromise supercar,” said
Corvette Executive Chief Engi-
neer Tadge Juechter. “Thanks to
the strong structure, the suspen-

sion tuning between coupe and
convertible models is identical,
meaning the ZR1 convertible of-
fers the same benchmark per-
formance, including a top speed
of over 200 mph.”

The Corvette ZR1’s unique
aero package is central to the
coupe’s 212-mph top speed. Its
standard, stanchion-mounted
Low Wing generates road-holding
downforce with minimal drag, en-
abling the benchmark top speed.
This was evident during top-
speed testing at Germany’s Pa-
penburg proving ground.

An adjustable High Wing is
part of the new $2,995 ZTK Per-
formance Package, which also in-
cludes a front splitter with car-
bon-fiber end caps, Michelin Pi-
lot Sport Cup 2 tires and specific
chassis and Magnetic Ride Con-
trol tuning.

It is designed to help generate
faster lap times through maxi-

mum grip in the corners, with up
to 950 pounds of downforce. The
top speed is lower with the High
Wing but still exceeds 200 mph.

Complementing the ZR1’s aero
advantage on the way to 212 mph
is the thrust generated by the ex-
clusive LT5 6.2L supercharged
engine, which is rated at an SAE-
certified 755 horsepower and
715 lb-ft of torque. A seven-speed
manual transmission and a ZR1-
first paddle-shift eight-speed au-
tomatic transmission are offered
with it.

Preliminary testing has shown
0-60 mph in under 3.0 seconds
and the quarter mile in the high
10-second range when the engine
is equipped with the eight-speed
automatic.

The LT5 features a new, more
efficient intercooled supercharg-
er system, along with GM’s first
dual fuel-injection system, which
employs primary direct injection

and supplemental port injection.
Compared to the supercharger
system on the Corvette Z06’s LT4
engine, the LT5 employs a larger,
2.65-liter supercharger that gen-
erates more boost while spinning
at a slightly slower speed. That
reduces heat to help maintain a
lower air intake temperature for
optimal performance.

Four new radiators also help
manage cooling in the ZR1, which
features 13 radiators in all, in-
cluding circuits for engine oil,
transmission and differential
cooling.

Read said that the new
Corvette’s look and power level
make the car irresistable, giving
people attending NAIAS some-
thing to look forward to when
visiting the show.

Corvette Fans Can Look Forward to NAIAS

FCA Celebrated the Dog Days Last Month

CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1
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January is National Radon Ac-
tion Month, and Oakland County
Health Division encourages resi-
dents to purchase radon test kits
for only $5 this month to test
their homes for the potentially
harmful gas.

OCHD recommends testing
homes for radon during the cool-
er months as windows and
doors remain closed, said Leight-
Anne Stafford, health officer for
OCHD.

“Radon is the leading cause of
lung cancer in nonsmokers, and
the second leading cause of lung
cancer overall, but it is preventa-
ble,” said Leigh-Anne Stafford,
Oakland County health officer.
“We are offering radon test kits
at half price to help Oakland
County families protect them-
selves and their loved ones.”

Radon test kits for homes are
available for purchase at Health
Division offices in Pontiac and
Southfield. Their addresses are
North Oakland Health Center,
1200 N. Telegraph, Building 34E,
Pontiac; and South Oakland
Health Center, 27725 Greenfield
Road, Southfield.

Office hours are Monday – Fri-
day 8:30 a.m. – 5:00 p.m. To pur-
chase more than 15 radon kits,
please call 248-858-1312 to pre-
order.

Please note that Health Divi-
sion offices will be closed in ob-
servance of Martin Luther King
Jr. Day on Monday, Jan. 15.

Oakland County
Selling Radon
Testing Kits

Cold temperatures are keeping
people trapped in the house.

The Auburn Hills Library is
holding an event that can get
residents out and about.

On Wednesday, Jan. 10, from 2
to 3 p.m., Book Bingo will be
played at the Auburn Hills Li-
brary.

Enjoy the benefits of engaging
in mentally stimulating activities
like games.

interested in participating will
meet in the Library’s large meet-
ing room. The library is located
at 3400 E Seyburn Dr, Auburn
Hills.

Keep Active at
A. Hills Library
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DETROIT (AP) – Hyundai and
Volkswagen each say they’re
partnering with a U.S. au-
tonomous vehicle tech firm led
by former executives from
Google, Tesla and Uber.

The companies on Jan. 4 an-
nounced partnerships with Au-
rora Innovation, started last year
by ex-Google autonomous car
chief Chris Urmson and others.

VW says its collaboration will
help bring self-driving cars
quickly to roads worldwide,
while autonomous Hyundais are
expected to be in the market by
2021. The partnerships are the
latest in a string of tie-ups be-
tween auto companies and tech
firms as they race to be first with
self-driving vehicles.

Aurora is based in Pittsburgh
and Palo Alto, Calif. It was start-
ed last year by Urmson, former
Tesla executive Sterling Ander-
son, and ex-Uber autonomous
vehicle leader Drew Bagnell.

Terms of each partnership
were not released.

Urmson left Alphabet Inc.’s
Google in 2016 after more than
seven years of work on its au-
tonomous vehicles. At Tesla Inc.,
Anderson led development of
the company’s semi-autonomous
Autopilot system after its initial
release, and he led development
of the Model X SUV, according to
Aurora’s website. Bagnell was a
founding member of Uber Tech-
nologies Inc.’s Advanced Tech-
nology Center that’s working on
autonomous cars in Pittsburgh.

Germany-based Volkswagen
AG, which produces about 10
million vehicles annually, hopes
the tie-up will bring autonomous
vehicle technology to all of its
brands. The company says it has
been working with Aurora for
the past six months, integrating
its sensors, hardware and soft-
ware into VW vehicles.

Hyundai Motor Co. said the
partnership with Aurora will
bring autonomous vehicles to
market that can operate without
human input in most conditions.

The partnership has yet to say
how its first batch of self-driving
vehicles will be used, but ana-
lysts expect they will likely be
for commercial use, such as self-
driving taxis or ride-hailing serv-
ices, rather than for sales to indi-
vidual consumers. General Mo-
tors said in November that its
self-driving vehicles will carry
passengers and deliver goods in
big cities by 2019.

Hyundai earlier joined with
Cisco Systems Inc. and Baidu
Inc. to collaborate on internet-
connected cars. It has also set
up a $45 million fund with South
Korea’s SK Telecom and Hanwha
Asset Management to invest in
artificial intelligence startups
worldwide.

The South Korean automaker
plans to share more details of its
project with Aurora during the
Consumer Electronics Show in
Las Vegas next week, where it
will also unveil the brand name
of a new fuel-cell SUV that will be
tested for self-driving technolo-
gy.

Hyundai, VW
Partnering Up
On New Tech

DEARBORN, Mich. (AP) – AAA
Michigan says gas prices
statewide have gone up about 8
cents per gallon.

The Dearborn-based auto club
said Jan. 2 the average price for
self-serve regular unleaded gaso-
line was about $2.68 a gallon.
That price is 16 cents more than
at the same time a year ago.

Michigan’s lowest average
price was about $2.60in the Mar-
quette area. The highest was
$2.73 in the Jackson area.

State Sees Gas
Prices Go Up
In New Year

The automotive editors at Con-
sumer Guide Automotive awarded
four FCA US LLC vehicles the
2018 Best Buy distinction.

In its second year on the mar-
ket, the Chrysler Pacifica cap-
tures both the Minivan and Fami-
ly Vehicle Best Buy awards two
years in a row, said FCA
spokesman Berj Alexanian. Also
for the second consecutive year,
the Fiat 124 Spider takes home a
Best Buy award, this one in the
Sporty/Performance Car catego-
ry.

Alexanian said te Dodge Duran-
go earned the Best Buy award in
the Large SUV segment for the
sixth consecutive year and the
Ram 1500 captures the Best Buy
award for Large Pickup Trucks
for the 10th straight year.

“There's a lot of good product
hitting the market these days,
but some designs are so well ex-
ecuted that they endure the test
of new challengers. In the cases
of the Durango and Ram, that is
especially true,” said Tom Ap-
pel, publisher of Consumer
Guide Automotive. “As for the
Pacifica, it's simply one of the
most thoughtfully designed fam-
ily vehicles we've ever evaluat-
ed. Likewise, the tradition-
bound 124 Spider delivers a
considerable dose of driving
pleasure for a very reasonable
price.”

The review by editors also not-
ed that the new Pacifica matches
or beats its minivan competition
in terms of things like power, fuel
economy, the quality of the ride,
and the overall comfort of the
ride.

What cinches its Best Buy sta-
tus are its exclusive Stow ‘n Go
second-row seats and the un-
matched fuel efficiency of its
well-executed plug-in hybrid
model, along with its long list of
thoughtful available convenience
features.

Appel said editors liked the
Ram 1500 and it “is really tough
to beat for regular street driving.
It rides better than most any oth-
er pickup, has a high level of re-
finement and features, and the
base V6 – which is plenty of en-
gine for most uses – offers de-
cent fuel economy. And, the
available diesel engine offers the
best fuel economy in the class (at
least until the Ford F-150’s 3.0-
liter diesel V6 launches later in
the 2018 model year). The Ram
1500 also offers a wide choice of
trim levels—from workhorse, to
street cruiser, to luxury liner.
Even if you’re a die-hard loyalist
to another brand, you still owe it
to yourself to check out these
outstanding trucks.”

Appel said editors liked the
2018 Dodge Durango because
“has something for just about
every type of large-SUV shopper.”

The base SXT has a lot of fea-
tures for the money, while the GT
and Citadel add worthwhile luxu-
ry and convenience items.

“We’re not especially high on
the sporty R/T, but we can see its
appeal for those who crave
brawny style and perform-

ance,”editor wrote when evaluat-
ing the Pacifica.

“And, the generous selection of
appearance packages and trim
options makes Durango one of
the more customizable SUVs
around.”

As for the Fiat Spyder 124, Ap-
pel said that editors noted “it is
ironic that the first Mazda Miata
was designed to emulate the
small European sports cars that
preceded it, and now a heritage
model of that same European lin-
eage owes its architecture to the
Miata.

“The Fiat 124 Spider is a de-
light to drive and easy to afford.
Plus, its retro Italian styling cues
and slightly peppier engine help
it stand out from its Mazda coun-
terpart. Though it’s somewhat
less practical and less powerful
than many of the cars in its class,
the 124 Spider delivers a wonder-
fully connected and rewarding
driving experience. For many
consumers, the 124 will only
make sense as a third car, but at
these prices, keeping one for
sunny weekend drives is not an
overreaching indulgence.”

Appel said Consumer Guide Au-
tomotive editors analyze, com-
pare and evaluate numerous ve-
hicles by extensively testing all
major models available in the
United States.

According to Consumer Guide
Automotive, a vehicle does not
become a Best Buy based solely
on objective ratings.

Best Buys also distinguish
themselves as good values com-
pared to other vehicles in their
class.

For wishing to get more infor-
mation on the Consumer Guide
Automotive 2018 Best Buys and
the vehicles mentined in the arti-
cle, Appel said people can visit
the company’s Web site at con-
sumerguide.com.

New Pacifica Minivan Stands Out its Among Competition

2018 Chrysler Pacifica

Martinrea International Inc.
has officially opened its new,
state-of- the-art technical center
in Auburn Hills.

The new facility combines re-
search and development, engi-
neering and testing capabilities
under one roof in an open and
collaborative environment.

Among its many amenities, the
energy-efficient building includes
open stations for employee col-
laboration, a product showroom,
an exercise room, an outdoor pa-

tio and electric vehicle charging
stations, said Martinrea spokes-
woman Katya Pruett.

“Our new location befits our
reputation as a world-class sup-
plier and an employer of choice
and puts us at the epicenter of
the automotive corridor in
Southeast Michigan,” says Pat
D’Eramo, Chief Executive Officer.
“This move highlights our con-
tinued focus on producing inno-
vative processes and technolo-
gies for our customers.”

Martinrea Opens Auburn Hills HQ
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The Chrysler 300, with its ele-
gant design and world-class per-
formance, has been named a 2018
Edmunds Most Wanted Vehicle.

The 300 was the winner in the
Large Car segment in the annual
awards given by Edmunds, said
Edward Cardenas, multimedia
editor at FCA. The recognition
honors the most in-demand vehi-
cles in 17 segments, based on
sales, days-to-turn and shopper
interest data on Edmunds.

“Bold and aggressive, the
Chrysler 300 stands out in a
class of largely look-alike sedans,
and its originality makes it one of
the most popular large cars on
the market,” said Jessica Cald-
well, executive director of indus-
try analysis, Edmunds.

To determine the 2018 Ed-
munds Most Wanted Award win-
ner for each of the 17 segments,
Caldwell said that Edmunds ana-
lyzed data from the first nine
months of 2017 for all models on
sale during that period. Rankings
in each of the data sets analyzed
were weighted equally to deter-
mine the winners in each seg-
ment.

“The awards celebrate the one
vehicle in each segment that is
winning both the hearts and wal-
lets of car buyers,” Edmunds
wrote.

This award comes as Chrysler
repositions the 300 model lineup
for 2018 offering the Touring,
Touring L, 300S, Limited and 300C.
Other updates for 2018 include:

• New entry-level Touring
model offers cloth interior
and 17-inch aluminum
wheels;

• Limited model now offers
20-inch aluminum wheels;

• New Mocha leather interior
option available on Limited
and 300C models.

• 2018 300C model comes
standard with the 5.7-liter
HEMI V8, offering best-in-
class V-8 horsepower and
torque.

New available options include:
• Sport Appearance Package

and Chrome Appearance
Package on Touring.

• BeatsAudio and Alloy Pack-
age on the 300S.

• Harman Kardon premium
audio system, navigation,
power sunshade, dual-pane
sunroof on the Limited.

• Harman Kardon premium
audio system, navigation,
power sunshade, dual-pane
sunroof and Sun/Sound/Nav
bundle on the 300C.

• New Green Metallic Clear
Coat and Ocean Blue Metal-
lic Clear Coat exterior paint
options added to the lineup
(late availability).

Chrysler 300
Named

‘Most Wanted’

COLUMBIA TOWNSHIP, Mich.
(AP) – A new $90 million Con-
sumers Energy wind turbine
project is now operating in
Michigan.

The unit of Jackson-based
CMS Energy Corp. announced
Jan. 4 that Cross Winds Energy
Park II in Tuscola County’s Co-
lumbia Township, about 90 miles
(145 kilometers) northwest on
Detroit, has started producing
power.

Construction work by Con-
sumers Power crews on the 19
turbines started about six
months ago.

The company earlier pushed
up construction on Cross Winds
Energy Park III to 2019 instead of
2022, with plans for commercial
operation in 2020 in Columbia
and Akron townships.

Phase I of the Cross Winds En-
ergy Park began operations in
2014.

Consumers Power
Wind Project
In Operation
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retail deliveries, compared with
about two-thirds last year. Retail
crossover sales for the brand
were up 26 percent year over
year, with the Enclave up 14 per-
cent, the Encore up 8 percent
and Envision up 167 percent.

Cadillac’s retail crossover de-
liveries were up 9 percent, driven
by the new XT5.

GM sold more pickup trucks in
the United States than any other
automaker for the fourth year in
a row – a record 948,909 units –
thanks to its unique three-truck
strategy. Since 2014, Chevrolet
and GMC have been the only
brands to offer mid-size, light-
and heavy-duty pickups.

GM sold 239,719 full-size SUVs
and has led the segment since
the launch of the Chevrolet Sub-
urban in 1935. Combined, the
Chevrolet Tahoe and Suburban,
and the GMC Yukon and Yukon
XL, have earned more than 75
percent retail market share for
the fourth consecutive year.

At GMC, more than half of Sier-
ra HD customers and more than
70 percent of Yukon customers
purchase premium Denali mod-
els, Cain said.

The Cadillac Escalade has
earned at least 30 percent of the
retail market for large luxury SU-
Vs for four consecutive years,
with ATPs that are more than
$20,000 above its closest domes-
tic competitor.

Chevrolet delivered more than
43,669 electric vehicles in 2017,
including 23,297 Bolt EV
crossovers and 20,349 Volt
sedans. In December, Cain said,
the Bolt EV had its best month
since launch with sales of 3,227.

GM’s average transaction
prices (ATPs), which are net of
incentive spending estimates,
were more than $35,400 for the
year and they surpassed $38,000

in December. Both are records,
and significantly above the in-
dustry average of $31,600 for the
calendar year.

GM’s total sales in 2017 were
down 1 percent year over year,
bestng the industry, which is ex-
pected to be down 2 percent.
GM’s retail deliveries, which are
more than 80 percent of total
sales, were down 1 percent year
over year, in line with the indus-
try’s expected performance.

Chevrolet’s retail market share
increased 0.2 percentage points
to an estimated 11.5 percent and
ATPs for the month were the
best-ever at more than $34,000.
Buick total sales were up 5 per-
cent and retail deliveries were up
15 percent. GMC total sales were
up 1 percent for its best sales
month in more than 12 years.

Mustafa Mohatarem, GM’s
chief economist, forecasts 2018
total vehicle sales (including
medium and heavy trucks) to ex-
ceed 17 million units for the
fourth year in a row. Light vehi-
cle sales are forecasted to be in
the high 16 million-unit range.

“In 2017, we had solid GDP
growth and good news on em-
ployment, wages and consumer
sentiment, which helped deliver
very strong retail sales for the
auto industry,” Mohatarem said.
“This year, many consumers will
see their take-home pay rise be-
cause of tax reform. That will
keep the broad economy grow-
ing, and help keep sales at very
healthy levels even as the Fed in-
creases interest rates.”

GM is well positioned heading
into the new year because of its
low inventories and multi-year
strategy to redesign and expand
its truck and crossover portfolio,
Mohatarem said. On a retail ba-
sis, 78 percent of GM sales are
now trucks and crossovers, com-
pared with an industry average
of 65 percent.

“We are winning customers in
the fastest-growing parts of the
market, and our momentum con-
tinues to grow because we have
strengthened our brands, grown
our Commercial and Government
business, sharply reduced rental
sales and successfully transi-
tioned to a crossover- and truck-
focused business,” said Kurt Mc-
Neil, U.S. vice president of Sales
Operations. “We are starting 2018
with very lean inventories for
such a strong industry, and we
see more room to grow because
Chevrolet, Buick and GMC will
have a full year of sales of their
all-new crossovers, and we are
going to launch the industry’s
best full-size pickups.”

GM Bests Industry Sales Trends in 2017

year increase for its best Decem-
ber sales ever.

The Fiat 124 Spider recorded
its best December sales as well,
Bennett said, selling 2,606 com-
pared to 1,738 during the same
time in 2016.

Other FCA US vehicles posting
year-over-year sales increases in
the month of December were the
Chrysler 300 (5,726 versus
3,586), Jeep Cherokee 919,358
versus 16,380), Jeep Grand
Cherokee 23,622 versus 23,250),
Jeep Compass (8,743 versus
7,954) and Ram ProMaster City
(1,617 versus 1,347).

Chrysler brand sales were up
3 percent in December, com-
pared with the same month a
year ago (17,208 versus 16,776),
Bennett said. Both the Chrysler
Pacifica minivan and the
Chrysler 300 full-size sedan post-
ed sales increases in December.

Sales of the 300 were up 60
percent for its best December
sales since 2012 Jeep Compass,
Jeep Cherokee and Jeep Grand
Cherokee delivered year over
year increases for December.
Sales of the Cherokee were up 18
percent in December, compared
with the same month a year ago.
The 2018 Jeep Wrangler has
earned a Residual Value Award
from ALG, the industry bench-
mark for residual values and de-
preciation data, in the Off-road
Utility segment.

For the full year, Jeep Grand
Cherokee sales increased 13 per-
cent, compared with sales in
2016.

The Dodge Durango full-size
SUV posted its best full year of
sales since 2006. The Durango –
for the sixth-consecutive year –
earned the Best Buy award in

the Large SUV category from
Consumer Guide Automotive.

In addition, Strategic Vision
named the Dodge Charger to its
“Most Loved Vehicles in America”
list for the fourth-consecutive
year, Bennett said.

Ram Truck brand sales were up
year over year in 2017 versus
2016. In addition, sales of the Ram
pickup truck edged up year over
year in 2017 versus the previous
year.

For the 10th-consecutive year,
the Ram pickup captured the Best
Buy award for Large Pickup Truck
from Consumer Guide Automotive.

Alfa Romeo brand sales of 2,034
units were up significantly com-
pared with the same month a
year ago and recorded its
strongest monthly sales of 2017.

Furthermore, Motor Trend
named the Alfa Romeo Giulia as
its 2018 Car of the Year, best rep-
resenting exceptional value, supe-
riority in its class and impact on
the automotive scene.

Sales of the Fiat 124 Spider were
up 15 percent year over year for its
best December sales ever.

Overall, the Jeep brand sold a
total of 828,522 vehicles in 2017,
Bennett said. That’s compared to
926,376 in 2016.

The Chrysler brand sold
188,545 vehicles in 2017, com-
pared to 21,972 in 2016.

Dodge sales were 446,996 in
2017, versus 505,858 in 2016.

Ram brand sales were 556,790
in 2017, compared to sales of
545,851 in 2016.

Fiat brand sales were 26,492 in
2017, compared to sales of 32,742
in 2016.

2017, Bennett said, was the first
year that Alfa Romeo vehicles
were sold throughout the year.
Sales were 12,031. In 2016, the
brand only sold 516 vehicles.

FCA Sales for December,
2017 Show Slight DropCONTINUED FROM PAGE 1

CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1

BERLIN (AP) – Germany’s
highest court has rejected a bid
by Volkswagen on Dec. 29 for an
injunction blocking the deploy-
ment of a special auditor sought
by a shareholders’ rights group
in its diesel emissions scandal.

In November a court in Celle
backed an independent check on
events surrounding the scandal
that pushed down VW shares
when it erupted in 2015. The
DSW shareholders’ group had
previously failed to get VW’s reg-
ular general meeting to agree to
such a review on top of an inves-
tigation already commissioned
by the automaker.

VW sought from the Federal
Constitutional Court an injunc-
tion blocking the new probe
while the court considers its
complaint against the ruling de-
ploying the special auditor. But
the court said in a ruling re-
leased Dec. 29 that VW hadn’t
sufficiently proven the need.

German Court
Rules Against
VW Request
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Van Dyke Across From
GMTech Center

Payments on these 2018 Cadillac’s are for a standard model XT5 MSRP of $41,190, ATS Sedan AWD with an MSRP of $38,715
and a Luxury AWD CT6 AWD Courtesy Transportation Vehicle (CTA) with MSRP of $69,585, stk# 101952. Lease is through GM
Financial with top tier credit approval, 10,000 mile per year total. $0 cap cost reduction down, only typical startup costs of
taxes, license, registration, first months payment, acquisition and dealer fees due at signing. Must take delivery out of dealer
stock by 1/31/18. Lessee pays for excesswear,overmileage and disposition fee of $595 at end of lease.Residency restrictions
apply. May not be available with other offers. Must have Cadillac Lease Loyalty rebate (must currently lease a Buick, Cadillac,
Chevrolet or GMC throughAlly,GM Financial or US Bank).Not required to terminate current lease or trade vehicle. Loyalty offer
is transferable to individuals residing in the samehousehold.Price based onGMEmployee Pricing.Others slightly higher..©2017
General Motors. Cadillac® XT5® ATS® CT6®

LUXURY HAS A NEWHOME
PRESTIGE CADILLAC
VanDykeAcross
FromGMTech Center

$338 / 36 / ZERO

2018 XT5 STANDARD
COLLECTION

ULTRA-LOWMILEAGE LEASEFORWELLQUALIFIED
CURRENTGMOWNERS/LESSEES

PER MONTH MONTHS DOWN

Tax, title, and license extra. No security deposit required.Mileage
charge of $.25 per mile over 30,000 miles.

LOCATION
29900 VanDyke Ave.
Warren,MI
48093

PrestigeCadillac.com

SALES - 888.548.8939
Mon&Thur 8:30am-8pm
Tues,Wed & Fri 8:30am-6pm
Sat 10am-4pm

SERVICE
888.548.8939
Mon - Fri 7:30am-6pm
Sat 8am-3pm

©2017 General Motors.All Rights Reserved Cadillac®

$312 / 27 / ZERO

2018 ATS AWD
STANDARD COLLECTION

ULTRA-LOWMILEAGE LEASEFORWELL-QUALIFIED LESSEES
WITHACURRENTELIGIBLECADILLAC LEASE

PER MONTH MONTHS DOWN

Tax, title, and license extra. No security deposit required.Mileage
charge of $.25 per mile over 30,000 miles.

$538 / 36 / ZERO

2018 CT6 AWD • 3.6L • STK# 101952
LUXURY COLLECTION

ULTRA-LOWMILEAGE LEASEFORWELLQUALIFIED
CURRENTGMOWNERS/LESSEES

PER MONTH MONTHS DOWN

Tax, title, and license extra. No security deposit required.Mileage
charge of $.25 per mile over 30,000 miles.

The MotorCities National Her-
itage Area, a non-profit organiza-
tion dedicated to the historic
preservation of the automotive
industry, along with partners the
Detroit Metro Convention and
Visitors Bureau and Tourism
Windsor, has won a prestigious
Partnership Award from the Di-
rector of the National Park Serv-
ice (NPS) for the “Find Your Road
Trip” tourism guide.

“Find Your Road Trip” cele-
brated the 2016 NPS Centennial
and was designed to bring
greater awareness to more peo-
ple about the unique story of
how the area “Put the World on
Wheels” said Bob Sadler, commu-
nications manager for MotorCi-
ties National Heritage Area.

MotorCities collaborated with
their tourism partners and six
National Park sites in Michigan
during the Centennial celebra-
tion.

The tourism guide created a
contest too, Sadler said. By visit-
ing a combination of six heritage
sites and one NPS site, passport
stamp collectors received a cer-
tificate from Governor Snyder
stating “I Found My Michigan Na-
tional Parks.”

“As an affiliate of the National
Park Service, we wanted to in-
crease awareness about the
unique and multi-faceted story of
this region’s automotive her-
itage,” said Shawn Pomaville-
Size, executive director of Mo-
torCities National Heritage Area
Partnership.

“We could not have distributed
40,000 copies nor had so many
winners of the passport contest
without the help of our two part-
ners, the Detroit Metro Conven-
tion and Visitors Bureau and
Tourism Windsor Essex Pelee Is-
land.”

There were only six NPS Direc-
tor’s Partnership awards distrib-
uted nationwide, so this is quite
an honor for the region, Sadler
said.

“Each year, these awards cele-
brate great partnerships and
great accomplishments,” said
Acting Director of the National
Park Service Michael T.
Reynolds.

“This year's recipients demon-
strate the breadth and depth of
what can be achieved through
partnerships with the National
Park Service. They exemplify the
important work partners carry
out every day in national parks
and communities across the
country.”

Headquartered in Detroit,
Sadler said the MotorCities Na-
tional Heritage Area Partnership
is a nonprofit corporation affiliat-
ed with the National Park Service
that serves 16 counties repre-
senting a population of over 6.5
million.

Its mission is to preserve, in-
terpret and promote the region’s
rich automotive and labor her-
itage for future generations, Salder
said.

Regional programs such as
those created and shown by Mo-
torCities National Heritage Part-
nership work to inspire residents
of Michigan as well visitors to the
state with an appreciation for how
the automobile changed Michi-
gan, the nation, and the world,
Sadler said.

For those wishing to learn more
about MotorCities National Her-
itage Area Partnership, they can
find information on the web at
www.motorcities.org; also visit
their Facebook page at www.face-
book.com/motorcities and follow
them on Twitter/Instagram: @Mo-
torCities, Sadler said.

Local Automotive Heritage
Group Gets National Honor
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#42333 #21552#44296

475 SUMMIT DRIVE • 248-292-2502 • 5825 HIGHLAND RD. (M59) • WATERFORD

CALL
BRUCE LITVIN
– 24/7 & 365 –

OVER 40 YEARS
OF QUALITY SERVICE

CELL # 1-586-405-5175
blitvin@lunghamer.com

1-888-665-5438

Please call with the vehicle you desire
and you will be delighted with the payment.

HHAAPPPPYY
NNEEWW YYEEAARR
AANNDD TTHHIISS MMEEAANNSS SSOOMMEE

GGRREEAATT
22001188
DDEEAALLSS

AANNDD

GGMM MMAASSTTEERR
CCAARRDD $$$$$$
IISS BBAACCKK,,
PPLLEEAASSEE CCAALLLL FFOORR DDEETTAAIILLSS

VYLETEL

*Lease figured with $1500 Dealer IVC. Certifi cates Program subject to change while IVC Supplies Last. *Lease example is Stock Specific. *GM Employee Pricing Plus Tax, Title, Lic. and Doc. No Security Deposit Required. *All lease/purchase examples are figured with GM employee pricing. Lease
conquest rebate qualifies to customers who have a non GM lease in household set to expire within 365 days of new lease/purchase delivery date. *Buick/GMC lease loyalty rebate applies to customers who have a current Buick/GMC lease in household. IVC certifi cates may apply to lease/
purchase examples and are good while dealer supply lasts. Prices subject to change during the month of January 2018. *GM Employee Pricing Plus Tax, Title, Lic. and Doc. No Security Deposit Required. *For GM Employee Purchase or Lease Conquest Rebate Customer Must Have Non GM Lease
In Household To Expire Within 365 Days Of Delivery Of New Purchase or Lease. Programs subject to change. **Additional 2 payments of a max amount of $400.00 total. Photos may not represent actual vehicle. Price is subject to change without notice. See dealer for details. Expires 1/31/18.

VISIT OURWEBSITE TO SEARCH FORMORE VEHICLE SELECTIONS ATWWW.VYLETEL.NET

40755 Van Dyke • Sterling Heights •586.977.2800
WWW.VYLETEL.NET SALES: Sun CLOSED; M, TH 8:30am-9pm; T, W, F 8:30am-6pm; SAT 10am-3pm

SERVICE: Sun CLOSED; M, TH 7am-8pm; T, W, F 7am-6pm; Sat 8am-1pm

$386*

2018 BUICK
ENCORE
PREFERRED

STK# 6168-18 • DEAL# 72569
*GMS PRICING.

MUST HAVE BUICK GMC LEASE LOYALTY.
$999 DOWN PLUS 1ST PAYMENT, TAX,

TITLE, PLATE & DOC FEE.
NO SECURITY DEPOSIT REQUIRED!

39 MONTH/
10K PER YEAR

LEASE
FOR ONLY

$189*
$999 DOWN

2018 BUICK
ENVISION

ESSENCE

STK#6402-18 • DEAL#72568
*GMS PRICING.

MUST HAVE GM LEASE LOYALTY,
$1999 DOWN, PLUS 1ST MONTHS PAYMENT,

TAX, TITLE, PLATE AND DOC FEE.
NO SECURITY DEPOSIT REQUIRED!

36 MONTH/
10K PER YEAR

LEASE
FOR ONLY

$289*

ALL NEW 2018 GMC

TERRAIN
SLE

STK#7721-18 • DEAL#72570
*GMS PRICING.

MUST HAVE BUICK GMC LEASE LOYALTY. $999 DOWN
PLUS 1ST PAYMENT, TAX,TITLE, PLATE & DOC FEE.

NO SECURITY DEPOSIT REQUIRED!

$226*
$999 DOWN

36
MONTH
LEASE

FOR ONLY

10K PER YEAR

2018 GMC

ACADIA
SLE-1

STK#3939-18 • DEAL#72572
*GMS PRICING. MUST HAVE BUICK GMC LEASE
LOYALTY. $999 DOWN PLUS 1ST PAYMENT, TAX,

TITLE, PLATE & DOC FEE.
NO SECURITY DEPOSIT REQUIRED!

$248*
$1,999 DOWN

36
MONTH
LEASE

FOR ONLY

10K PER YEAR

2018 BUICK
ENCLAVE

ESSENCE

STK#6361-18 • DEAL#72567
*GMS PRICING.

MUST HAVE BUICK GMC LEASE LOYALTY.
$1999 DOWN PLUS, TAX, TITLE,

PLATE & DOC FEE.
NO SECURITY DEPOSIT REQUIRED!

36 MONTH/
10K PER YEAR

LEASE
FOR ONLY

$1,999 DOWN

$1,999 DOWN

2018 GMC

SIERRA
SLE 4X4 • DOUBLE CAB

STK#7292-18 • DEAL#72573
*GMS PRICING. MUST HAVE BUICK GMC LEASE
LOYALTY. $999 DOWN PLUS 1ST PAYMENT, TAX,

TITLE, PLATE & DOC FEE.
NO SECURITY DEPOSIT REQUIRED!

$228*
$999 DOWN

GREAT DEAL!

36
MONTH
LEASE

FOR ONLY

10K PER YEAR

STK#5223-17 • DEAL#72566
*GMS PRICING.

MUST HAVE A BUICK GMC LEASE IN HOUSEHOLD.
PLUS TAX, TITLE, PLATE, & DOC FEE.

2017 BUICK LACROSSE
ESSENCE

$26,599*
WAS
$40,585

NOW

2017 BUICK
REGAL

SPORT TOURING

STK#5786-17 • DEAL#72565
*MUST HAVE GMS PRICING

AND BUICK GMC LEASE LOYALTY.
PLUS 1ST PAYMENT, TAX,
TITLE, PLATE & DOC FEE.

NO SECURITY DEPOSIT REQUIRED!

27 MONTH/
10K PER YEAR

LEASE
FOR ONLY

$288*
$0 DOWN

WOW!

2018 GMC

YUKON
SLE 4WD

STK#7680-17 • DEAL#71997
*GMS PRICING. MUST HAVE GM LEASE LOYALTY PLUS
TAX, TITLE, PLATE AND DOC FEE. 1ST PAYMENT UP
FRONT. 4 IVC’S USED WHILE SUPPLIES LAST.
NO SECURITY DEPOSIT REQUIRED!

$399*
$1,999 DOWN

•20” RIMS
• LOADED WITH THE SLE VALUE PKG.

36
MONTH
LEASE

FOR ONLY

10K PER YEAR

2018 GMC

CANYON
SLT • CREW CAB

STK#7849-18 • DEAL#72579
*GMS PRICING.

MUST HAVE TRADE IN & BUICK GMC LEASE LOYALTY.
PLUS TAX, TITLE, PLATE & DOC FEE.

$34,456*
WAS
$41,375

• LEATHER • NAV • LANE DEPARTURE
• BOSE • SPRAY ON BED LINER

AUTO SHOW SALES EVENT

Free shuttle service to home, office or shopping.

buff whelan chevrolet
WHERE THE DEALS MAKE THE DIFFERENCE, EVERY DAY SINCE 1970!

Van Dyke • South of 18 Mile • Sterling Heights
Jeff Caul

586-274-0396
PEP QUOTES BY PHONE OR EMAIL: JEFF CAUL AT JCAUL@BUFFWHELAN.COM

*See dealer for details. All Rebates/Incentives have been deducted from sale price/payment and are subject to change by
manufacturer without notice. GM Employee discount required unless otherwise noted. All leases assume that you qualify for GM
Lease Loyalty. To qualify for GM Lease Loyalty you must have a GM Lease in the household. All lease payments are based on 10,000 miles per year. 1st payment,
tax, title and plate fee due at signing on all leases unless otherwise noted. All deals expire 01/31/2018.
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METRO PKWY.

18 MILE RD.

SINCE
1989

CONVENIENT HOURS: MON. & THURS. 8:30AM-9PM / TUES., WED. & FRI. 8:30AM-6:30PM /

BRING THE NEW YEAR IN WITH A NEW
buff whelan chevrolet
OVER 1,000

New Chevrolets
in Stock!

CALL
JEFF CAUL

586-274-0396

2018 CHEVY SILVERADO 1500
4X4 DBL CAB ALL STAR PKG

$246+TAXWITH$0DOWN

WITH LEASE LOYALTY • NO SECURITY DEPOSIT REQUIRED
Equiped with Power Locks, Power Windows, Power Mirrors, Keyless Entry, Remote Start,
My Link Radio, Back-Up Camera, Auto A/C, Bluetooth & More…

36 MTH LEASE
10,000 MILES

2018 MALIBU 1LT

$228+TAXWITH$0DOWN

WITH LEASE LOYALTY • NO SECURITY DEPOSIT REQUIRED
Equiped with Power Locks, Power Windows, Power Mirrors, Keyless Entry, Back-Up Camera,
Touch Screen Radio, Bluetooth, OnStar & More…

36 MTH LEASE
10,000 MILES

2018 CHEVY EQUINOX 1LT

$235+TAXWITH$0DOWN

WITH CHEVROLET LOYALTY • NO SECURITY DEPOSIT REQUIRED
Equiped with 1.5L Turbo Engine, 7” touch screen radio, Onstar, Bluetooth, Keyless Entry
Back Up Camera, Alum. Wheels, Deep Tinted Glass & More…

36 MTH LEASE
10,000 MILES

DETROIT (AP) – Investors in
the Uber ride-hailing service did-
n’t get all they wanted in selling
at least part of their holdings to a
group led by Japanese technolo-
gy conglomerate SoftBank.

But don’t show them too much
sympathy. Even though they sold
at roughly a 30 percent discount
from what the shares were worth
in 2016, those who invested early
made nearly 100 times their ini-
tial stake, going from around 35
cents per share to just under $33,
according to one investor who
requested anonymity because
the sales are private.

Uber was valued around $68.5
billion during a 2016 capital in-
vestment, but it dropped to
somewhere above $48 billion in
the SoftBank deal announced last
week. The reasons for the dis-
count are many, among them the
seemingly endless string of scan-
dals, lawsuits and fights that
plagued Uber through almost all
of 2017. Also, competition has
gotten tougher from Lyft and
Grab in the U.S. as well as Ola in
India and several emerging serv-
ices elsewhere.

During the past year, Uber has
been rocked by revelations of
rampant sexual harassment in
the company, technological trick-
ery designed to hinder regula-
tors, and a yearlong cover-up of
a hacking attack that stole per-
sonal information of 57 million
passengers and 600,000 drivers.

Rohit Kulkarni, managing di-
rector of SharesPost, a company
that analyzes private company
investments, says three big
events that happened around the
time that SoftBank began court-
ing investors combined to dis-
count the shares. Just before
SoftBank’s intent to shop for
shares was announced, regula-

tors in London refused to renew
the cab-hailing app’s license to
operate.

Then the data hack and cover-
up were revealed, and the com-
pany told investors its third-
quarter net loss had widened to
$1.46 billion on huge legal costs.

The events helped SoftBank’s
group get a better deal, Kulkarni
says. Many big Uber investors in-
clude venture capital firms that
got in early. They hedged their
bets, selling part of their stake to
bring big profits to their share-
holders while holding the rest for
big gains if the company gets
past the scandals, the investor
said.

“This is still a good deal,’’ said
Gartner analyst Michael Ramsey.
“The earlier the investment, the
bigger the payout.’’

All-in, the SoftBank group will
pump about $9 billion into Uber,
including $1.25 billion in new
shares that were purchased at
the 2016 valuation. SoftBank ac-
quired about 15 percent of Uber,
while other investors in its group
got around 3 percent.

The deal, due to close this
month, also brings management
stability to Uber, reducing the in-
fluence of ousted CEO Travis
Kalanick. SoftBank, which has
global investments in other ride-
hailing companies, gets two
seats on the board and will help
Uber navigate the tough global
competition, says Kulkarni.

Uber’s new CEO Dara Khos-
rowshahi and COO Barney Har-
ford are experienced executives
who successfully increased
share value at travel booking
companies, says Kulkarni, who
expects Uber to be worth a total
of $100 billion by the time it of-
fers shares to the public some-
time in 2019.

Uber’s Investors See Stock
Prices Decline in Year 2017
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INSURANCE
MADE EASY!

Kristin Newsome,
Agent.

INSURANCE
MADE EASY!

INSURANCE SHOPPERS AGENCY
Phone: 810.388.9200 | Fax: 810.400.6100

Email: knewsome@marysvilleisa.com

Now offering: AAA Insurance

… Just For Letting Us Quote
Your Home & Auto Insurance

We have Discounts for:
Engineering, Accounting,
Medical/Dental Employees

Receive a
FREE
$10 Gift Card

& MEMBERSHIPS

record year with expanding retail
sales. In December, Edge posted
the largest gain in the coastal
western region of the country
last month, with sales up 8 per-
cent. Explorer sales gained 33.3
percent overall in December,
LaNeve said.

Following its initial sales in No-
vember, 2018 Expedition is off to
a strong start, with new models
to retail customers turning in
just seven days, with our cus-
tomers demanding a Platinum se-
ries mix of almost 50 percent.
Overall Expedition sales totaled
5,458 for the month, as 2018
stock levels are built.

“Lincoln Navigator sales were
up 30.1 percent last month,”LaN-
eve said. “The start is very
strong with new models to retail
customers turning in just six

days. Customers are seeking out
our two highest trim levels, with
over 75 percent or our sales mix
comprised of Reserve and Black
Label.”

Lincoln outpaced the luxury
retail segment last year, finishing
2017 up 0.2 percent; Lincoln SU-
Vs posted their best year since
2003, with retail sales up 1.1 per-
cent, LaNeve said.

Full-year Ford sales totaled
2,586,715 vehicles; at retail,
trucks were up 4.3 percent, SUVs
gained 4.3 percent and cars were
down 15.2 percent, LaNeve said.
Ford brand sales totaled
2,475,556 vehicles for full-year
2017, marking the eighth consec-
utive year for Ford as America’s
best-selling vehicle brand. In De-
cember, Ford sold a total of
89,385 F-Series trucks in Decem-
ber of 2017. That’s compared to
87,512 trucks sold at the same

time in 2016. Mustang sales were
up 9.2 percent last month, with
7,714 cars sold, LaNeve said. For
the year Ford sold 81,866 Mus-
tangs in 2017. That’s 22.7 percent
drop compared to the 105,932
sold in 2016.

The Fiesta sold 3,657 in Decem-
ber of 2017 compared to 3,772,
LaNeve said. That’s a drop of 3
percent December to December.
Overall, Ford sold 46,249 for the
year, a drop of 5.2 percent.

The Ford Focus sold 11,237 in
December of 2017 and a total of
158,385 for the year. That’s a
drop of 6.2 percent, LaNeve said.

The Fusion sold 17,444 in De-
cember of 2017, a drop of 8.8 per-
cent compared to the same time
in 2016.

Overall, Ford sold 209,623 in
2017. That is a 21.1 percent drop
compared to the 265,840 sold in
2016.

Ford Enjoys Good 2017 Thanks to F-150

F-150. In a category not typically
known for tech features, the so-
phisticated 2018 Ford F-150 flips
the script with advanced driver
assistance features, adaptive
powertrain calibration and the
Sync 3 infotainment system.

• Most Innovative Car: Honda
Clarity. With options including
pure electric, plug-in hybrid and
hydrogen fuel cell models, the
2018 Honda Clarity provides un-
matched flexibility when it
comes to alternative fuel choic-
es, and proves that innovative
design can push the industry fur-
ther toward a future using renew-
able energy.

• Most Innovative SUV: Honda
CR-V. The 2018 Honda CR-V of-
fers advanced driver assistance
technologies and active safety
features at an affordable price
point, a rarity among SUVs. Cou-
pled with other outstanding fea-
tures such as a deftly balanced
ride and handling, class-leading
fuel economy, and a large and
clever storage space, the CR-V is
a winner.

• Most Innovative Driver As-
sist Feature: Porsche InnoDrive.
Porsche’s InnoDrive maximizes
performance and efficiency with
a predictive powertrain control
that uses GPS, radar sensors,
and a camera to see the road
ahead and configure the power-
train to optimal settings.

• Most Innovative Infotain-
ment System: Audi MMI. The full-
featured but easy-to-use Audi
MMI system stands out thanks to
a clean, contemporary high-tech
experience that keeps distrac-
tion to a minimum and seamless-
ly pairs with Audi’s Virtual Cock-
pit for a cabin with unrivaled in-
tegration.

• Most Innovative Automaker:
Audi. As we progress toward ful-
ly autonomous vehicles, Audi
has pulled ahead of the pack
with its strong history of innova-
tion. And with the 2018 A8’s Lev-
el 3 automated system about to
hit the road, it’s clear that Audi
looks to maintain this lead for a
while.

The Tech Driven Awards honor
new vehicles and systems that
are available this year and that
were developed and brought to
market by automakers represent-
ed at CES 2018, Polk said. A panel
of Edmunds editors selected the
winners based on a combination
of factors including actual test-
ing experience; first-to-market or
first-to-announce technologies;
feasibility and potential impact
on the industry; usability and
practicality of the technology;
and overall ingenuity.

Edmunds Honoring Ford
Innovation at CES Show

CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1

GREER, S.C. (AP) _ BMW of
North America plans to open its
second training center in the
South by the end of this year.

The Spartanburg Herald-Jour-
nal reports that the company's
head of U.S. corporate communi-
cations, Kenn Sparks, said
Wednesday that the $12 million
BMW Southern Regional Train-
ing Center will be located in
Spartanburg County. According
to plans filed with the county's
planning department, it will be
built near the company's manu-
facturing plant.

Sparks says the new center is
part of BMW Group University,
and will train technicians, serv-
ice personnel and client advis-
ers.

New Auto Training
Center Opens

It looks like good old-fashioned
Yankee ingenuity is popular in
Europe. At least according to Oc-
tober sales figures released by
Ford in mid-December.

“Our total vehicles sales in Eu-
rope grew by 5.4 percent in Octo-
ber, with Fiesta sales contribut-
ing to the sales growth with
20,500 cars sold. Ford SUV sales
continue to go from strength to
strength, with sales up nearly 29
percent for the Edge, Kuga and
EcoSport. We’re anticipating a
positive momentum in sales
across our entire vehicle range
as we enter the last two months
of the year.” said Roelant de
Waard, v.p., Marketing, Sales and
Service, Ford of Europe.

The Ford Ranger pickup had
its best October and year to date
sales since launch. Close to
36,000 Rangers have been sold in
Europe so far this year. Outside

North America, Ranger is the
world’s No.2 top selling pickup,
and Europe’s best selling pickup
year to date September (latest
figures0, de Waard said.

Ford sold 4800 new Fiestas in
Germany during October, making
it the country’s best selling small
car for the month. The existing
Fiesta range will be strengthened
further in 2018 with the arrival of
the Fiesta Active crossover.

With sales of 126,900 – up 22
percent – in the first ten months
of 2017, Kuga is enjoying its best
ever sales year. In October,
12,400 Kugas were sold in the tra-
ditional Euro 20 markets
– up 44 percent compared with
the same month last year, de
Waard said. And total Transit
family sales, from the 2-ton Tran-
sit, to the small Transit Courier,
were 240,316, up 6.7 percent, for
the first ten months of the year.

In October, Transit family sales
were up 9.5 percent to 21,682.

DeWaard said October sales
highlights include:

• Ford sold 104,800 vehicles in
October in its traditional Euro 20
markets, up 5.4 percent com-
pared with October 2016. Year to
date sales of 1,153,000 were 0.8
percent up on last year.

• New Fiesta production ramp
-up continues to grow with
18,800 new Fiestas sold in Ford’s
traditional Euro 20 markets in
October.

• Market share growth in Ger-
many, Ford sold 25,100 cars in
Germany in October, up 2,600
compared with the same month
in 2016, and resulting in a market
share of 8.3 percent.

• Sports Utility Vehicle (SUV)
sales up 28.5 percent to 18,600 in
October driven by strong de-
mand for EcoSport and Kuga.

Ford Sales Showing Strength in Europe

CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1
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SERVICE HOURS: Monday & Thursday 6:30am-9:00pm; Tuesday, Wednesday & Friday 6:30am-6:00pm • Shuttle at 6:30am - Pick-up Both Ways • All Day starting at 6:30am.

$2395
Fluid Level,

Brake & Alignment Check Included.

We use Genuine GM Oil & Filter
No additional or hidden charges. Out the door pricing.

Open Mondays & Thursdays until 8:30pm
Excludes synthetic, Diesel & Med. Duty Trucks.

Most GM cars & trucks. One coupon per customer.
Must present coupon with order. Plus tax. Expires 1-31-18.

Quick Oil Change EXPRESS LANE
LUBE OIL FILTER

Up to 5 qts.

BODY SHOP
586-754-7000

ext 1231

INSURANCE
WRECK AMENDED
TRANSPORTATION

AVAILABLE
During Scheduled Repairs

FREE OIL CHANGE With Each Major Repair
WE REPAIR ALL MAKE & MODELS

GM SERVICE CENTER
MICHIGAN’S LARGEST •SERVICE DEPT. •PARTS •BODY SHOP

866-452-1547
26125 Van Dyke @ 101/2 Mile • Center Line, MI 48015

EDRINKE • FAST • FRIENDLY • DISCOUNTS

VISIT OUR

QUICK LANE

Jim
Pfeifle

jpfeifle@edrinke.com

See us for your GM Employee purchases. Now looking for experienced salespeople to join our team!

1-877-451-7707
26125 VAN DYKE AT 10 1/2 MILE ROAD

NODOC FEES
Find Us on
FACEBOOK

Nicole
Dodge

nhuminski@edrinke.com

GM CARD TOP OFF UP TO $3,000 • NO APPOINTMENTS NECESSARY FOR OIL CHANGES

SHOWROOM HOURS: MON. & THURS. 8:30AM-9PM / TUES., WED. & FRI. 8:30AM-6PM /

Dennis
Thacker

dthacker@edrinke.com

Paul
Makowski

pmakowski@edrinke.com

All prices and payments include GM rebates. Pictures may not represent actual vehicle. Pricing subject to change per GM incentives. Prices and payments are inclusive of active GM employee discount (unless otherwise stated). 2018 Models are price and discounted at supplier. All leases are 10,000 miles per year with approved S Tier
credit. All Vehicles shown are $999 down. Disposition Fee may be required at vehicle turn in. Must have lease loyalty and/or closing competitive lease depending on vehicle model. Prices and payments are plus tax, title, plate fee w/ acquisition fee up front, refundable security deposit required on certain vehicles – to be determined
by lender. Purchase pricing is gm employee discount plus title, taxes and fees. Pricing is subject to flex cash certificates- while supplies last. **$3,500 trade in is valid on 2003 or newer vehicles w/ under 115k miles in drivable condition, no branded titles, reconditioning determined by appraiser. Certain restrictions may apply, see
dealer for complete details. ** Exp date: 1/31/2018.

We’ll give you a $3,500 minimum for your 2003 or newer trade in. See us for your GM Employee purchases.

1-866-452-1300
26125 VAN DYKE AT 10 1/2 MILE ROAD

Now looking for experienced salespeople to join our team!

SHOWROOM HOURS:
MON. & THURS. 8:30AM-9PM

TUES., WED. & FRI. 8:30AM-6PM

VISIT OURWEBSITE: edrinke.com

ED RINKE

2017 BUICK LACROSSE

LEASE FOR

$209*MONTH

PURCHASE FOR

$26,789*
STOCK #B470714

PER 24MONTH
$999DOWNN

ESSENCE
2017 BUICK ENCORE

LEASE FOR

$79*MONTH

PURCHASE FOR

$21,989*
STOCK #B578823

PER 24MONTHS
$999DOWN

AWD PREFERRED
2017 BUICK ENVISION

LEASE FOR

$189*MONTH

PURCHASE FOR

$27,459*
STOCK #B571416

PER 36MONTHS
$999DOWN

AWD PREFERRED
2018 BUICK ENCLAVE

LEASE FOR

$369*MONTH

PURCHASE FOR

$39,349*
STOCK #B581041

NO GM
EMPLOYEE
DISCOUNT
REQUIRED

PER 36MONTHS
$999DOWN

ESSENCE
2017 BUICK REGAL

LEASE FOR

$179*MONTH

PURCHASE FOR

$26,695*
STOCK #B471195

PER 36MONTHS
$999DOWN

PREMIUM II

ED RINKE

All prices and payments include GM rebates. Pictures may not represent actual vehicle. Pricing subject to change per GM incentives. Prices and payments are inclusive of active GM employee discount (unless otherwise stated). 2018 Models are price and discounted
at supplier. All leases are 10,000 miles per year with approved S Tier credit. All Vehicles shown are $999 down. Disposition Fee may be required at vehicle turn in. Must have lease loyalty and/or closing competitive lease depending on vehicle model. Prices and
payments are plus tax, title, plate fee w/ acquisition fee up front, refundable security deposit required on certain vehicles – to be determined by lender. Purchase pricing is gm employee discount plus title, taxes and fees. Pricing is subject to flex cash certificates-
while supplies last. **$3,500 trade in is valid on 2003 or newer vehicles w/ under 115k miles in drivable condition, no branded titles, reconditioning determined by appraiser. Certain restrictions may apply, see dealer for complete details. ** Exp date: 1/31/2018.

VISIT OURWEBSITE:
edrinke.com

2018 CHEVY MALIBU LT
NO GM EMPLOYEE DISCOUNT REQUIRED

LEASE FOR

$179*PER MONTHOR PURCHASE FOR
$20,359*

36MONTHS
$999DOWN STOCK #VKMGTG

2018 CHEVY CRUZE LT
NO GM EMPLOYEE DISCOUNT REQUIRED HATCHBACKLEASE FOR

$149*PER MONTH OR PURCHASE FOR
$17,289*

24MONTHS
$999DOWN STOCK #480042

2018 CHEVY TRAX LS
NO GM EMPLOYEE DISCOUNT REQUIRED

LEASE FOR

$149*PER MONTHOR PURCHASE FOR
$16,239*

24MONTHS
$999DOWN STOCK #580975

2018 CHEVY EQUINOX LT
NO GM EMPLOYEE DISCOUNT REQUIRED

LEASE FOR

$169*PER MONTHOR PURCHASE FOR
$22,259*

24MONTHS
$999DOWN STOCK #580099

2018 CHEVY TRAVERSE LS
NO GM EMPLOYEE DISCOUNT REQUIRED

LEASE FOR

$249*PER MONTHOR PURCHASE FOR
$27,389*

24MONTHS
$999DOWN STOCK #580417

WE’LL GIVE YOU A $3,500 MINIMUM FOR YOUR 2003 OR NEWER TRADE IN

2018 GMC SIERRA 1500 DENALI CREWCAB

LEASE FOR

$339*MONTH

PURCHASE FOR
$47,989*
STOCK #G578855

NO GM
EMPLOYEE
DISCOUNT
REQUIRED

PER 36MONTHS
$999DOWN

2018 GMC ACADIA SLE

LEASE FOR

$199*MONTH

PURCHASE FOR
$28,479*
STOCK #G581158

NO GM
EMPLOYEE
DISCOUNT
REQUIRED

PER 36MONTHS
$999DOWN

2018 GMCTERRAIN SLE

LEASE FOR

$139*MONTH

PURCHASE FOR
$23,199*
STOCK #G580877

NO GM
EMPLOYEE
DISCOUNT
REQUIRED

PER 24MONTHS
$999DOWN

100
YEARS
IN BUSINESS

100
YEARS
IN BUSINESS

2018 GMC SIERRA DBL CAB SLE

LEASE FOR

$199*MONTH

PURCHASE FOR
$38,749*
STOCK #G580767

NO GM
EMPLOYEE
DISCOUNT
REQUIRED

PER 24MONTHS
$999DOWN

2018 CHEVY SILVERADO
NOGM EMPLOYEE DISCOUNT REQUIRED 1500 LT DBL CABLEASE FOR

$179*PER MONTHOR PURCHASE FOR
$31,929*

24MONTHS
$999DOWN STOCK #580716

2016 BUICK DEALER OF THE YEAR • 2016 BUICK DEALER OF THE YEAR • 2016 BUICK DEALER OF THE YEAR

2016 GMC DEALER OF THE YEAR • 2016 GMC DEALER OF THE YEAR • 2016 GMC DEALER OF THE YEAR

2016 CHEVROLET DEALER OF THE YEAR • 2016 CHEVROLET DEALER OF THE YEAR

2017 CHEVY BOLT LT
LEASE FOR

$295*PER MONTHOR PURCHASE FOR
$30,249*

36MONTHS
$999DOWN STOCK #472006

2018 VOLT LT HATCHBACK
NO GM EMPLOYEE DISCOUNT REQUIRED

LEASE FOR

$339*PER MONTHOR PURCHASE FOR
$29,995*

36MONTHS
$999DOWN STOCK #VPGBH9

2018 GMCYUKON SLE

LEASE FOR

$399*MONTH

PURCHASE FOR
$47,979*
STOCK #G580761

NO GM
EMPLOYEE
DISCOUNT
REQUIRED

PER 36MONTHS
$999DOWN
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