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Team Rush from Clarkston High School, their mentors and the Championship Chairman’s Award

The Chrysler Foundation on
Dec. 15 awarded more than
$230,000 in grants to support
students participating in FIRST
Robotics Competition (FRC)
(grades 9-12) and FIRST Tech
Challenge (FTC) (grades 7-12)
programs in Arizona, Illinois, In-
diana and Michigan.

In total, The Chrysler Founda-
tion will distribute 47 grants to
help young people discover and
develop a passion for science,

technology, engineering and
math, said Chrysler spokesper-
son Kevin Frazier.

“Chrysler Group’s ability to
compete and succeed in the
future depends in part upon our
ability to maintain the pipeline of
students that pursue STEM (sci-
ence, technology, engineering
and math) careers,” said John
Nigro, head of Chrysler’s NAFTA
Product Development.

“The real-world experience

that students gain through their
participation in FIRST is invalu-
able in preparing them for the
future.”

The Chrysler Foundation
grants – ranging from $750 to
$5,000 per team – will enable an
estimated 1,100 middle and high
school students to participate in
regional and district competi-
tions, Frazier said.

Subsequently, The Chrysler
Foundation will award a total of

$21,000 in grants to teams that
advance to the 2015 FIRST Cham-
pionship April 22-25 in St. Louis.

“The Chrysler Foundation is
proud to play a role in helping
students discover the rewards
and excitement of education and
careers in science, technology,
engineering and math,” said Jody
Trapasso, Chrysler’s senior vice
president of External Affairs and

Chrysler Foundation Supports School Robotics Teams

by Jim Stickford

For anyone who wanted to see
high-ranking GM executives get-
ting their hands dirty, the sev-
enth annual “Good Neighbor Hol-
iday Dinner” was the perfect
place to be.

The dinner, held by Forgotten
Harvest at the Renaissance Cen-
ter Marriott Dec. 15, is set up
each year – and sponsored by
GM and Marriott – to feed the
needy.

This year, about 1,000 people,
including 600 children, had the
opportunity to enjoy a holiday
meal served up by volunteers
from the ranks of GM executives,
including CEO Mary Barra.

The kids also had the chance
to meet Santa and receive Christ-
mas gifts.

Vivian Pickard, president of
the GM Foundation, said the
foundation “got the bright idea”
of sponsoring the event from the
people at Marriott.

“We provide the funding and
volunteers,” Pickard said. “This
event is about giving back to the
community. Everyone from GM
who has given his or her time,
from Mary Barra on down, has
done so as a volunteer.”

GM Execs Help In
Serving Holiday
Dinner to Needy
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Johnson Controls is reducing
the use of metals used in vehicle
seat structures by replacing
them with multi-material sys-
tems in its CAMISMA research
project.

CAMISMA, the Johnson Con-
trols engineers say, stands for
“carbon-amide-metal-based inte-
rior structure using a multi-mate-
rial system approach.”

For this cutting-edge work,
Johnson Controls, a global multi-
industrial company, received this
year’s CLEPA (European Asso-
ciation of Automotive Suppliers)
Innovation Award in the “Green”
category, said Johnson Con-
trols spokesperson Mary Kay
Dodero.

The CLEPA judges said the
project represents an “outstand-
ing, future-oriented solution for
sustainable carbon dioxide re-
duction.”

These seats are more than 40
percent lighter than convention-

ally manufactured seat struc-
tures and equally as safe, Dodero
said.

“Although carbon-fiber prod-
ucts generally offer outstanding
characteristics, such as great
strength and design flexibility,
they are too expensive for use in
the large-scale series production
of vehicles,” said Andreas
Eppinger, group vice president of
Technology Management at
Johnson Controls Automotive
Experience.

“With CAMISMA, our goal was
to create cost-efficient, sustain-
able access to carbon-fiber-
based materials systems.”

This was achieved by an inno-
vative industrial manufacturing
process for volume production
with about 200,000 units per
production line, allowing for
the first time the highly concen-
trated, efficient use of carbon
fiber, while at the same time
meeting all safety requirements.

The results of an initial rear-im-
pact crash test demonstrated
that the CAMISMA seat proto-
type satisfied all of the strength
requirements of current seats
built with a metal structure in
large-scale series production,
Eppinger said.

In addition to significant
weight savings, CAMISMA offers
a further advantage: The manu-
facturing steps required in as-
sembly are substantially reduced
through the number of attach-
ment parts needed, which also
saves cost, Dodero said.

The new seats will be available
in vehicles in 2019.

“The reason it seems like we’re
taking so long to get the seats in-
to vehicles is because of auto de-
velopment cycles,” Dodero said,
“which are about three or four
years.

“We just finished the research
that shows how safe the seats
are, and it’s just been validated

through awards like the one
we received from CLEPA.”

It is vitally important in this
day and age to be able to demon-
strate that a new kind of seat is
as safe as what it would be re-
placing, Dodero said. Right now,
automakers are paying special at-
tention to safety concerns be-
cause of recent problems in the
industry.

“And another advantage to our
seats is, lighter means thinner,
and that gives us the chance to
have more leg room in the back
seat,” Dodero said.

“That’s really important in a
market like China where many
executives have drivers, so these
executives sit in the back. Having
some more leg room for them be-
comes very important.”

Dodero said Johnson Controls
will be showing off the new seats
at the upcoming North American
International Auto Show in
Detroit in January.

Johnson Controls Awarded for Improving Vehicle Seats

by Jim Stickford

Frank Sinatra’s old song, “It
Was a Very Good Year,” could
have been sung for this year’s
Ford F-150.

The pickup’s aluminum body
led the Urban Wheels awards
judges to choose the F-150 as its
“Truck of the Year.”

The Urban Wheels awards, an-
nounced Dec. 11, are given out
by Decisive Magazine. The judg-
ing panel picked the three win-
ning vehicles based on style and
practicality, said magazine
spokesperson Jessica Pipkins.

Juror Mary Chapman said
among the factors that put the
F-150 over the top was its “poten-

tially revolutionary use of alu-
minum,” which provided sub-
stantial weight loss and con-
tributed to the truck’s “great
mileage” statistics.

Pipkins said that naming the
F-150 shouldn’t be that much of a
shock given the fact that it’s been
redesigned using aluminum
bodies. It’s also been America’s
“favorite truck” for many years.

“I don’t think too many people
were surprised with this choice,”
Pipkins said. “But there have
been so many advances in truck
technology, and trucks from all
the automakers have become so
good that I wouldn’t be surprised
if our jurors weren’t a little sur-
prised that the F-150 kept up with

other trucks in terms of quality
and technology.

“This is still a truck that people
want to use for business and for
personal reasons.”

The BMW i8 was named Green
Vehicle of the Year by jurors. De-
cisive Magazine editor Brian
Armstead said, “when BMW en-
ters the game, watch out.

“Not only is the BMW i8
‘green,’ it’s a BMW, with amazing
acceleration, fuel efficiency and
‘Ultimate Driving Machine’ road
manners.”

The Kia K900 was named the
Urban Wheels Car of the Year. Ju-
rors cited its understated ele-
gance “that speaks of the owner
being a savvy, trendy profession-

al” as among the chief reasons
for picking the Kia K900.

“The goal was to find the vehi-
cle that was appropriately afford-
able and appealing to the eyes,”
Pipkins said.

The Urban Wheels awards will
be presented to the winners at
the 19th annual Urban Wheels
Celebration to be held in the Gar-
den Theater in Detroit on Sun-
day, Jan. 11.

Urban Wheels Names F-150 ‘Truck of Year’

2015 F-150

Cutout of new car seat
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WASHINGTON (AP) – The Sen-
ate on Dec. 16 confirmed a new
administrator to lead the govern-
ment’s auto safety agency, which
faces complaints that regulators
bungled two high-profile recalls
involving faulty ignition switches
and exploding air bags.

Mark Rosekind, 59, a leading
expert on human fatigue, was ap-
proved by voice vote to head the
National Highway Traffic Safety
Administration, a neglected but
critically important agency that
is widely considered to be under-
staffed and underfunded. The
previous administrator, David
Strickland, left in January.

Rosekind is currently a mem-
ber of the National Transporta-
tion Safety Board, which investi-
gates transportation accidents,
and has led seven major investi-
gations. While at the board, he
persuaded fellow board mem-
bers to make a controversial rec-
ommendation that U.S. states
lower the blood alcohol limit for
drivers from 0.08 to 0.05. The

lower intoxication threshold
would bring the U.S. more in line
with other countries, but is
strongly opposed by the alcohol,
restaurant and entertainment in-
dustries. So far, no state has
adopted the recommendation.

The biggest issue facing
Rosekind at the agency will be re-
vitalizing its oversight of auto
recalls because of safety defects.
The agency has been roundly
criticized for not recognizing for
years dangerous defects that
caused ignition switches of some
General Motors cars to suddenly
shut off, and Takata air bags to
spew shrapnel when inflated.
Lawmakers complain the agency
is neither feared nor respected
by the auto industry.

Automakers have recalled a
record 55 million cars and trucks
in the U.S. so far this year, the
most since the previous high of
30.8 million vehicles in 2004. At
least 42 people have been killed
as a result of the faulty GM igni-
tion switches.

A recall of exploding Takata air
bags may be the largest recall in
the auto safety agency’s history.

The agency was slow to re-
spond to consumer complaints
about the ignition switches, say
safety advocates and members
of Congress. GM knew for at least
a decade that the switches were
dangerous, but failed to recall
cars until last February. Agency
officials have said GM hid impor-
tant information from the regula-
tor.

Takata’s air bags were sold to
at least 10 automakers. Even
though deaths and injuries were
reported as early as 2008, the
agency let automakers do a se-
ries of small recalls. It didn’t
open a full investigation until
June and only recently became
aggressive in seeking nationwide
recalls.

Rosekind “is prepared for the
job ahead and I expect him to be
relentless in the pursuit of safe-
ty,” Transportation Secretary An-
thony Foxx said following the

Senate’s confirmation. Rosekind
said he appreciated the Senate’s
swift action on his nomination
and plans to work closely with
Congress to advance Foxx’s
“vision to raise the bar on safe-
ty.”

Rosekind has a doctoral de-
gree in psychology from Yale Uni-
versity and is a former director
of Stanford University’s Center
for Human Sleep Research. In the
1990s, he conducted ground-
breaking research for NASA of
airline pilots and how they were
affected by lack of sleep. He cre-
ated Alertness Solutions, a con-
sulting firm on fatigue issues, in
1998 and was appointed to the
transportation safety board in
2010.

Mark Rosekind Appointed to Lead NHTSA’s Revitalization

DETROIT (AP) – At least 42
people have died and 58 have
been injured in crashes involving
General Motors cars with defec-
tive ignition switches.

Attorney Kenneth Feinberg,
who was hired by GM to com-
pensate victims, updated the
totals Dec. 15.

Feinberg says he has received
251 death claims and 2,075 in-
jury claims since August.

The fund so far has deemed a
total of 100 claims eligible for
compensation.

GM knew about faulty ignition
switches in Chevrolet Cobalts
and other small cars for more
than a decade but didn’t recall
them until February. The switch-
es can slip out of the “on” posi-
tion, which causes the cars to
stall, knocks out power steering
and turns off the air bags.

Feinberg will accept claims
until Jan. 31.

GM Fatalities
Upped to 42

TOKYO (AP) – Honda, Nissan
and Mitsubishi announced more
recalls for some possibly defec-
tive Takata air bags that Toyota
recalled earlier this month after
one exploded during scrapping
in Japan.

Nissan Motor Co. said Dec. 11
it’s recalling the Presage, X-Trail
and other models totaling 83,000
vehicles in Japan, some 6,000 in
China, another 49,000 in Europe
and 14,000 in other regions. A re-
call is coming in North America,
but details weren’t decided.

The recall by Nissan and other
Japanese automakers is meant to
address possible problems with
passenger side air bags.

Japanese supplier Takata
Corp. is under fire for air bag in-
flators that can explode, shoot-
ing out metal and plastic pieces.
At least five deaths and dozens
of injuries have been linked to
the problem worldwide.

Honda Motor Co. is recalling
400,000 vehicles worldwide for

the Fit, Stream, CR-V and other
models. That includes 175,000 in
Japan; 6,000 in North America,
excluding the U.S. where a recall
has already been carried out;
16,000 in South America; 100,000
in Europe; 70,000 in Asia and
30,000 in other regions.

Mitsubishi Motors Corp. re-
called 300 Lancer cars in Japan.
Mitsubishi said the comparable
recall has already been carried
out in the U.S.

That brings recalls in Japan
over Takata air bags to 3.05 mil-
lion vehicles. Globally, they total
more than 14 million.

No injuries or accidents have
been reported related to the
latest problem air bags, the min-
istry said.

The explosion that sparked the
recall for passenger side air bags
occurred in November in a scrap-
yard in Gifu Prefecture, central
Japan, in a Toyota vehicle.

Japan’s transport ministry said
last week there were six earlier

instances when Takata air bags
exploded during scrapping, two
in Toyota vehicles and four
in Honda vehicles. They all
occurred in 2012.

In Japan, air bags are deliber-
ately deployed during scrapping.
Toyota recalled 185,000 vehicles
in Japan and 5,000 in China for
possibly defective passenger-
side air bags Dec. 4.

Honda has the largest number
of Takata-related recalls, as half
of its vehicles are equipped with
Takata air bags. The recalls total
5.4 million in the U.S. for Honda.

Honda has expanded its recall
in the U.S., previously limited to
high-humidity areas, to the entire
country, and says it will apply
that recall worldwide as well.

Vehicle Recalls for Airbags Total 14 Million
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At the request of the National
Highway Traffic Safety Adminis-
tration, Ford is expanding its re-
call on Takata driver-side airbag
inflators.

The recall includes approxi-
mately 502,489 vehicles, an addi-
tion of approximately 447,310 ve-
hicles, said Ford spokesperson
Kelli Felker, in a statement to the
media.

This brings the total number
of Ford vehicles being recalled
for Takata airbag inflators to ap-
proximately 538,977.

This expanded recall includes
2005-08 Ford Mustang vehicles
built Aug. 18, 2004 to June 25,
2007, at Flat Rock Assembly
Plant and 2005-20 Ford GT vehi-
cles built Feb. 11, 2005, to Jan.
30, 2006, at Wixom Assembly
Plant.

As of Dec. 18, 2014, Felker said,
Ford is aware of approximately
462,900 vehicles in the United
States, approximately 27,500 in
Canada and approximately 7,600
in Mexico affected by this recall.
Approximately 4,500 additional
vehicles outside of North Ameri-
ca are also included in this ac-
tion.

Felker said Ford is aware of
one accident with an injury that
may be related to this condition.
Dealers will replace the airbag
inflator at no cost to the cus-
tomer.

Ford is Recalling
More Vehicles for
Airbag Problems

In a move seldom seen, auto-
motive supplier Takata placed a
full-page ad in the Detroit Free
Press Dec. 18 describing what
the company is doing to correct
problems from Takata’s airbag
inflators.

According to the National
Highway Traffic Safety Adminis-
tration, defective passenger side
airbag inflators have been linked
to several injuries and deaths.

In the newspaper ad, Takata
CEO Shigehisa Takada stated,
“Today we are as focused on our
mission as ever. Even one failure
is unacceptable and we are truly
and deeply saddened that five
fatalities have been attributed to
auto accidents where Takata
airbags malfunctioned.”

Takada goes on to say that the
company will work in unison
with its automaker customers
“to advance our common goal of
putting the safety of customers
first.”

Takata Ad States
Airbag ‘Failure
Is Unacceptable’
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“I am really proud to work here
tonight,” said Barra. “Forgotten
Harvest is a tremendous re-
source and we’re proud to be a
part of this event.”

Shonda Johnson, area general
manager for Marriott based in
the Detroit Renaissance Hotel,
said they hold the Forgotten Har-
vest “Good Neighbor Holiday
Dinner” in the main ballroom
thanks to the volunteer efforts of
300 of the hotel’s employees.

“This event is about giving
back to the community,” Johnson
said. “We prepare the food, we
prepare the set-up in the ball-
room and interact with the
guests who come. I also want to
give credit to the Forgotten Har-
vest volunteers who work year-
round to help those who need it.”

Kirk Mayes, chief executive

officer of Forgotten Harvest, said
having GM, Marriott and other
corporate sponsors, including
Bodman PLC, Bridgestone, the
Comer Foundation, C&S Compa-
nies, DTE Energy, Garden Fresh
Gourmet, Hollywood Markets,
Kroger, Telemus Capital, the
Westin Book Cadillac and Wolver-
ine Packing, have really made a
difference.

“They have made it possible to
bring 1,000 people together to
eat dinner and celebrate the holi-
days,” Mayes said.

“It’s incredibly important to
have sponsors like GM and Mar-
riott, as well as all the others, in-
volved. We all can touch the lives
of people who might not be get-
ting the benefits of Detroit’s first
wave of improvement.”

And, Mayes said, the event is
important for the children.
Christmas is a time kids wait for

all year long. So for these chil-
dren to be able to interact with
the mascots of Detroit’s pro
sports teams, and for them to
have a special holiday meal and
walk away with Christmas toys
truly matters.

“This annual event,” Mayes

said, “takes six months to put to-
gether, and it also takes a lot of
love and attention.

“So I want to say thanks to GM
and Marriott and all our spon-
sors for their effots. And I want
to thank all the volunteers who
work with us all year long.”

CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1
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Kids play with LEGOs at the Forgotten Harvest event on Dec. 15.

GM Execs Help in Serving
Holiday Dinner to Needy

New-vehicle retail sales in De-
cember are expected to reach
the highest levels on a seasonally
adjusted annualized rate (SAAR)
basis since 2006, according to a
monthly sales forecast devel-
oped jointly by J.D. Power and
LMC Automotive.

New-vehicle retail sales in De-
cember 2014 are projected to
reach 1.3 million units, a 7 per-
cent increase on a selling-day-
adjusted basis compared with
December 2013 (December 2014
has one more selling day than
December 2013), said J.D. Power
spokesperson John Tews.

The retail SAAR in December is
expected to be above the 14 mil-

lion unit level for the third time
this year, with a rate of 14.2 mil-
lion units, which is 1.4 million
units stronger than in December
2013. The most recent month in
which the retail SAAR was 14.2
million units was in August 2006.

Retail transactions are the
most accurate measure of con-
sumer demand for new vehicles.

“The industry continues to
demonstrate strong sales growth
as the year comes to a close,”
said John Humphrey, senior vice
president of the global automo-
tive practice at J.D. Power.

“The end of the year typically
drives more showroom traffic as
customers seek to take advan-

tage of better deals used to clear
out inventory in preparation for
the new year. In fact, Dec. 31 was
the strongest sales day of the
year in 2013, bringing in more
than 118,000 units or 10 percent
of the month’s sales.”

So far in 2014, May 31 was the
strongest selling day of the year
with more than 111,200 sales.

Total light-vehicle sales in De-
cember 2014 are expected to
reach 1.5 million units, a 6 per-
cent increase, compared with De-
cember 2013, Humphrey said.

Fleet volume in December is
projected to come in at 233,000
units, or 16 percent of total
sales, which is below the year-

to-date trend of 18 percent.
LMC Automotive’s 2014 U.S.

light-vehicle retail sales forecast
remains at 13.6 million units, but
robust sales in November and
December have pushed the total
light-vehicle forecast to 16.5 mil-
lion units. The previous total
light-vehicle forecast was 16.4.

LMC Automotive has raised its
retail sales forecast for 2015 to
14.0 million units from 13.9 mil-
lion and increased its total light-
vehicle sales forecast to 17.0 mil-
lion units from 16.8.

For 2015, LMC Automotive has
raised its forecast to 17.4 million
units from 17.2, which is a 3 per-
cent growth over 2014.

Analysts Call for New-Vehicle Sales Increases in December

president of The Chrysler Foun-
dation.

“We are equally proud of our
employees who generously give
their time and skills to help men-
tor students and serve as compe-
tition coordinators.”

The Chrysler Foundation
awarded a $5,000 grant to four
out-of-state schools – in Arizona,
Illinois and Indiana – as well as
37 schools in Michigan.

The Chrysler Foundation also
awarded a $750 grant to five FTC
teams in Michigan, Frazier said.

Additionally, FIRST in Michigan
will receive a $2,500 grant to sup-
port its FIRST LEGO League pro-
gram, which introduces students
(grades 4-8) to the fun and ex-
citement of science and technol-
ogy.

Frazier pointed out these addi-
tional facts about The Chrysler
Foundation’s support of FIRST:

• In 2014, The Chrysler Foun-
dation awarded grants to 41 U.S.
and Canadian-based robotics
teams.

• 34 of those teams were
based in the United States: one in
Arizona; one in Illinois; two in In-
diana; and 30 in Michigan, which
led the nation in the number of
registered FIRST Robotics
Teams.

• 14 of the 41 teams spon-
sored by The Chrysler Founda-
tion (12 Michigan and two Cana-
dian teams) qualified to compete
in the 2014 FIRST Championship.
Overall, 400 teams competed in

the FIRST Championship.
• Team RUSH, CSM Tech Acad-

emy and Clarkston High School,
Clarkston, Mich., received the
prestigious Championship Chair-
man’s Award. Camron Razdar, a
member of Team RUSH, was one
of 10 National Dean’s List Win-
ners.

• 70 U.S.-based Chrysler
Group employees served as FRC
team mentors; employees also
supported regional and district
events as competition coordina-
tors and event volunteers.

Since 1995, The Chrysler Foun-
dation, a FIRST Founding Spon-
sor, has invested more than $2.3
million to support FIRST pro-
grams in the United States and
Canada, Frazier said.

Chrysler Foundation Backs
School Robotics Teams

CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1

AUBURN HILLS (AP) –
Chrysler Group LLC has changed
its name to FCA US LLC.

The change will be largely un-
noticed by consumers, affecting
mostly corporate and financial
communications.

Chrysler-branded cars will
continue to bear the Chrysler
badge, as those branded Fiat will
bear the Fiat badge.

Fiat Chrysler Automobiles has
also renamed its mass-market
brand companies. Fiat Chrysler
Automobiles becomes FCA Italy
SpA.

The automaker said Dec. 16
that the name change follows
the naming convention of its par-
ent company, Fiat Chrysler Auto-
mobiles N.V., which adopted its
name in October when it listed
on the New York Stock Ex-
change.

Chrysler and its Italian owner
Fiat SpA merged earlier this year.
Fiat was granted management
control and a 20 percent stake in
Chrysler after it emerged from
bankruptcy protection in 2009.
Fiat gradually raised its stake and
eventually became majority own-
er.

The name change doesn’t im-
pact its headquarters in Auburn
Hills, its holdings, management
team, board or brands.

FCA US has more than 77,000
employees worldwide and runs
36 manufacturing plants, includ-
ing 23 in the U.S.

In Europe, Fiat Chrysler em-
ploys 89,000 people, 40 percent
of the worldwide workforce, pro-
ducing annual revenues about 20
billion euros, 23 percent of the
total global revenues of 87 bil-
lion euros.

Game’s the Same,
Only the Name
Has Changed

ANN ARBOR TOWNSHIP, Mich.
(AP) – Toyota Motor Corp. is fur-
ther boosting its research and
development work in southeast-
ern Michigan.

The automaker announced
Dec. 18 that it’s investing $126
million in the expansion of its
powertrain operations in Ann Ar-
bor Township and consolidating
vehicle development operations
at a new facility in nearby York
Township. Both powertrain and
vehicle development are being
centralized in Michigan. As part
of those moves, about 85 jobs
will relocate from California by
the end of 2016.

Some Toyota Jobs
Move to Michigan



Visteon Corporation will pre-
miere a range of innovative con-
nected vehicle technologies and
services at the 2015 International
CES in Las Vegas Jan. 6-9.

Through a range of highly in-
teractive displays and in-vehicle
demonstrations, Visteon will
demonstrate Cloud-based, con-
nected technologies, which,
through live 4GLTE over-the-air
connections, provide new fea-
tures and services enhancing the
driving experience and the resid-
ual value of the vehicle over its
lifetime, said Visteon President
and CEO Tim Leuliette.

Visteon also will show its de-
velopments for autonomous
driving through immersive simu-
lators.

“As we transition into the era
of the connected car, CES has
become a significant automotive
technology showcase and our
biggest customer event of the
year,” said Leuliette. “We will
showcase current, near-term,
and advanced technologies that

will extend the relevance of the
car’s electronics for both auto-
makers and consumers.”

Now in its 16th year at CES,
Visteon has one of the longest-
running participation levels
among automotive companies at
the annual show, Leuliette said.

“Technology will define how
mobility, the Internet of Things
and the auto industry work to-
gether to build the cars and
transportation systems of the
future,” said Martin T. Thall, Vis-
teon’s executive vice president
and president of Electronics.

“At the 2015 CES, Visteon will
showcase how we fuse technolo-
gy, innovation and ecosystem
partnerships to unlock the value
of connectivity and transform
driving into a connected experi-
ence.”

Visteon will highlight its Sem-
per Novus (Latin for “always
new”) cockpit concept system,
which will demonstrate ways for
consumers to update their vehi-
cle’s technical systems through

hardware updates and software
downloads.

The concept gives automakers
the opportunity to keep the vehi-
cle perpetually current and intro-
duce new services so consumers
can enjoy an “always new” expe-
rience.

A record 11 automotive manu-
facturers will exhibit at the 2015
CES.

Automotive exhibits will cover
more than 165,000 net square
feet of exhibit space, up 17 per-
cent from the 2014 show.

WARREN URGENTCARE

“We Care”
URGENT CARE FOR ACCIDENTS AND INJURY

ADULT & PEDIATRIC ILLNESS
Digital X-Rays, EKG and Lab Work, On-Site Lab Service, Strep, Mono,
Pregnancy & Urine Testing, Vaccinations, Sports & School Physicals,

Occupational Medicine, Work-Related Injuries,
Pre-Hire Physicals (BAT & Urine Screening)

SPECIAL ON SPORTS PHYSICAL $25.00 State-of-the-Art Facility

8am-10pm • 7 Days a week • 365 Days a Year
“Bringing Quality Urgent Care To Your Neighborhood”

586-276-8200
31700 Van Dyke • Warren, MI 48093

On Van Dyke Rd., between 13 & 14 Mile in
St. John’s Windemere Park

OTHER CONVENIENT LOCATIONS:

ATTENTION
Chrysler, GM, Ford

Employees, we’re within
2 miles of your plants

HAP & BCN
NO Referrals Needed!
www.warrenurgentcare.com

FLU SHOTS

Woodland Urgent Care
22341 W. 8 Mile Road

Detroit

313-387-8700

N. East Macomb Urgent Care
43900 Garfield, Suite 121

Clinton Township

586-868-2600

Ford and the Ford Fund
wrapped up their fourth annual
“Coat & Jacket Drive” Dec. 16 by
delivering more than 1,000 new
and gently used coats, along with
hats, scarves and gloves, to the
Salvation Army.

The coats and other items
were donated by local Ford em-
ployees and brought to the Salva-
tion Army in two new Ford Tran-
sit vans, said Ford spokeperson
Todd Nissen. The Salvation Army
will distribute the items to needy
families in the Detroit area.

“Surviving the cold of a Michi-
gan winter means bundling up in
a warm coat with a hat and
gloves,” said Janet Lawson, direc-
tor of the Ford Volunteer Corps.

“Unfortunately, many of our

neighbors struggle each day to
stay warm and to find enough
food, and we’re hoping we can
help ease that burden.”

The coats and other clothing
donations are the latest from
Ford and its philanthropic arm,
the Ford Motor Company Fund,
to give back to the communities
where Ford employees live and
work, Nissen said. In the past few
weeks, more than 700 Ford em-
ployees volunteered in 50 com-
munity service projects in eight
states as part of its quarterly Ac-
celerated Action Day.

So far this year, more than
27,000 Ford employees and re-
tirees have volunteered on com-
munity service projects around
the world.

WARREN

Subway/Oakland Mall
498 14 Mile Rd
248-307-1271
1939 W. Maple Rd
West of Crooks
248-435-2846

Subway/Walmart
2001 W. Maple Rd
West of Crooks
248-435-2431

TROY

31690 Mound Rd
13 & Mound
586-939-1000
26627 Hoover Rd
11 & Hoover
586-754-8205
30820 Hoover Rd
13 & Hoover
586-573-7829
29144 Ryan Rd
12 & Ryan
586-573-8000

28950 Van Dyke Ave
12 & Van Dyke
586-558-3882

Drive Thru Service:
NOW OPEN 24 HOURS
32620 Van Dyke Ave
South of 14 Mile
586-795-0000
Subway/Meijer
29505 Mound Road
12 Mile & Mound
586-558-0100

Subway - Walmart
29176 Van Dyke
Warren, MI 48093
586-393-1008

66603 Van Dyke
South of 31 Mile
586-752-6500

ROMEO

NOWOPEN•DRIVE THRU
13160 32 Mile Road
32 & Van Dyke X-Way
586-281-6359

WASHINGTON TWP.

STERLING HGTS.
8178 23 Mile Rd
23 & Van Dyke
586-739-4100

Subway/Walmart
NOW OPEN 24 HOURS
51450 Shelby Pkwy
23 & Van Dyke X-Way
586-254-8140

SHELBY

Subway/Walmart
28804 Gratiot
12 & Gratiot
586-773-1682

ROSEVILLE

Inside
Chrysler
STAMPING

Inside
Chrysler
SHAP

37876 Van Dyke
at 16 1/2 Mile
586-795-8368
Subway/Walmart
NOW OPEN 24 HOURS
33201 Van Dyke
14 & Van Dyke
586-274-4319
Subway/Meijer
36600 Van Dyke Ave
586-795-1605
38357 Dodge Park
at Plumbrook
586-264-5300
40058 Van Dyke
18 Mile & Van Dyke
586-939-4500

SubwayChrysler
35777 Van Dyke
586-795-0205

NOW OPEN 24 HOURS
7960 Metro Parkway
VanDyke&MetroPkwy
586-268-0800
SubwayChrysler
38111 Van Dyke
586-268-6900

Subway/Meijer
5150 Coolidge Hwy
South of 15 Mile
248-677-3899

ROYAL OAK

Looking to join our team at SUBWAY?
Call 586-904-1206
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Ford volunteers, in blue shirts, work with Salvation Army employees to distribute winter wear to the needy.

Wrapping Up the Needy
For Winter is Ford’s Goal

The General Motors Founda-
tion has donated $10,000 to two
nonprofit organizations in the
Romulus community through the
Plant City Grants program.

Romulus Community Schools
received $7,500 and Starfish Fam-
ily Services was granted $2,500,
said GM spokesperson Kevin
Nadrowski.

Starfish provides early child-
hood and parenting programs,
children’s mental health servic-
es, after-school programs and an
emergency shelter for teens and
youth in crises.

“This year, the GM Foundation
will provide more than $1.7 mil-
lion in funding to 209 organiza-
tions in 45 plant cities where GM
employees live and work,” said
GM Foundation vice president
Lori Wingerter.

“Through these grants, we con-
tinue our mission to give back
and build stronger communities
where GM does business.”

This is the fourth consecutive
year the GM Foundation has
issued Plant City Grants in
the Romulus area, Nadrowski
said.

The Foundation’s funding in
support of the community totals
$40,000 during that period.

The grant presentation took
place at the Romulus Powertrain
plant Dec. 10.

During the event, guests were
provided a manufacturing up-
date and plant tour, showcasing
project work and demonstra-
tions from recent investment in-
to the facility.

Speaking to the plant’s employ-
ees at the presentation, Romulus
Powertrain Plant Manager Clark
Freeman said, “It is important
that we are good community
neighbors and these grants
provided by the GM Founda-

tion allow us to give back in
a big way each year.

“Through the Plant City Grants
initiative, we’re helping to build
stronger communities and are
striving to enrich the lives of our
neighbors.”

The GM Foundation grants are
given to a wide variety of organi-
zations across the country that
families rely on to provide much
needed services, improve educa-
tion and impact the quality of life
within their respective communi-
ties, Nadrowski said.

The grants, he added, will
make these communities even
greater places to work and live.

Two Romulus Nonprofits Granted $10,000

Clark Freeman speaks at GM Foundation presentation ceremony.

BRAKE SPECIAL

$19995
Most F.W.D. U.S. Cars • In-store offer ends 12-31-14

Check Our Price on
Tune Ups, Water Pumps,

Heater Cores & Other Repairs

DELUXE OIL
CHANGE
SPECIAL

Up To 5 Qts. Of
Oil Lube & Filter

•
No Disposal Fee

Includes topping off fluids

12-31-14

MMMMAAAAKKKKEEEE UUUUSSSS YYYYOOOOUUUURRRR FFFFIIII RRRRSSSSTTTT CCCCHHHHOOOOIIIICCCCEEEE

WARREN • 586-757-7203

$2336

MUFFLER & BRAKE SERVICE
23252 VAN DYKE

3 Blocks North of 9 Mile
HOURS: Mon.-Fri. 7:30am-5pm; Sat.-Closed

Most FWD Cars  

• Front Metallic Disc Brake Pads

• 2 New Front Rotors

• Labor Included

MMUUFFFFLLEERR,, EEXXTTEENNSSIIOONN PPIIPPEE && TTAAIILL PPIIPPEE

10%Off
In-store offer ends 12-31-14

Visteon to Demo Cloud Technologies at CES

If you have solid business news
for this paper, please contact us
at News@DetroitAutoScene.com.

Got News?

mailto:news@detroitautoscene.com
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Chrysler’s Kokomo Transmis-
sion Plant (KTP) has been
awarded bronze status for its re-
sults in implementing World
Class Manufacturing (WCM).

The Kokomo, Ind., transmis-
sion plant became Chrysler’s
eighth North American facility to
achieve the WCM award mile-
stone and the automaker’s high-
est-ranking transmission plant,
said Chrysler spokesperson Jodi
Tinson.

KTP, which produces the new
fuel-efficient eight- and nine-
speed transmissions for various
models in the Chrysler portfolio,
said Tinson, received the bronze
designation just over four years
after adopting the WCM operat-
ing system following a two-day
audit Dec. 4-5.

Bronze, Tinson said, is award-
ed after earning a minimum of 50
points in 10 technical and 10
managerial pillars by demon-
strating clear WCM know-how
and competence through em-
ployee-conducted pillar presen-
tations and a review of projects
that have been expanded across
the shop floor. KTP earned a
score of 51.

“KTP has gone through signif-
icant change since 2009 as it
prepared to launch production
of the all-new eight- and nine-
speed transmissions,” said
Brian Harlow, Chrysler vice
president and head of NAFTA
Manufacturing. “Through it all,
the KTP employees remained
focused on implementing World
Class Manufacturing and have
been acknowledged for those
efforts today with the awarding
of bronze.

“We are proud of the commit-
ment demonstrated by our
employees and the support
received from the UAW, which
has been critical in making
Chrysler Group’s manufacturing
facilities among the best in the
world.”

KTP has been the recipient of
five investments over five years
totaling more than $1.5 billion
for the production of the new
transmissions, Tinson said.

KTP began producing the
eight-speed transmission in Sep-
tember 2012. In 2013, KTP pro-
duced nearly 300,000 eight-
speeds.

That number has more than
doubled to nearly 700,000 in the
first 11 months of 2014.

Currently, the eight-speed
transmission is available on the
Jeep Grand Cherokee, Chrysler
300, Dodge Challenger, Dodge
Charger, Dodge Durango and
Ram 1500. The company sold
more than 800,000 of these mod-
els in the U.S. through November
2014.

Chrysler’s Kokomo
Plant Joins WCM

Bronze Ranks

MILAN (AP) – European car-
makers have seen car sales rise
for the 15th straight month,
though more slowly than recent
months in a reflection of the re-
gion’s fragile economic situation.

European automaker associa-
tion ACEA said Dec. 16 that car
sales in November rose 1.4 per-
cent to 953,886 units with the
strongest growth in Spain, up 17
percent.

That was the slowest growth
rate this year, and compares
with gains of over 6 percent in
the previous two months.

Two of the largest markets,
No. 1 Germany and No. 3 France,
shrank 1.8 percent and 2.7 per-
cent, respectively, while remain-
ing on trend for full-year gains.

IHS Automotive said the num-
bers showed the fragility of
Europe’s economic situation,
noting “it would take little in the
way of negative macro data” to
end the growth period.

Europe Car Sales
Up in November



They may not look like Santa’s
elves, but the UAW Local 909 em-
ployees at GM’s Warren Trans-
mission are making sure that a
lot of Detroit-area kids have toys
under the tree this Christmas
morning.

John Giannetti, UAW Local 909
event coordinator, said they’ve
been holding fundraisers to raise
money for the Marine Corps’
Toys for Tots program for a while
now.

“This is something we do
every year,” Giannetti said. “The
people at the plant really get be-
hind this effort. We have a golf
outing where the money raised
goes to this charity.

“Toys for Tots is just one of
four charities we raise money for
all year long.

“The others are the March of
Dimes, the United Negro College
Fund and the American Cancer
Society’s Breast Cancer Aware-
ness Fund.”

The plant’s Professional Man-
agers Network of execiutives also
holds fundraisers throughout
the year to help the Toys for Tots
effort.

“We sell $5 box lunches at the
plant,” said Renee Gaynor, pro-
gram chair.

“We don’t have hot food serv-
ices here, so selling lunch makes
sense. We make the sandwiches
and the chips. The pop is donat-
ed by Continental Food Servic-
es.”

Giannetti estimates that they
collected enough cash to pur-
chase $15,000 in toys.

“We raised about $6,000 from
various fundraisers, but we also
weren’t shy about walking the
floor and asking people to donate
cash,” Giannetti said.

Gaynor pointed out that in ad-
dition to employees at the plant
donating their time and money,
their efforts to raise funds for

Toys for Tots have been helped
by donations from vendors, sup-
pliers and contractors.

“They deserve some credit for
this as well,” Gaynor said.

“This is a project where every-
one is happy to get involved.”

Speaking to a crowd of Warren
Transmission employees, Sgt.
Nicholas Witt of the Marine
Corps’ 124th Reserve out of Self-
ridge said that when his group
started up the local Toys for Tots
campaign seven years ago, most
participants were “mom and
pop” businesses.

But, Witt said, over the past
few years, bigger businesses
started getting involved.

“I’m glad to see more and more
people participating,” Witt said.
“You guys are the ones who are
donating your time and money

and making a brighter future for
the kids.”

Warren Transmission shop

chairman Jacob Beeman said
that people often “knock GM.”

“But when we do good as a

company, we also do good in the
community,” Beeman said. “This
is just an example of that.”

GM Trans Employees Give Their Time, Effort to Toys for Tots
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Warren Transmission employees, U.S. marines and Santa with Toys for Tots gifts

by Jim Stickford

Talk about rolling out the bar-
rel.

That’s exactly what they did at
Champane’s Wine Cellar on
Chicago Road, across from the
GM Tech Center in Warren.

The owners of the venerable
wine store – Dean, Chris and
George Champane – added a bar
that sells craft beer and ales.

“The retail store, which sells
wine, liquor, craft beers and
cheeses, was first opened in
1976,” said Chris Champane.

“We opened up the bar a cou-
ple of months ago. This allows us
to cross-market and cross-sell
beers and ales we carry in our re-
tail store.”

Champane said that when they
opened the store back in the
1970s, it made sense to specialize
in wine.

But, over the years, tastes
changed and the craft beer in-
dustry took off.

“Michigan has really come a
long way when it comes to craft
beer,” Champane said.

“I’ve heard that we’re fourth in
terms of craft beer, behind Col-
orado, Oregon and, I think, Cali-
fornia.

“Whatever the case is, there
are a lot of local craft brewers in
the state. So when we were look-
ing for ways to expand, adding a
bar that would carry these craft
beers made perfect sense.”

Many of the beers they have at
the new bar, they also carry at
their store, Champane said. And
the beers they don’t have for re-
tail sale, they often have beers
from the same brewers who
make what is on tap.

“We do a lot of limited releas-
es,” Champane said. “Things that
are hard to find at stores or other

bars – or regional beers like Dog-
fish and Stone.”

Champane said that while the
bar is new, it isn’t the first time
the store offered something
extra.

“We had a restaurant here in
the mid-1980s,” Champane said.
“We shut it down because it was
expensive to operate and decid-
ed to expand the retail side of the
business. I will also say that we
don’t make our own beer and
have no plans to do so.”

The feedback from the public
has been terrific, Champane said.
The comment most heard from
customers, he said, is that
they’re surprised at all the vari-
ety of brew that are offered at the
bar.

He added that customers have
also said that they loved the idea
of being able to taste a beer, and
if they liked it, being able to buy
it from the retail side of the oper-
ation.

“People have also told me that
they like the fact that the bar is
quiet and that they can have a
conversation,” Champane said.
“It’s in a personalized environ-
ment that’s intimate.”

Champane said they rotate the
beers that are served at the bar,
so that there’s always something
new to try. He said the biggest
surprise is just how many good
local brews there are in Michi-
gan.

The craft beer industry here
has taken off and Champane’s of-
fers customers a chance to sam-
ple what’s out there.

“We serve some beers that
can’t be found in a bottle,” Cham-
pane said. “But thanks to us, our
customers are now able to try
these beers.

“Right now, the three most
popular beers we have on tap are

Founders, Bell’s and Short’s.”
Many of the Wine Cellar’s cus-

tomers work at GM’s Tech Cen-
ter, Champane said.

They have also created a room
that can be rented out, where
people can sample wine, cheese
and beer.

“We always do well with that
room during sporting events,”
Champane said. “Lately, with the
Lions winning, we’ve done well
on the Sundays they play.

“I would say we’re a neighbor-

hood place, but we’re starting to
get people from all over metro
Detroit stopping by. We’re be-
coming a bit of a destination.

“We’re even getting people
from around the state and out-
side Michigan. When people
have relatives visit, they bring
them here.”

Champane’s is open seven
days a week, Champane said.

“We’re offering some excellent
deals on both wine and beer for
the holidays,” said Champane.

Champane’s Toasts Newest
Feature – a Craft Beer Bar

Chris, left, and George Champane at their new bar

Art Van Furniture and WXYZ-
TV/Channel 7 – in a “Together We
Can” food drive – collected more
than 20,000 pounds of packaged
and canned food in November to
help feed families in need this
holiday season.

Thanks to the generosity of its
guests and team members, the
furniture/mattress retailer and
the TV station donated the non-
perishable food items to Glean-
ers Community Food Bank of
Southeastern Michigan.

Approximately 17,200 meals
will be served during the holiday

season because of the donations.
“While the need is great, the

generosity of metro Detroiters is
even greater,” said Gary Van
Elslander, president of Art Van
Furniture.

“The overwhelming response
this year to the ‘Art Van Furni-
ture and WXYZ-TV/Channel 7 To-
gether We Can’ program to feed
the hungry is a testament to the
big hearts and giving spirit that
is alive and well in our stores and
in our community.”

Gerry Brisson, president of
Gleaners Community Food Bank

of Southeastern Michigan, said,
“Without advocates like Art Van
Furniture and WXYZ TV/Channel
7 in our community, Gleaners
would not be able to distribute
enough food to those in need
each year.

“They support our mission to
nourish communities by feeding
hungry people.”

The nonprofit organization has
been feeding the hungry across
metro Detroit for more than 37
years, Brisson said. One out of
every four households in Michi-
gan faces hunger.

Together, They Did – Help Feed the Hungry

SOUTHFIELD, Mich. (AP) – A
17-story vacant office building in
suburban Detroit has been im-
ploded.

In a matter of seconds Dec. 14,
North Park Plaza in Southfield
fell upon itself into a mound of
dust and rubble.

Oakland Community College
owns the property just north of
Detroit and auctioned off the
chance to blow it up to the high-
est bidder.

Graduate Andrea Wilson got
the honor to start the controlled
implosion after a person who
pledged $8,000 chose to remain
anonymous.

The college bought the 42-
year-old building earlier this
year and says it has no immedi-
ate plans for the land.

A total of $12,000 was raised
from the auction. Proceeds will
go to a college foundation that
pays for scholarships and other
student programs.

Oakland Community College
has five campuses throughout
Oakland County.

“It was the night of my gradua-
tion,” Wilson told the Oakland
Press.

“Not many people can say,
‘Hey, you know, I blew up a build-
ing once.’

“I’ve got to say that this is the
best graduation present I could
ask for.”

About 400 people were on
hand to watch the building fall.

“The best part was when the
top two stories fell,” 10-year-old
Daniel Fortino told The Detroit
News. “How did they rig it so
nothing else falls around it?”

Daniel was joined by his 10-
year-old friend Nick Bradburn.

“I thought it was gonna be one
big bang and then the bottom
would fall,” Nick said.

Building Goes
BOOM! –

And Falls Down

DEARBORN, Mich. (AP) – Ford
has hired a former General Mo-
tors chief industry analyst to
manage data collection and use
it to help predict the future.

The Dearborn, Michigan, auto-
maker on Dec. 15 announced
that it has hired Paul Ballew, who
most recently led global data op-
erations at the Dun and Brad-
street analytics company.

CEO Mark Fields says Ford ex-
pects to get reams of data as
more of its cars become connect-
ed to the Internet. If customers
choose, the company could ana-
lyze driving patterns and predict
when their car would need serv-
ice, Fields said. Ford also could

use real-time data to develop
new products and apps, he said.

Ballew will lead teams dealing
with connectivity between cus-
tomers and the Internet, autono-
mous cars and other mobility
issues, Fields said.

“It’s a crystal ball, but when
you have the right analytics, you
can make that crystal ball a lot
clearer,” he said.

Ballew, 50, left GM in 2007 to
establish an analytics and cus-
tomer insight unit at Nationwide
Insurance. He then went to Dun
and Bradstreet. Before GM, he
served as senior adviser on auto
industry conditions at J. D. Pow-
er and Associates.

Ford, New Analyst Look to Crystal Ball
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2015 XTS FWD
STANDARD COLLECTION

39 AVAILABLE

2015 CTS 2.0L TURBO
STANDARD COLLECTION

34 AVAILABLE

2015 ATS 2.5L
SEDAN - STANDARD COLLECTION

57 AVAILABLE

2015 ATS 2.0L TURBO AWD
COUPE – STANDARD COLLECTION

2015 SRX FWD
STANDARD COLLECTION

84 AVAILABLE

2015 ESCALADE AWD
LUXURY COLLECTION
REAR SEAT ENTERTAINMENT
PREMIUM PAINT

3 AVAILABLE

0% UP TO 72 MONTHS*
IInncclluuddeess CCaaddiillllaacc PPrreemmiiuumm CCaarree MMaaiinntteennaannccee ffoorr 44 YYeeaarrss oorr 5500,,000000 MMiilleess11

www.PrestigeCadillac.com

Showroom Hours: Mon. & Thurs. 8:30 a.m.-8 p.m. • Tue., Wed., & Fri. 8:30 a.m.-6 p.m. • Sat. 10 a.m.-4 p.m.

Visit our website:

8333 EAST 11 MILE ROAD • I-696 & VAN DYKE

888-548-8939

* Tax, title, license and dealer fees extra. No security deposit required. 30,000 miles with approved lease. 
Mileage charge of $.25 per mile over 30,000 miles. Lessee pays for excess wear and tear charges. 
All applicable rebates to dealer. Photo may not represent actual vehicle. 
ATS, CTS, XTS & SRX must show proof of current lease of a 2004 or newer GM vehicle and lease eligible new 2014 Cadillac. 
0% up to 72 months on approved credit on all 2014 except ELR & Escalades. 
MRSP’s: ATS $38,240, ATS Coupe $41,440, CTS $48,340, XTS $45,595, Escalade $82,245, SRX $38,600 
Due at signing ATS $3,019, ATS Coupe $3,819, CTS $3,999, XTS $2,839, Escalade $3,974, SRX $2,259. 
See dealer for details. Take delivery by 1/15/2015.

A Prestige Automotive
Group Company

Download our app
for additonal savings

JOHN DEGRANDE
Sales & Leasing Consultant

39 years experience

$329EMPLOYEE
PRICE
36 MONTH/10K PER YEAR

$309EMPLOYEE
PRICE
36 MONTH/10K PER YEAR

$419EMPLOYEE
PRICE
36 MONTH/10K PER YEAR

$389EMPLOYEE
PRICE
36 MONTH/10K PER YEAR

$329EMPLOYEE
PRICE
36 MONTH/10K PER YEAR

$727EMPLOYEE
PRICE
36 MONTH/10K PER YEAR

12 AVAILABLE

#42333 #21552#44296

475 SUMMIT DRIVE • 248-292-2502 • 5825 HIGHLAND RD. (M59) • WATERFORD

CALL
BRUCE LITVIN
– 24/7 & 365 –

40 YEARS
OF QUALITY SERVICE

CELL # 1-586-405-5175
blitvin@lunghamer.com

1-888-665-5438

LLAASSTT MMOONNTTHH
TTOO LLEEAASSEE
22001144 CCRRUUZZEESS,,
CCAALLLL FFOORR
UUNNBBEELLIIEEVVAABBLLEE

PPAAYYMMEENNTTSS
&& DDOONN’’TT FFOORRGGEETT
AABBOOUUTT TTHHEE LLOOWW LLOOWW

PPAAYYMMEENNTTSS
OONN TTHHEE
VVOOLLTTSS

LLAASSTT 22 WWEEEEKKSS
TTOO TTAAKKEE AADDVVAANNTTAAGGEE

OOFF TTHHEESSEE DDEEAALLSS!!

DETROIT (AP) – Ford Motor
Co. has agreed to government
demands to expand a driver’s
side air bag inflator recall to the
entire U.S.

The move announced Dec. 18
adds 447,000 Ford vehicles to the
list of those recalled due to
driver’s inflators made by
Japan’s Takata Corp. The infla-
tors can explode with too much
force, spewing shrapnel into
drivers and passengers.

Ford’s action puts pressure on
BMW and Chrysler, the only two
automakers that haven’t agreed
to national recalls. The National
Highway Traffic Safety Adminis-
tration made the demand of five
automakers, saying the inflators
are dangerous. Honda and Mazda
have taken their recalls national.

Previously, the recalls were
limited to high-humidity states
mainly along the Gulf Coast.

The Ford national recall covers
certain 2005-08 Mustangs and
2005-06 GT sports cars. The com-
pany also announced it would re-
call the same cars in Canada,
Mexico and a few other coun-
tries. Dec. 18’s announcement
brings to just over 502,000 the
number of Ford vehicles recalled
for Takata air bags.

The automaker said in a state-
ment that it’s aware of one acci-
dent with an injury that could be
linked to the air bags. Dealers
will replace the inflators at no
cost to customers.

Last month, NHTSA demanded
that Takata and the five automak-
ers recall driver’s inflators
across the nation. Takata and
Chrysler have refused and could
face legal action. BMW says it’s
still evaluating the demand.

Takata took out full-page ad-
vertisements in newspapers, in-
cluding the Detroit Free Press on

Dec. 18, saying that it will work
with NHTSA and automakers to
expand the recalls by increasing
production capacity for replace-
ment air bags. The company said
it’s exploring whether other com-
panies’ air bags can be used in
replacement kits.

But in documents filed with
NHTSA, Takata refused to do a
national recall, saying it’s not
supported by testing data. The
company also said NHTSA didn’t
have the authority to order a
parts supplier to do a recall. The
safety agency has threatened
legal action if Takata and the
remaining automakers don’t
comply with its demand.

NHTSA has said the inflator
propellant, ammonium nitrate,
can burn faster than designed if
exposed to prolonged airborne
moisture. That can cause it to
blow apart a metal canister
meant to contain the explosion.

The safety agency says there’s
no data to support a nationwide
passenger air bag recall, which
so far has been held to the high-
humidity states. In total, 10 auto-
makers have models with Takata
air bags, which have been
blamed for at least five deaths
and multiple injuries worldwide.
So far, automakers have recalled
about 12 million vehicles in the
U.S. and about 19 million globally
for similar problems.

U.S. recalls previously had
been limited to Florida, Hawaii,
Puerto Rico and the U.S. Virgin
Islands. But recently, under pres-
sure from NHTSA, automakers
have expanded them to include
Saipan, Guam, American Samoa
as well as Alabama, Georgia,
Louisiana, Mississippi and Texas
– all areas with average annual
dew points of 60 degrees or
higher.

Federal Government Puts
More Pressure on Takata
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Jeff Caul
586-274-0396
PEP QUOTES BY PHONE OR EMAIL:
JEFF CAUL AT JCAUL@BUFFWHELAN.COM

Free shuttle service to home, office or shopping.

buff whelan chevrolet
WHERE THE DEALS MAKE THE DIFFERENCE, EVERY DAY SINCE 1970!

Van Dyke • South of 18 Mile • Sterling Heights

☺ We guarantee the lowest price or it’s free! ☺ We guarantee the lowest price or it’s free!

☺ We guarantee the lowest price or it’s free! ☺ We guarantee the lowest price or it’s free!
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*See dealer for details. All Rebates/Incentives have been deducted from sale price/payment and are subject to change by manufacturer
without notice. GM Employee discount required unless otherwise noted. All leases include GM Lease Loyalty unless otherwise noted.
Silverado lease assumes that you have a 1999 or newer trade in. Traverse and Equinox leases assume you have a NON-GM Lease in the
household that must terminate. All lease payments are based on 10,000 miles per year. 1st payment, tax,title and plate fee due at signing
on all leases. All programs expire 1/2/2015

CONVENIENT HOURS:
Mon. & Thurs.

8:30 am – 9 pm
Tues., Wed., Fri.

8:30 am – 6:30 pm

��

VA
N
DY

KE

SC
HO

EN
HE

RR

MO
UN

D

METRO PKWY.

18 MILE RD.

SINCE
1989

Touchscreen Radio, Back-Up Camera, Remote Start,
Deep Tinted Glass, Aluminum Wheels, WI-FI,
Power Locks/Windows/Mirrors & More…
24 Month Lease/10,000 Miles

Stk.#50799

2015 EQUINOX 1LT

*With Lease Conquest • No Security Deposit Required

Stk.#50988

2015 SILVERADO 1LT
NO SECURITY
DEPOSIT
REQUIRED

NO SECURITY
DEPOSIT
REQUIRED

All Star Package, Remote Start, Back-Up Camera,
Auto A/C, 17” Wheels, Trailer Package,
Power Locks/Windows/Mirrors & More…
24 Month Lease/10,000 Miles

No Security Deposit Required

OVER 1,000
New Chevrolets in Stock!

WE GUARANTEE THEWE GUARANTEE THE
LOWEST PRICES OR IT’S FREELOWEST PRICES OR IT’S FREE☺☺

586-274-0396
Stk.#51399

2015 TRAVERSE 1LT

Power Locks/Windows/Mirrors, Cruise, Tilt, Remote
Start, Bluetooth, Aluminum Wheels, Back-Up Camera,

XM Radio, OnStar & More…

24 Month Lease/10,000 Miles

$201*+Tax with$0 Down
*With Lease Conquest • No Security Deposit Required

buff whelan
chevrolet

$138*+Tax with$0 Down

$229*+Tax with$0 Down

DOUBLE CAB, 4X4

NO SECURITY
DEPOSIT
REQUIRED

HAPPY
HOLIDAYS

from

*GM Employee Pricing PlusTax, Title, Lic. and Doc. No Security Deposit Required. Total due at lease signing 2015Yukon 4WD SLE $2,280, 2015 Enclave-FWD Convenience group $1,626, 2015Verano $1,615, 2015 Lacrosse Base -1SB $1,745, 2015 Acadia AWD SLE-1 $1,568, 2015
Sierra 1500 Double Cab 4WD$1,788, 2015 Regal FWD$1,708, 2014 Encore $1,701, 2015Terrain $992. *Loyalty RebateMust Have Lease on 99 or Newer GMC/Buick in Household. * DBC=Dealer Bonus Certs.While Supplies Last ** Pull ahead programo?er is a private o?er pro-
gram.Noteveryonewill qualify. 20%o?MSRPonVerano,Enclave,Sierra’sDBLCabandLaCrosse.BonuscashonAcadiaandEnclave.Programssubject tochange.Photosmaynot representactualvehicle.Price is subject tochangewithoutnotice. Seedealer fordetails. Expires12/31/14.

40755 Van Dyke • Sterling Heights •586.977.2800
WWW.VYLETEL.NET SALES: Sun CLOSED; M, TH 8:30am-9pm; T, W, F 8:30am-6pm; SAT 10am-3pm

SERVICE: Sun CLOSED; M, TH 7am-8pm; T, W, F 7am-6pm; Sat 10am-3pm

VISIT OURWEBSITE TO SEARCH FOR MORE VEHICLES & GREAT DEALS ON NEW BUICK’S OR GMC’S ATWWW.VYLETEL.NET

SAVE OVER
$12,800 OFF LIST

2014BUICKENCORE FWD
CONVENIENCEGROUP

LEASE FOR ONLY

$209*
/MO

24 MO. LEASE
10K MILES PER YEAR

STK #4048-14 • DEAL #49782
*GM pricing plus tax, title, lic. No sec. deposit required.
Lease figured with lease loyalty rebate. $1,701 total due at signing.

24 MONTH BUICK EXPERIENCE LEASE
FREEMaintenance • FREE XM Radio! • FREE OnStar

2015 BUICKLACROSSE
BASE 1SB

LEASE FOR ONLY

$199*
/MO

24 MO. LEASE
10K MILES PER YEAR

STK #6841-15 • DEAL #49802
•GM pricing plus tax, title, lic. No sec. deposit required.
Must qualify for lease loyalty rebate. Must have ‘99 or new Buick
in household. $1,745 total due at signing.

24 MONTH BUICK EXPERIENCE LEASE
FREEMaintenance • FREE XM Radio! • FREE OnStar

ATTENTION CURRENT BUICK OWNER’S
LEASE BUICK’S BEST FOR LESS!

2015GMCTERRAINFWD
SLE-1SPECIAL

LEASE FOR ONLY

$139*
/MO

24 MO. LEASE
10K MILES PER YEAR

STK #7778-15 • DEAL #52306
*GM pricing plus tax, title, lic. No sec. deposit required. Must qualify for lease loyalty rebate. $992 total due at signing.

ONLY $399 DOWN

2014GMCSIERRA
15004WDCREWCABSLE

NOW
$29,999*

WAS $42,835
STK #9810-14

*GM pricing plus tax, title, lic. Must qualify for lease loyalty rebate.

LOWMILES
5.3L V8 Ecotec3 Engine,Trailer Brake Controller,

Trailiering Equipment Pkg &more!

2015 GMCACADIA FWD
SLE-1

2015 BUICKVERANOFWD
1SD

LEASE FOR ONLY

$215*
/MO

39 MO. LEASE
10K MILES PER YEAR

STK #4002-15 • DEAL #49779
*GM pricing plus tax, lic. No sec. deposit required.
Lease figured with lease loyalty rebate. $1,615 total due at signing.
Remove floor mats received $309.48 discount.

BUICK EXPERIENCE
FOR LESS

2014BUICKREGAL FWD
PREMIUM 1NOW

$26,399*

WAS $34,480
STK #6418-14

*GM pricing plus tax, lic. Must qualify for lease loyalty rebate.

24 MONTH BUICK EXPERIENCE LEASE
FREEMaintenance • FREE XM Radio! • FREE OnStar

NO SECURITY
DEPOSIT
REQUIRED

YEAR END DEMO SPECIAL

24 MONTH BUICK EXPERIENCE LEASE
FREEMaintenance • FREE XM Radio! • FREE OnStar

LEASE FOR ONLY

$119*
/MO

24 MO. LEASE
10K MILES PER YEAR

STK #7572-15 • DEAL #51286
*GM pricing plus tax, title, lic. No sec. deposit required.
Must qualify for lease loyalty rebate. $1,568 total due at signing.

BUICK’S NEWEST
FOR LESS!

2015GMCSIERRA
15004WDDOUBLECABSLE

LEASE THIS 4X4 FOR ONLY

$269*
/MO

39 MO. LEASE
10K MILES PER YEAR

STK #7791-15 • DEAL #51790
*GM pricing plus tax, title, lic. No sec. deposit required.
Must qualify for lease loyalty rebate. $1,788 total due at signing.

Trailiering Equipment Pkg, Power driver seat, Remote start,
Front fog lamps, Rear Defrost, 110 Volt AC Power Outlet, Universal

Home Remote, Dual zone A/C Climate Control &more!

JUST IN TIME FORWINTER!

0%
UP TO 60 MO.
AVAILABLE

3.6L SIDI V6 engine,
Intergrated exhaust tips, 18” Painted aluminumwheels.

DEMO!
SPECIAL

SAVE OVER
$8,000 OFF LIST

0%
UP TO 60 MO.
AVAILABLE

HUGE YEAR END SAVINGS
LOWMILEAGE. DEMO SPECIAL.

259 HP,
Heated seats, Heated steering wheel, Push start,

Rear vision camera, Passive entry.

FREE MAINTENANCE

NO SECURITY
DEPOSIT
REQUIRED

HUGE SAVINGS

VYLETEL
2015GMCYUKON SLE4X4

27 MO. LEASE • 10K MILES PER YEAR
STK #7755-15 • DEAL #50467

*Price example stock specific. GM pricing plus tax, title, lic. No sec. deposit required.
Must have ‘99 or new GM in household for loyalty rebate. $1,862 total due at signing.

LEASE FOR ONLY

$329*
/MO

SEVERAL
TO CHOOSE FROM

HURRY, OFFER ENDS 12/1/14

Wally Edgar
1-866-906-0279

*All lease payments based on GM Employee discount price plus tax. Zero security deposit. First
month payment, tax on rebates and money down, title plate and doc. fees due at signing with all
rebates including USAA Private Offer assigned to dealer. Due to advertising deadlines, prices subtect
to change.

JAY CHAISER x117
Fax: 248-391-0189
Cell: 248-821-8026

Email:
jchaiser@wallyedgar.com

Located right off I-75 on M-24, 2 minutes N. of the Palace of Auburn Hills

SALES HOURS:
MONDAY - THURSDAY 8 AM - 8 PM • FRIDAY 8 AM - 6 PM

SATURDAY 9 AM - 3 PM • SUNDAY CLOSED

3805 LAPEER RD., LAKE ORION

Wally Edgar

2015 MALIBU LT
$146*PER MONTH
36MONTHS $999DOWN
10K LEASE

2015 EQUINOX LT
$146*PER MONTH
36MONTHS $999DOWN
10K LEASE

2015 VOLT
$228*PERMONTH
36MONTHS $999DOWN
10K LEASE

2014 CRUZE LT
$115*PER MONTH
36MONTHS $999DOWN
10K LEASE

CHATTANOOGA, Tenn. (AP) –
A labor group seeking to rival the
United Auto Workers at the Volk-
swagen plant in Tennessee says
it won’t submit its list of mem-
bers to the management until
next month.

Supporters of the American
Council of Employees told the
Chattanooga Times Free Press for
Dec. 14’s editions that they want
a voice under the new labor poli-
cy Volkswagen announced in No-
vember that requires a minimum
of 15 percent of workers to quali-
fy for regular meetings with man-
agement and access to plant
meeting space.

The UAW, which lost a narrow
union vote at the plant in Febru-
ary, submitted a list of its mem-
bers almost immediately after
the new policy was announced.
An independent auditor last
week verified that the union had
signed up at least 45 percent of
the workers at the plant.

That qualified the UAW for the
top tier of the company’s new la-
bor policy, the first time the
union has achieved a formal role
within a plant owned by a foreign
automaker in the South.

While the policy does not ad-
dress collective bargaining or ex-
clusive representation of work-
ers, the UAW has vowed to press
ahead to achieve those thresh-
olds.

The American Council of Em-
ployees was formed by workers
who opposed the UAW in the
February vote.

Leaders were unsuccessful in
their call for Volkswagen to ac-
cept only membership cards
signed after the new labor policy
was announced in November.
Those same leaders now argue
that the auditor counted several
UAW cards that were “inaccu-

rate, unreliable and out of date.”
Volkswagen worker Mike

Cantrell, the president of UAW
Local 42, has called those claims
as “bogus and without merit.”

“UAW Local 42 is moving for-
ward in collaborative talks with
Volkswagen and will not be dis-
tracted by this nonsense,” he
said.

Meanwhile at the Nissan Motor
Co. in Smyrna, The Daily News
Journal reported that union offi-
cials allege that more than half of
the plant’s 8,000-plus workers
are temporary employees.

“The majority of their work-
force is employed by a third-par-
ty agency with no commitment
whatsoever to the workers,” said
Mike Herron, chairman of the
UAW Local 1853 that represents
employees at the General Motors
factory in Spring Hill.

UAW has twice attempted to
unionize the 31-year-old Nissan
factory when it had a larger
makeup of direct employees, but
was unable to persuade the ma-
jority of the workers to agree to
the collective-bargaining repre-
sentation.

Nissan spokesman Justin Saia
declined to confirm or deny the
UAW assertion that more than 60
percent of the workforce at the
Smyrna car factory is temporary
employees with a company con-
tractor.

“We do not provide that level
of detail concerning the opera-
tions of our plants for propri-
etary reasons,” Saia said.

“However, the use of contract
workers (associates) is a com-
mon practice throughout the in-
dustry.

“We strive to maintain a level
of associate workers that is com-
plementary to these industry
standards.”

Labor Groups at Odds Over
Being VW Employees’ Voice



This Christmas, finding out
where Santa Claus is during his
famous holiday run will be a
push of a button away.

For the sixth consecutive year,
OnStar is providing U.S., Canada
and Mexico subscribers the op-
portunity to learn Santa’s where-
abouts on his journey across the
globe Christmas Eve.

With a press of the blue OnStar
button, subscribers can be in-
formed of Santa’s location at that
moment in time, said GM
spokesperson and jolly old elf
expert Stefan Cross.

Through collaboration with
the North American Aerospace
Defense Command’s (NORAD)
Track Santa program, anyone
with an active OnStar subscrip-
tion can request a “Santa Up-
date” between 7 a.m. on Dec. 24
and 5 a.m. EST on Dec. 25.

OnStar advisors will provide
Santa’s location based on NO-

RAD’s official Santa Tracker Map.
"My 2-year-old son has finally

reached the age where he is ex-
cited about Santa,” said Keitha
Martin, a GMC Acadia owner and
OnStar subscriber.

“This year, we will be following
Santa’s journey to deliver his
gifts through OnStar. My hus-
band and I are just as excited for
this magical experience.”

And for each Santa call re-
ceived, OnStar will donate a dol-
lar to United Way for Southeast-
ern Michigan.

“We are grateful to OnStar for
making United Way for South-
eastern Michigan the recipient of
dollars raised through the pro-
gram to chart Santa’s progress,”
said United Way for Southeast
Michigan president and CEO
Michael J. Brennan.

“We are pleased to be part of a
program that brings such delight

to so many during this holiday
season.”

OnStar is dedicated to the safe-
ty and security of subscribers
year-round.

To accommodate the volume
of calls seeking Santa’s location,
advisor staffing is adjusted,
Cross said.

“We are happy to provide our
subscribers with a special way to
get into the holiday spirit,” said
Terry Inch, OnStar chief operat-
ing officer.

“OnStar’s advisors enjoy re-
sponding to these calls and help-
ing make the season a little more
joyous.”

Individuals without an OnStar
subscription can follow Santa’s
journey via the NORAD Tracks
Santa website, Facebook page,
Twitter hashtag #NORADSanta or
by calling the hotline at 1-877-HI-
NORAD (1-877-446-6723).
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BELOW GM PRICING SALE • 0% UP TO 72 MONTHS ON MOST 2014 MODELS

LEASE PULLAHEAD AVAILABLE SEE SALESPERSON FOR DETAILS.

NEWVOLT

PURCHASE
FOR

$28,797*
LEASE FOR
36 MONTHS
$269*

$999DOWN

2014

NEWSILVERADO

PURCHASE A
2WD LS FOR

$25,774*
LEASE2WDLT
24 MONTHS
$168*

$999DOWN

2015

NEWCRUZE

PURCHASE A 1LS
FOR

$14,189*
LEASE 1LT
36 MONTHS
$129*

$999DOWN

2014

NEWMALIBU

PURCHASE
FOR

$17,495*
LEASE FOR
36 MONTHS
$129*

$999DOWN

2015

WE NEED YOUR TRADE-IN...MINIMUM $3500 FOR YOUR TRADE-IN GUARANTEED

SERVICE HOURS: Monday & Thursday 6:30am-9:00pm; Tuesday, Wednesday & Friday 6:30am-6:00pm • Shuttle at 6:30am - Pick-up Both Ways • All Day starting at 6:30am.

$2395
Fluid Level,

Brake & Alignment Check Included.

Open Mondays & Thursdays until 8:30pm

We use Genuine GM Oil & Filter
No additional or hidden charges.
Out the door pricing.

Quick Oil Change EXPRESS
LANELUBE OIL FILTER

Excludes synthetic, Diesel & Med. Duty Trucks.
Most GM cars & trucks. One coupon per customer. Must
present coupon with order. Plus tax. Expires 12-31-14.

Up to 5 qts.

BODY SHOP
586-754-7000

ext 1231

INSURANCE
WRECK

AMENDED

WE REPAIR
ALL MAKES
& MODELS FREE OIL CHANGE

With Each Major Repair

TRANSPORTATION AVAILABLE
During Scheduled Repairs

GM SERVICE CENTER
MICHIGAN’S LARGEST

•SERVICE DEPT. •PARTS •BODY SHOP

866-452-1547
26125 Van Dyke @ 101/2 Mile

Center Line, MI 48015

EDRINKE • FAST • FRIENDLY • DISCOUNTS

VISIT OUR

QUICK LANE

NEWVERANO

PURCHASE A 2014
FOR

$17,486*
LEASE FOR
36 MONTHS
$97*
$1,499DOWN

2015

NEWREGAL

PURCHASE A 2014
FOR

$22,675*
LEASE FOR
24 MONTHS
$139*

$999DOWN

2015

NEWLACROSSE

PURCHASE A 2014
FOR

$23,566*
LEASE FOR
24 MONTHS
$162*

$999DOWN

2015

NEWENCORE

PURCHASE
FOR

$17,996*
LEASE FOR
24 MONTHS
$97*
$1,499DOWN

2014

NEWTERRAIN

PURCHASE
FOR

$22,339*
LEASE SLE-1
24 MONTHS
$69*
$999DOWN

2015

NEWENCLAVE

PURCHASE
FOR

$28,649*
LEASE FOR
39 MONTHS
$144*
$1,499DOWN

2015

NEWACADIA

PURCHASE
FOR

$28,597*
LEASE SLE-1
24 MONTHS
$134*

$999DOWN

2015

NEWTRAVERSE

PURCHASE
FOR

$25,728*
LEASE FOR
24 MONTHS
$139*

$999DOWN

2015

NEWEQUINOX

PURCHASE A LS
FOR

$20,187*
LEASE LT
24 MONTHS
$79*
$999DOWN

2015

NEWCAMARO

PURCHASE A 2014
FOR

$17,991*
LEASE FOR
39 MONTHS
$198*

$999DOWN

2015

NEW IMPALA

LEASE FOR
39 MONTHS
$209*

$999DOWN

2015

Now looking for experienced salespeople to join our team!

PURCHASE
FOR

$20,273*

Must
Terminate

Non-GM Lease

NEWSIERRA

PURCHASE A 2014
FOR

$19,923*
LEASE FOR
39 MONTHS
$178*

$999DOWN

2015

DBL. CAB
1500
2WD

1LT

LS 1LS 1LS

Nicole
Dodge

nhuminski@edrinke.com
Find Us on

FACEBOOK

NO DOC
FEES See us for your GM employee purchases.

1-877-451-7707
26125 Van Dyke at 101/2 Mile Rd.

Visit our website: edrinke.com
SHOWROOM HOURS: Mon. & Thurs. 8:30am-9:00pm; Tues., Wed., & Fri. 8:30am-6:00pm

All applicable rebates including lease/conquestoffershavebeendeducted fromsaleprice/payment.Picturesmaynot representactual vehicle. Pricessubject tochangeperGM
incentives. Prices and payments are inclusive of active GM Employee Discount (Unless otherwise stated). Below GM Pricing only valid on certian 2014models and excludes
2015models.Malibu, Impala,CruzeandVolt are36month leases. Equinox,SilveradoandTraverseare24month leases. ImpalaandCamaroare39month leases.All leasesare
10k miles per year w/ approved S Tier credit w/ $999 due at signing. Prices & payments are plus tax, title, and plate fees with acquisition fee up front. Refundable security
deposit required on certain vehicles –to be determined by lender. For Silverado,must trade in ’99 or newermodel vehicle. GM Employee discount to everyone valid on certain
models. $3500 trade-in is valid on2004or newer vehicleswith under 115kmiles in drivable condition,nobranded titles,see sales person for details. **Certain restrictionsmay
apply, see dealer for complete details. Expiration Date – 1/2/15.

Jim
Pfeifle

jpfeifle@edrinke.com

Dennis
Thacker

dthacker@edrinke.com

See us for your GM employee purchases.

1-866-452-1300
26125 Van Dyke at 101/2 Mile Rd.

Visit our website: edrinke.com
SHOWROOM HOURS: Mon. & Thurs. 8:30am-9:00pm; Tues., Wed., & Fri. 8:30am-6:00pm

All prices and payments include GM rebates. Pictures may not represent actual vehicle. Prices subject to change per GM incentives. Prices and payments are inclusive of active GM
employee discount (unless otherwise stated). All leases are 10,000 miles per year with approved S Tier credit w/ $999 down (unless otherwise noted). Must have lease loyalty and/or
conquest. Must have closing competitive lease. For Sierra, must trade in ’99 or newer model vehicle. Prices and payments are plus tax, title, plate fee w/ acquisition fee up front,
refundable securitydeposit requiredoncertain vehicles– tobedeterminedby lender.GMemployeediscount toeveryonevalidoncertainmodels. $3,500 trade in is validon2004ornewer
vehiclesw/ under 115kmiles in drivable condition,no branded titles. See salesperson for details. ** Certain restrictionsmay apply, see dealer for complete details. Exp date:1/2/2015. Paul

Makowski
pmakowski@edrinke.com

ED RINKE We Are Professional Grade

HOLIDAY
EVENT
UNTIL 1/5/15

WE DO HOUSE CALLS OR COME SEE US…
Before You Trade-In or Sell Your Car

Buyer & Seller of Clean Vehicles Since 1975!

248.332.8326
1153 Baldwin Rd • Pontiac • www.jimdouglasautosales.com

You’ll Get Your Tax Break
Plus 100’s if not 1,000’s More

Where’s Santa? OnStar Will Let You Know

FordDirect, a joint venture be-
tween Ford Motor Company and
its franchised dealers, appointed
Jeff Forrester as director of Pur-
chasing, a position within the
newly created department at
FordDirect.

In his role, Forrester will be
primarily responsible for vendor
management and contracts,
working with internal teams to
achieve cost reductions, quality
maintenance, policy compliance
and risk mitigation while driving
business objectives. As head of
the department, Forrester will
report to Beth Hill, general coun-
sel and chief compliance officer.

“As a practical, experienced
executive who has successfully
managed large, complex transac-
tions, Jeff is well-positioned to
lead and shape the new purchas-
ing department,” said Stacey
Coopes, FordDirect CEO.

“As FordDirect continues its
growth, his expertise in purchas-
ing and procurement will be in-
strumental to the company’s
success and long-term sustain-
ability.”

Forrester has deep automotive
experience, Coopes said, having
worked for both automotive sup-
pliers and OEMs, including Ford
Motor Company. Prior to joining
FordDirect, he was a senior buy-
er at General Motors where he
was responsible for the procure-
ment of commodities, including
technology and telecommunica-
tions.

In addition to his automotive
experience, Forrester, said
Coopes, has extensive strategic
and tactical experience in
vendor risk management, con-
tract negotiations, business
process outsourcing, insourcing,
RFPs/RFQs, SOW development,
contract management and
process reform.

Forrester Named
Purchasing Head
At FordDirect

DAYTON, Ohio (AP) – A Chi-
nese company is beginning to
hire at an automotive glass-mak-
ing plant in southwest Ohio ex-
pected to revitalize a former
General Motors factory site.

Fuyao (FWEE’-ow) Glass Indus-
try Group Co. paid $15 million
for the former auto plant in
Moraine and plans a $230 million
investment.

The Dayton Daily News reports
the company announced plans
to fill 430 salaried and produc-
tion jobs by spring. The compa-
ny hopes to have 630 employees
in place by the end of next year
and eventually employee 800 to
1,000 people.

The plant will primarily pro-
duce windshields, sunroofs and
side windows.

Former GM Plant
Site of Glass Firm
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by TOM KRISHER
AP Auto Writer

DETROIT (AP) – United Auto
Workers President Dennis
Williams says he’s not buying
the Detroit Three automakers’
argument against wage increases
for longtime workers.

Williams told reporters at a
meeting last week that keeping
Detroit competitive with foreign
automakers can’t always be
done on the backs of workers.
But he concedes that the compa-
nies’ costs must remain competi-
tive.

Both sides will have to bal-
ance the competing interests
when contract talks open with
Fiat Chrysler, Ford and General
Motors this summer.

Williams, who replaced Bob
King as president in June,
conceded that rank-and-file
factory workers want to share
more of the auto companies’
profits with an annual wage
increase.

He said companies talk only
about workers when they speak
of being competitive.

“That’s not the only way to do
it,” Williams said. “There’s
processes in which they can do
better. There’s quality issues,
warranty issues.”

Longtime UAW workers have
not had an hourly pay raise
since 2007, although they have
received hefty annual profit-
sharing checks that equal about
$4 per hour. But there’s no guar-
antee of getting checks every
year.

Entry-level workers who are
paid about half of what veterans
make got a pay raise in the 2011
contract talks.

Williams also said he is com-
mitted to “start bridging” the
gap between entry level wages,
which run from about $16 per
hour to just over $19, and wages
for longtime workers of about
$29 per hour.

But the automakers say the
entry-level wages are what keeps
them competitive and they don’t
want them to end.

Detroit automakers also say
their costs are on the rise, and
there’s a growing gap between
them and foreign automakers’
labor costs.

They want to address the gap
and other issues in the upcom-
ing talks.

Williams also said he’s already
talking to the companies about
removing recall costs from the
profit-sharing formula. A record
spate of recalls this year, espe-
cially at General Motors, will cut
into the workers’ checks next
year.

Union Balks as
Contract Talks
Loom in Summer

PORTAGE, Ind. (AP) – A South-
field company that makes auto-
motive seating and electrical dis-
tribution systems has an-
nounced plans to spend $7.3 mil-
lion to lease and equip a new
93,000-square-foot facility in
northwestern Indiana.

Lear Corp. says it plans to cre-
ate up to 96 jobs at the facility in
Portage, 30 miles east of Chica-
go. Lear says the facility will al-
low the company to increase
storage space, optimize produc-
tion requirements and meet in-
creased industry demand for
Ford Explorer seat systems.

Lear has about 1,200 full-time
employees in Indiana. It plans to
begin hiring production assem-
blers in April.

The Indiana Economic Devel-
opment Corporation offered
Lear Corporation up to $675,000
in conditional tax credits based
on its job-creation plans. The
city of Portage approved addi-
tional incentives.

Lear to Create 96
Jobs in Indiana



Ford showed the world what
the future will bring when the
automaker introduced SYNC 3.

The new communications and
entertainment system, Ford says,
is faster, more intuitive and
easier to use with enhanced re-
sponse to driver commands.

SYNC 3’s more conversational
voice recognition technology, a
more smartphone-like touch
screen and easy-to-read graphics
will help millions of drivers con-
nect with their lives and control
their smartphone while on the
road.

Ford spokesperson Alan Hall
said that the SYNC 3 was devel-
oped with an unprecedented
amount of customer input.

“We defined the performance
specs and feature set based on
the public’s expectations for a
next-generation system,” Hall
said.

The next-generation system
builds on the capability of SYNC
technology already in more than
10 million SYNC-equipped vehi-
cles on the road globally, said
Hall.

SYNC 3 begins arriving on new
vehicles next year.

“Ford is delivering an easier
way for customers to stay con-
nected,” said Raj Nair, Ford chief
technical officer and group vice
president, Global Product Devel-
opment.

“SYNC 3 is another step for-
ward in delivering connectivity
features customers most want,
and they tell us this kind of tech-
nology is an important part of
their decision to buy our vehi-
cles.”

Ford took a customer-centric
approach in developing SYNC 3,
drawing on 22,000 customer
comments and suggestions, said
Nair, plus insights gleaned from
research clinics, market surveys
and tech industry benchmarking.

“SNYC has definitely driven
increases in purchase considera-
tion and satisfaction with prod-
ucts,” Hall said. “Over 70 percent
of SYNC owners report that it
played a critical or important
role in their vehicle purchase
decision.”

Although SYNC 3 is optimized
for hands-free use, an all-new
touch screen delivers an experi-
ence similar to a smartphone or
tablet.

Quicker response to touch as
well as voice commands and
smartphone-like gestures includ-
ing pinch-to-zoom and swipe are
central to SYNC 3, along with
“crisp, modern graphics,” Hall
said.

A bright background and large
buttons with high-contrast fonts
for daytime use help reduce
screen washout in the sun.

At night, the display automati-
cally switches to a dark back-
ground to help reduce eye fa-
tigue and minimize reflections on
the windows.

“We considered all the modern
smartphones and mobile operat-
ing systems and created some-
thing familiar but unique,” said
Parrish Hanna, Ford global direc-
tor of Human Machine Interface.

SYNC 3 reduces on-screen
complexity and prioritizes the
control options customers use
most, Hall said. The home screen
features three zone choices –
Navigation, Audio and Phone.
Tile-like icons dominate the
screen, with a quick access func-
tion tray along the bottom mak-
ing for a more straightforward
user experience.

Phone contacts are searchable
via a simple swipe of the finger to
scroll through the alphabet. With
“One Box Search,” SYNC 3 users
can look up points of interest or
enter addresses in much the
same way they use an Internet
search engine.

“Simplicity has value,” said
Hanna. “Reducing the number of
things on-screen also makes con-
trol easier and is designed to
limit the number of times a
driver has to glance at the
screen.”

The new SYNC minimizes the
number of steps needed to carry
out a command, Hanna said.
With SYNC 3, simply saying,
“play song, artist, album or
genre” prompts the system to
play the desired song, artist,
playlist or album; there is no

need to identify the desired cate-
gory. To switch back to a radio
station, the user just says the
name of the SiriusXM station or
terrestrial radio station number.

Voice search results are en-
hanced by a better understand-
ing of how consumers refer to
businesses and points of interest,
Hanna said. Drivers don’t have to
know an exact name.

They can search for “Detroit
Airport” rather than using the of-
ficial name, “Detroit Metropolitan
Airport.” With addresses, they
can say, “Eleven Twenty-Five
Main Street” instead of “One One
Two Five Main Street.”

When connected to an Apple
iPhone, SYNC 3 offers seamless
integration of Siri Eyes-Free con-
trol. Drivers can seek Siri’s help
by holding down SYNC’s “Push to
Talk” steering wheel button –
much as they would hold down
the button on an iPhone to initi-
ate a Siri session.

AppLink allows customers to
connect their smartphone to
their vehicle and control their
compatible apps using voice
commands or buttons on the ve-
hicle display screen. AppLink
now automatically discovers
smartphone apps including
Spotify, Pandora, Stitcher, NPR
One, SiriusXM Radio and

iHeartRadio Auto, and displays
their unique graphics and brand-
ing.

Music and news apps are auto-
matically displayed along with
other media sources, just like
AM/FM or SiriusXM.

“Overall, AppLink is faster,
more responsive and easier to
find your apps,” said Julius
Marchwicki, Ford global product
manager, AppLink. “The overall
design of SYNC 3 allows for bet-
ter integration with smartphones
– resulting in a more user-friend-
ly experience.”

Developers easily can inte-
grate branded apps into
AppLink, providing Ford cus-
tomers with an experience on the
vehicle screen similar to what
they see on smartphone screens.

SYNC 3 also features the new
ability to update the software via

Wi-Fi. Once a vehicle is set up
with credentials for a home Wi-Fi
network accessible in a cus-
tomer’s driveway or garage, for
example, it can automatically
download updates.

SYNC 3, like earlier genera-
tions of the technology, provides
subscription-free emergency
service 911 Assist.

The customer’s Bluetooth-con-
nected phone is used to dial 911
in the event of a significant acci-
dent, alerting first-responders
with the vehicle’s location.

With SYNC 3, the car relays ad-
ditional information, including if
airbags were deployed, the type
of crash (front, side, rear or
rollover) and the number of safe-
ty belts detected in use, in order
to help emergency call takers dis-
patch the appropriate resources
to the scene.
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‘Ford is Delivering an Easier Way for
Customers to Stay Connected’ – VP Raj Nair

Ford’s SNYC 3 screen

William E. Kennard has been
elected to Ford Motor Compa-
ny’s board of directors, effective
Jan. 1.

In addition, long-time Ford
board member Dr. Homer Neal
has elected to leave the board,
effective Dec. 31, after serving 18
years.

Kennard, 57, is the former
chairman of the U.S. Federal
Communications Commission
(FCC) and former U.S. Ambassa-
dor to the European Union.

He currently is chairman and
co-founder of Velocitas Partners,
an asset management firm, and a
member of the Operating Execu-
tive Board of Staple Street Capi-
tal, a private equity firm.

He serves on the boards of di-
rectors of AT&T Inc., MetLife and
Duke Energy Corporation.

“Bill has a wealth of experi-
ence, particularly in telecommu-
nications, where he has spent
years shaping policy and pio-
neering initiatives to improve the
benefits of technology for con-
sumers worldwide,” said Ford ex-
ecutive chairman Bill Ford.

“As we accelerate our work in
the areas of in-car connectivity
and mobility, his unique perspec-
tive will help guide our strategy
and Blueprint for Mobility for-
ward.”

Kennard will serve on the Ford
board of directors’ Nominating
and Governance Committee.

His career spans more than
three decades in law, telecommu-
nications and private equity. Be-
fore his appointment as FCC
chairman in 1997, Kennard

served as the FCC’s general
counsel from 1993 to 1997.

As U.S. Ambassador to the Eu-
ropean Union from 2009 to 2013,
he worked to eliminate regulato-
ry barriers to commerce and to
promote transatlantic trade, in-
vestment and job creation.

In addition to his public serv-
ice, Kennard was from 2001 to
2009 a managing director of The
Carlyle Group, where he led the
firm’s investments in the
telecommunications and media
sectors.

He also has served on several
boards in the fields of telecom-
munications and media, insur-
ance and energy, as well as on
the boards of various nonprofit
organizations.

He currently serves as a Fellow
of the Yale Corporation and
is a member of Secretary of
State John Kerry’s Foreign Affairs
Policy Board.

Ford Elects New Board Member

William E. Kennard
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Call Toll Free:

New
Saturday Hours:
Sales 10am-3pm &
Service 8am-2pm

HOURS: Mon/Thurs 8:30am-8pm
Tue/Wed/Fri 8:30am-6pm

800-710-3857
OPEN SATURDAY!

3800 S. Lapeer Rd., LAKE ORION

YOUR OFFICIAL CHRYSLER JEEP • DODGE LEASE TURN-IN HEADQUARTERS

SCAN
ME

CHECK YOUR
TRADE IN
VALUE HERE

*We make car buying fun at Milosch’s Palace. Please call to schedule an appointment for a demonstration drive. All rebates to dealer. Deals apply to stock
units only. Must be a Chrysler employee. $1995 down, plus destination, taxes, title, plates. Must be Chrysler Employee. $500 Military and TDM included.
Lease calculated at 10,000 miles per year. Vehicle shown not actual vehicle. WAC. See dealer for details. **Lease and prepay examples are plus destina-
tion, taxes, title, plates, $0 sec. deposit required. Includes Conquest Trade-in and must be Chrysler Employee. Programs subject to change. †On select mod-
els. See dealer for details. Expiration date is 12/31/14.

YOUR OFFICIAL CHRYSLER • JEEP • DODGE LEASE TURN-IN HEADQUARTERS

2014 CHRYSLER
TOWN & COUNTRY
TOURING
L

EMPLOYEE 1 PAY 27 MONTH
LEASE STARTING FROM
$3987*

27 MO. LEASE ONLY
$169*mo.

2014 CHRYSLER
300 S

EMPLOYEE 1 PAY 27 MONTH
LEASE STARTING FROM
$3987*

27 MO. LEASE
$89*mo.

2015 JEEP
GRAND CHEROKEE
LAREDO
4X4

SALE PRICE
$27,760*

27 MO. LEASE ONLY
$259*mo.

ALL NEW 2015 JEEP
CHEROKEE LATITUDE
4X4

39 MO. LEASE ONLY
$195*mo.

ALL NEW 2015
DODGE JOURNEY
RTAWD

27 MO. LEASE ONLY
$179*mo.

2014 DODGE
CHARGER R/T

EMPLOYEE 1 PAY 27 MONTH
LEASE STARTING FROM
$2988*

27 MO. LEASE ONLY
$99*mo.

2014 RAM
CREW CAB 4X4

BIG HORN

EMPLOYEE 1 PAY 27 MONTH
LEASE STARTING FROM
$3587*

27 MO. LEASE ONLY
$149*mo.

2015 CHRYSLER
200 LIMITED

SALE PRICE
$18,927*

27 MO. LEASE ONLY
$132*mo.
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