
A wide-eyed 4-year-old boy
visited a memorable attraction in
1964, when the Ford Mustang
was introduced to the world.

Today, that boy is Ford Motor
Company’s chief operating offi-
cer.

The COO, Mark Fields, recalls
the New York World’s Fair, held
in Queens that year, but can’t re-
member the intro. (After all, he
was only 4.)

He does remember, however,
that his dad lifted him onto his
shoulders “to get a look at the
new Mustang.”

Fields related that story in his
opening speech at the New York
Auto Show last week.

He said it was 50 years ago that
Ford introduced the Mustang – a
car that would have a profound im-
pact on the auto industry.

Fields said the vehicle was on
display at that World’s Fair – an
event that attracted 51 million
visitors to the Queens site.

Ford wasn’t the only innovat-
ing company to have displays at
the fair, he said.

“What’s striking about the
1964 World’s Fair is that many of
the innovations we saw there
were phenomenally successful,
and are still with us today,”
Fields said.

“IBM was there, showing new
ideas in character recognition
and giving the public the chance
to personally interact with a
computer for the very first time.

“Disney was there, wowing vis-
itors with pioneering animatron-
ics, an elevated roadway for
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‘We’ll Have Best Range in Our History,’ Says GM’s Reuss
Talk about adding muscle to

the lineup.
With the introduction of the

2015 Corvette Z06 Convertible,
Chevrolet now offers enthusiasts
14 distinct performance-car mod-
els – including nine Camaro mod-
els, the SS performance sedan
and four Corvette models.

Output ranges from 323 to an
estimated 625 horsepower.

“Chevrolet has been America’s
best-selling performance brand
for four consecutive years, due in
part to the breadth of our line-
up,” said Mark Reuss, GM’s exec-
utive vice president, Global Prod-
uct Development.

“For 2015, we will have the
best range in our history, offering
a performance car for virtually
every enthusiast, from the 30-
mpg Camaro LS and the COPO
Camaro drag car to the 625-
horsepower Corvette Z06 Con-
vertible supercar.”

The 2015 Chevrolet lineup of
performance cars includes the
new Corvette Stingray, which is
built on a new aluminum chassis
and features a new 6.2L V8 rated
at 455 horsepower.

Chevy spokesman Monte Do-
ran said the Stingray backs its
performance capability with the
greatest efficiency of any sports
car with at least 450 horsepower:
an EPA-estimated 17 mpg city
driving and 29 mpg on the high-

way with its seven-speed manual
transmission. A new eight-speed
paddle-shift automatic transmis-
sion will be offered in 2015.

The new Z06 Coupe and Con-
vertible join the lineup for 2015,
Doran said. The new Z06, he
added, delivers “supercar” levels
of performance and technology,
including at least 625 horsepow-
er and 635 lb.-ft. of torque from
an all-new supercharged engine,
and true aerodynamic downforce
for high-speed stability.

The Z06 Coupe is the most ca-
pable Corvette in the brand’s his-
tory, Doran said, recording the
fastest lap of any production car
ever tested at GM’s Milford Road
Course test track.

He said the Z06 Convertible
will be “one of the most capable
convertibles on the market” –
matching the coupe model – with
0-60 acceleration in less than 3.5
seconds.

The Chevrolet SS, Chevy’s first
V8-powered, rear-drive perform-
ance sedan since 1996, is based
on a “race-proven, global plat-
form that underpins” the Ca-
maro, and, in Australia, the high-
performance Holden VF Com-
modore, Doran said.

Lightweight aluminum hood
and deck lid panels contribute to
a nearly 50/50 weight balance,
while the performance of the SS’s
415-hp/415-lb.-ft. 6.2L V8 enables

0 to 60 mph sprints in 5 seconds
flat.

The Camaro lineup starts with
the 323-horsepower V6-powered
coupe and convertible, which,
Doran said, match performance
with efficiency – including up to
30 mpg on the highway for the
2LS coupe model – and a suggest-
ed starting price of $23,555 not

including tax, title and dealership
fees.

The SS coupe and convertible
come with Chevy’s “legendary”
small-block V8, featuring a 6.2L
engine delivering up to 426
horsepower, and 0-60 accelera-
tion in 4.5 seconds, Doran said.

The Camaro 1LE is the most af-
fordable, track-capable Camaro

in the lineup, starting at $37,350,
Doran said. The model is offered
only on SS coupes with a manual
transmission and optimized for
the track with unique gearing,
suspension tuning and tires that
make it capable of more than 1 g
in cornering grip.

CONTINUED ON PAGE 3

™TechCenterNews™

VOL. 38 NO. 33 APRIL 21, 2014Covers the Tech Center and the Immediate Area

WARREN, MICHIGAN

Go to TechCenterNews.com for this week’s edition

info@techcenternews.com

Chevrolet boasts a full lineup of performance cars, including the new Corvette ZO6 Convertible (foreground).

New York Auto Show Adds Excitement to Big Apple

The Chevy Trax made its
debut at the New York Interna-
tional Auto Show last week.

The Trax is a new small SUV
designed to offer versatility, con-
nectivity and turbocharged per-
formance in an efficient package,
said Chevy spokesperson Leslie
Rajewski.

Chevrolet Trax was launched
in late 2012 in Mexico and Cana-
da as a 2013 model. Since then,
about 90,000 have been sold in
more than 60 global markets.

The 2015 Trax is currently on
sale in China, and will arrive in
U.S. dealer showrooms early next

year, adding the small SUV to
Chevy’s two largest markets.

The new car will be based on a
Gamma II platform and produced
in South Korea and Mexico.

Trax is named after a 2007 con-
cept vehicle.

“The Trax blends small-car
agility with the utility of an SUV,
including up to 48.4 cubic feet of
cargo space,” Rajewski said.

“It’s Chevrolet’s seventh small-
vehicle launch in less than four
years.”

Alan Batey, General Motors
senior vice president of Global
Chevrolet, said, “Trax offers cus-

tomers another option in the
Chevrolet family and will be a
strong competitor in the emerg-
ing small-SUV market, which is
expected to grow more than 80
percent by 2016.

“Trax also leverages our global
resources and builds on Chevro-
let’s strong SUV heritage.”

When it arrives in dealer show-
rooms early next year, Trax will
have available OnStar 4G LTE and
built-in Wi-Fi hotspot, as well as
MyLink technology featuring the
segment’s only seven-inch color

2015 Chevy Trax Coming to America 

The 2015 Alfa Romeo 4C, at its
American debut last week,
showed a dash of Italian style in
the North American market.

The vehicle, introduced at the
New York Auto Show, is a mid-en-
gine design inspired by the
brand’s racing history, aimed at
delivering supercar-level per-
formance, said Chrysler
spokesperson Jiyan Cadiz.

Features include a state-of-the-
art carbon fiber monocoque and
all-aluminum turbocharged en-
gine influenced by Formula 1,
and advanced technological so-
lutions.

“The all-new Alfa Romeo 4C de-
livers supercar-level perform-
ance in its most elemental form,”
said Harald Wester, president
and CEO of Alfa Romeo.

“With its ultra-lightweight ma-
terials and technological solu-
tions derived directly from mo-
torsports, a mid-engine propor-

tion for maximum agility and pur-
poseful styling cues to enhance
performance – the all-new 4C
coupe marks Alfa Romeo’s return
to sports cars and the brand’s re-
turn to North America.”

For the Alfa Romeo brand, the
new 4C represents the “essential
sportiness embedded in the

brand’s DNA,” said Wester. “It
has  Italian style, performance
and technical excellence, for
maximum driving pleasure in
complete safety.”

The Alfa Romeo 4C is inspired
by the century-old tradition of

Alfa Romeo 4C Introduced at Auto Show

2015 Alfa Romeo 4C

CONTINUED ON PAGE 6

Innovation is Key to Growth,
Says Ford COO Mark Fields
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Chevy execs expect Trax to be “strong competitor in small-SUV market.”
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by TOM KRISHER
AP Auto Writer

DETROIT (AP) – General Mo-
tors revealed in court filings last
week that it will soon ask a feder-
al bankruptcy judge to shield the
company from legal claims for
conduct that occurred before its
2009 bankruptcy.

The automaker's strategy is in
a motion filed in a Corpus
Christi, Texas, federal court case,
and in other cases across the
U.S. that involve the defective
ignition switches that have led
GM to recall 2.6 million small
cars.

The motion asks U.S. District
Judge Nelva Gonzales Ramos to
delay action on the lawsuit until
the bankruptcy court rules and
other federal courts decide if the
case should be combined with
other lawsuits.

But GM says it’s not asking to
halt action on a motion to force
GM to tell customers not to
drive their cars that are being re-
called.

GM has said at least 13 deaths
have been linked to the switch
problem.

The switch can unexpectedly
slip out of the “run” position,
shutting down the engine, knock-
ing out power-assisted steering
and power brakes, and disabling
the air bags.

GM admits knowing about the
problem for at least a decade,
but it didn’t start recalling the

cars, including Chevrolet Co-
balts and Saturn Ions, until Feb-
ruary.

The company’s motion says
GM will ask the bankruptcy court
in New York to enforce an order
made during the 2009 bank-
ruptcy case that split GM into a
new company and an old compa-
ny.

Claims from before the bank-
ruptcy would go to “Old GM,”
called Motors Liquidation Co.,
while claims after the bankrupt-
cy would go to the new General
Motors Co.

“Just like the other ‘ignition
switch actions’ that other plain-
tiffs have filed in the wake of pub-
lic reports regarding the out-
standing recall, this case relates
to a vehicle designed, manufac-
tured, originally sold and adver-
tised by Old GM,” the company’s
motion says.

GM’s motion says more than
30 cases have been filed against

the company since February.
With the motion, GM is trying

to limit its legal liability in the
cases while at the same time it
considers compensation for fam-
ilies of crash victims.

GM has hired Kenneth Fein-
berg – who handled the fund for
the victims of the Sept. 11, 2001,
terrorist attacks, the Boston
Marathon bombing and the BP
oil spill in the Gulf of Mexico – to
explore ways to compensate vic-
tims.

No decision has been made.
Attorney Robert Hilliard filed

the Texas lawsuit on behalf of
Charles and Grace Silvas.

It claims they are stuck with a
defective 2006 Chevrolet Cobalt
and seeks repairs, compensation
for loss of value and alternative
transportation.

Hilliard called GM's motion to
send the case to the bankruptcy
court a “long shot” and accused
GM CEO Mary Barra of directing
lawyers to hide behind the bank-
ruptcy.

He said he expects a ruling
soon on the request for an order
for GM to tell owners to keep the
recalled cars off the road.

GM has said owners can con-
tinue safely using the cars if pre-
cautions are taken.
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General Motors has named
John J. Quattrone as senior vice
president, Global Human Re-
sources.

Quattrone, currently executive
director of Human Resources for
GM’s Global Product Development,
Purchasing and Supply Chain or-
ganizations, succeeds Melissa A.
Howell who is leaving GM to pur-
sue other interests, said GM
spokesperson Greg Martin.

GM also announced that Selim
Bingol, senior vice president, Glob-
al Communications and Public
Policy, is leaving the company to
pursue other interests.

Quattrone’s appointment and
Howell’s and Bingol’s departures
are effective immediately, Martin
said.

Quattrone, a native of Syra-
cuse, N.Y., began his GM career
in 1975 at the Fisher Body Syra-
cuse Plant. Since then, he has
held various positions in Human
Resources and Labor Relations
at GM.

Quattrone was appointed gen-
eral director of Human Re-

sources for North America Vehi-
cle Sales, Service and Marketing
in September 1996.

He was appointed GM North
America’s vice president of Hu-
man Resources in 2001 and was
GM Powertrain’s vice president
of Human Resources prior to his
current assignment.

“John brings to the job a deep
and rich breadth of experience
across all levels of the enter-
prise,” said GM CEO Mary Barra.
“This background is invaluable
as we create lasting change that
puts the customer at the center
of how we work and how we
measure ourselves going for-
ward.”

Quattrone received his Bache-
lor of Science degree from Le
Moyne College and earned a Mas-
ter of Science degree from West
Virginia University.

He serves on the board of di-
rectors of the American Society
of Employers and previously
served on the board of directors
of Health Grades, Inc.

Barra praised Howell’s contri-

bution at a key time for the com-
pany.

“Through Melissa’s passion,
the values that make up today’s
GM are now becoming a central
part of how we develop and
guide our employees around the
world,” said Barra.

“We are deeply grateful for her
dedication to GM and all that she
did to help build a stronger HR
function to support our people
and business.”

Howell joined GM in 1990. She
was named senior vice president,
Global Human Resources in Feb-
ruary 2013.

Bingol was senior vice presi-
dent for Corporate Communica-
tions at AT&T before joining GM
in 2010 as senior vice president
of Global Communications.

Global Public Policy was
added to Bingol’s portfolio in Oc-
tober 2012.

During his tenure, Bingol guid-
ed the communications around
GM’s 2010 initial public offering,
the largest in history at that time,

He also led the introduction of

several new products that have
received widespread acclaim for
quality, styling, and perfor-
mance.

“We appreciate Selim’s service
and for his helping tell the GM
story during one of the most ex-
citing periods in the company's
history,” said Barra.

A successor to Bingol will be
named later, Martin said.

Quattrone Named Senior VP, GM Global Human Resources

John J. Quattrone

GM to Ask Court to Move Ignition Switch Claims to ‘Old GM’

Lingenfelter Performance En-
gineering will be hosting a regu-
lar weekend coffee series start-
ing May 3 and running through
Sept. 20.

Car enthusiasts are invited to
the Saturday morning “Lingenfel-
ter Cars & Coffee” series

Each Saturday, from 8 a.m. to
10 a.m., Lingenfelter’s North En-
gine Build Facility in Wixom will
open its doors and parking to
the public, said company
spokesperson Chris Morrisroe.

Tim Horton’s Cafe & Bake
Shop will be on hand serving up
fresh coffee and baked goods,
Morrisroe said.

“It is no surprise that Michi-
gan, home to the Motor City, has
an incredible number of people
that are interested in new and
exciting changes in the world of
cars,” said Kristen Lingenfelter.

“We think that our Saturday
morning ‘Cars & Coffee’ events
will be the perfect opportunity
to make some new friends and to
visit with our supporters and
customers.”

Car lovers are welcome to
stop by and enjoy the company
of others, Lingenfelter said, and
to see the latest and greatest in
performance cars from Lingen-
felter Performance Engineering.

Tours of the Lingenfelter
Wixom Build and dyno testing fa-
cility will also be available.

Although there is no fee to
participate in the weekly events,
Lingenfelter said, guests are en-
couraged to bring a donation of
nonperishable food items to be
donated to Gleaners Community
Food Bank.

“Lingenfelter Cars & Coffee
will be held rain or shine and will
feature special guests and cars
from the Lingenfelter Collection
throughout the summer,” Lingen-
felter said.

Updates will be posted on the
Lingenfelter Facebook page and
website: www.lingenfeltercollec-
tion.com. The meetings are at
47451 Avante Drive, Wixom, just
off of I-96 and Beck Road.

Performance Car
Enthusiasts to

Visit Lingenfelter
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Buick Achievers Scholarship
recipient and Spelman College
senior Nartezya Dykes was hon-
ored during the United Negro
College Fund’s 35th annual “An
Evening of Stars” telecast on
April 13.

The ceremony celebrated stu-
dent excellence and rising gradu-
ation rates among minorities,
said GM Foundation spokesper-
son Maria Mainville.

The annual “Evening of Stars”
telecast aims to inspire other stu-
dents to graduate from college,
Mainville said.

As longstanding supporters of
UNCF, General Motors and the
General Motors Foundation have
donated more than $15 million to
the organization over the last
two decades to make college
more accessible, affordable and
attainable for minorities and
other outstanding students.

Part of the support for the
UNCF comes through the Buick
Achievers Scholarship Program,
funded by the GM Foundation.

As one of the largest scholar-

ship programs in the country,
Buick Achievers focuses on
awarding scholarships to female,
minority and other students who
excel in the classroom and give
back to their communities.

The Foundation works with
UNCF to help administer the pro-
gram for students that attend
historically black colleges and
universities.

In addition to Dykes, two other
Buick Achievers – Oneisha Hall
from Tuskegee University and
Ty’Quish Keyes from Morehouse
College – attended the taping of
the “An Evening of Stars” broad-
cast, as well as the UNCF Empow-
er Me Tour recently held at More-
house, Mainville said.

“For 70 years, UNCF has been
changing the face of education to
help African-American high
school students go to college,”
said GM Foundation president Vi-
vian Pickard.

“More than ever, students need
a college degree to compete and
succeed, and by providing ac-
cess to significant scholarships,

we’re investing in tomorrow’s
leaders.”

Since its inception in 2011, the
Buick Achievers Scholarship Pro-
gram has awarded nearly $16.5
million to about 3,300 students,
Mainville said.

Among these students, nearly
one-third are African American
or Hispanic and, like Dykes, more
than 1,600 recipients are the first
in their family to attend college.

“This scholarship has opened

so many doors for me and my
family,” said Dykes, who is pur-
suing a degree in computer sci-
ence.

“It has allowed me to focus
solely on receiving the best edu-
cation possible. I’m setting the
standard and inspiring others in
my family to reach their full po-
tential by pursuing a higher ed-
ucation.”

To be eligible for the program,
high school seniors and under-
graduate students must be pur-
suing a college degree in science,
technology, engineering, math
(STEM) curricula, or other fields
related to the automotive indus-
try, Mainville said.

Some things old are getting
new again at Macomb Communi-
ty College.

The State of Michigan has au-
thorized $4.25 million in funding
to support an $8.5 million reno-
vation of a 47-year-old building
on the college’s South Campus.

And, the college will use its
capital projects fund to match
the state’s financial commitment.

“While capital outlay appropri-
ations are typically sought to
fund new construction projects,
Macomb looked at the process
as an opportunity to not only be
fiscally responsible but to also
maximize impact by renovating
rather than building,” said Col-
lege President James Jacobs.

“This approach underscores
our ongoing commitment to mak-
ing the most of limited financial
resources and maintaining af-
fordability for students, while
continuing to invest in the lead-
ing-edge education and training
programs that position residents
for success in the New Econo-
my.”

The project will update C
Building on South Campus,
which was initially built in two
phases and completed in 1967
and 1969, said school spokesper-
son Jeanne Nicol.

The approximately 53,000-
square-foot building houses busi-
ness administration, information
technology (IT), health and hu-
manities programs.

While the building has under-
gone minor renovations, repairs
and general maintenance over
the years, all building systems
are mechanically and electrically

outdated, and technology and its
use in the classroom were not
even envisioned when the build-
ing was constructed in the late
1960s, Nicol said.

As a result, technology must
be integrated into the building’s
infrastructure, she said, to sup-
port the advanced systems nec-
essary to effectively teach in to-
day’s college classroom, includ-
ing higher-end, specialized com-
puter labs required for network-
ing, information security and op-
erating systems classes.

“If you were to walk into the
those classrooms in Building C
today, you’d see all sorts of ca-
bles out,” Nicol said. “That
means fewer students in class.
This construction will take care
of that problem.”

Jacobs said, “Preserving and
updating Macomb Community
College’s facilities are critical to
protecting and maintaining the
community’s investment in a vi-
tal resource that provides train-
ing in high-demand career fields
as well as an affordable start to a
bachelor’s degree.”

The renovations are scheduled
to take place during 2015, with
the improved version of C Build-
ing ready for classes in January
2016, Nicol said.

“This really shouldn’t incon-
venience the students,” Nicol
said. “We’re working hard to
move things around so that their
educations won’t be interrupted.

“You have to remember that
MCC has three campuses and the
MTEC facility. So plant and infra-
structure maintenance is impor-
tant. We have a priority list of
work that has to be done and it’s
Building C’s time.”
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From left, Dykes, Keyes, Pickard and Hall

Buick Achievers, UNCF Go HD

The Camaro ZL1 (coupe and
convertible) is equally at home
on the race track, the drag strip
or daily commuting, Doran said.
It features a supercharged 6.2L
V8 with 580 horsepower and 556
lb.-ft. of torque – making the ZL1
the most powerful Camaro ever
from Chevrolet, said Doran. 

“It is also the most technologi-
cally advanced, with standard
Magnetic Ride Control and, on
coupe models, Performance Trac-
tion Management,” Doran said.

The COPO Camaro, limited to
69 units this year, is a hand-built
race car designed exclusively for
drag racing – the first purpose-
built Camaro race car from
Chevy and the quickest Camaro
ever from the factory, Doran
said.

The new Camaro Z/28 returns
the model to its road-racing
roots, Doran said. It features ex-
terior elements designed like a
race car to produce downforce
that presses the car against the
track for greater grip – up to 1.08
g in cornering acceleration – and
faster lap times.

‘Best Range in
Our History’ –
GM’s Mark Reuss
CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1

MCC to Get $8.5M Facelift, Body Work
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In just two years, Ford has rev-
olutionized its police vehicles by
equipping many of the Police In-
terceptor lineup with standard
all-wheel drive, more fuel-effi-
cient EcoBoost engines, and two
new body styles, said Ford
spokesperson Chris Terry.

Ford police vehicle sales grew
48 percent in 2013, while indus-
try police sales rose 22 percent,
according to Polk registration da-
ta, Terry said.

The Ford Police Interceptor
utility was the best-selling police
vehicle in the United States in
2013, gaining 9 points of market
share in 2013.

Demand for Ford police vehicles
outpaced overall industry sales,
which rose 22 percent last year.

The sales growth comes two
years after Ford introduced two
new body styles, including a utili-
ty vehicle, made all-wheel drive
standard equipment across most
of its lineup, and rolled out high-
performance, but efficient, Eco-
Boost engine options, Terry said.

“We revolutionized our police
vehicle lineup with three key
changes that differentiate us
from the competition,” said
Jonathan Honeycutt, police
marketing manager at Ford.

“The new utility vehicle body
style meets officers’ growing
storage needs; standard all-wheel
drive for most models is an in-
dustry-first that provides greater
mobility and security; plus, ex-
panding the range of EcoBoost
engines gives law enforcement
agencies more options to suit
their needs.

“Together, these three ingredi-
ents are driving sales growth and
market share gains for Ford.”

After decades of success with
its reliable Crown Victoria – a V8-
powered, body-on-frame large
sedan – Ford made a strategic de-
cision to modernize its Police In-
terceptor with not one, but two
distinct body styles: a tradition-
al, pursuit-rated large sedan and
a new, pursuit-rated utility vehi-
cle, Honeycutt said.

“Many officers told us, ‘We
need more space, but we also
need performance,’” said Honey-
cutt. “We knew with the amount
of equipment officers now have
to transport that our utility vehi-
cle would be a hit.

“Within two years of reinvent-
ing the category with an all-new
sedan and utility vehicle, we’re
approaching nearly 50 percent
market share. It’s remarkable.”

In 2013, Ford’s police utility ve-
hicle represented 60 percent of
all Ford Police Interceptor sales,
and was the best-selling police
vehicle in the country.

Another decision also has paid
dividends, Terry said. In an in-
dustry-first, the company now of-
fers standard all-wheel drive for
Police Interceptor utility and
sedan models on vehicles
equipped with a 3.7-liter or 3.5-
liter EcoBoost.

Police agencies have taken no-
tice, Terry said.

Approximately 90 percent of
all Police Interceptors sold come
equipped with standard all-wheel
drive.

“It’s a matter of officer safety,
public safety and performance,”
Honeycutt said. “It’s not just the
snowbelt, not by a long shot.

“Wet pavement, dry pavement,
chases that lead off-road, trac-
tion in all conditions – our all-
wheel-drive technology, a system
that operates full-time, can help
shorten pursuits, which protects
everyone involved.

“Officers immediately grasp
the advantages of the tech-
nology,” he added, “and the re-
sponse has been phenomenal.”

The final piece of the automak-

er’s reinvention of its police vehi-
cle is its introduction of fuel-effi-
cient, yet powerful, EcoBoost en-
gines, Honeycutt said.

In recent Los Angeles County
Sheriff Department testing at
Auto Club Speedway in Fontana,
Calif., Ford Police Interceptor
sedan and utility vehicles were
fastest in both 0-100 mph accel-
eration runs and average lap
times for a third consecutive
year, Honeycutt said.

In addition to power and pursuit
capabilities, these EcoBoost en-
gines – like the 3.5-liter and 3.7-liter
non-turbo offerings – provide in-
creased fuel economy ratings over
outgoing models, helping munici-
palities with potential savings on
fleet fuel costs, Honeycutt said.

The latest addition to Ford’s

police lineup – the 2.0-liter Eco-
Boost Special Service Police
Sedan – offers an EPA-estimated
rating of 20 mpg city, 30 mpg
highway and 24 mpg combined.

The 2.0-liter Special Service ve-
hicle comes with many of the
same features and technologies
as the Police Interceptor sedan,
such as a 75-mph rear crash test
rating, two times durability test-
ing, police-tuned suspension, po-
lice brakes, steel wheels, police
interior and upfit options, Honey-
cutt said.

“As agencies look to replace
older, V8-equipped cruisers, Ford
is at the ready with highly capa-
ble, full-size police vehicles that
offer great fuel efficiency for
agencies around the country,”
said Honeycutt.

Ford Police Vehicle Sales Rise 48 Percent

The new Ford Interceptor SUV and sedan

Ford’s Magic Skyway, and the
hugely popular “It’s a Small
World” display that later moved
to Disneyland.

“And Ford was there, too, with
the introduction of Mustang – an
entirely new class of vehicle,
with two doors, design flair and a
long list of options.

“I didn’t realize the signifi-
cance of what I was seeing at the
time, but by the size of the
crowd, I could tell it was a big
deal.”

These companies back in 1964
understood something, Fields
said. They knew that they had to
look beyond commonly held be-
liefs to find new methods and to
defy constraints to accomplish
three things, he said:

The first was to understand
the truth that the world will
change.

Second, they anticipated how
these changes would affect con-
sumers.

And third, they anticipated the
consumers’ spoken wants and
unspoken needs.

“Now, if you master all three,
the reward is not only massive
business growth, but the chance
to change the world,” Fields said.

“After the World’s Fair, IBM
sales skyrocketed.

“In 1966 alone, the company
hired 25,000 new employees and
built new manufacturing facilities
in the United States and Europe.
More importantly, though, IBM
changed the world – first with its
mainframes and then by helping
bring personal computers to the
average person.

“Similarly, Disney has grown
dramatically, from a motion pic-
ture company in 1964 to the
largest media company in the
world today in terms of revenue.

“Even more so, Disney has
made the world a better place –
entertaining millions with a
sense of wonder and imagina-
tion, and bringing families to-
gether.

“And then there’s Mustang, an
instant cultural sensation that
became one of the world’s most
iconic vehicles, reaching 9 mil-
lion sales.”

What was true in 1964 is still
true today, Fields said.

“The great innovators are
those who do three things very
well: They understand, they an-
ticipate and they anticipate
again,” Fields said.

“Apple, of course, is the classic
example. Apple dropped ‘Com-
puter’ from its name when it fore-
saw the world’s migration to mo-
bile platforms and recognized its
customer base was increasingly
global.

“This is why Apple has been
earning 75 percent of its revenue
from its touch-screen iPhone and
iPad, commanding more than
half of the tablet market, adding
900 apps each day and building a
customer base in 100 countries.”

And Ford, Fields said, hasn’t
forgotten the lessons of the past.

That’s why the automaker is
investing in new technology
and has created its EcoBoost en-
gine to create greater fuel effi-
ciency.

“So now, it’s time to look
ahead,” Fields said. “How can we
apply what we’ve learned about
innovation, starting with the
1964 World’s Fair, and up through
today?

“One sure bet is that the funda-
mentals of innovation will guide
the way.

“As we look to 2020 and be-
yond, there are a number of
changes we already can see.

“The global population is
growing. Life expectancies are in-
creasing. And today’s emerging
markets are becoming the epi-
center of growth.”

These facts mean that the
automakers are facing new
choices.

“We can think like car compa-
nies, and view this growth as
merely a sales opportunity.”
Fields said. “Or, we can think like
innovators, and, as Bill Ford has
encouraged, find ways to reduce
consumers’ wasted time and re-
sources in traffic and work to
avoid the potential for global
gridlock.

“It’s why we at Ford are think-
ing not just like a car company,
but like a mobility company.”

Innovation is Key to Growth, Says Ford’s
COO Fields on Mustang’s 50th Birthday

Fields in front of 2015 Mustang

Alfa Romeo, Wester said. The
“4C” name recalls Alfa Romeo’s
sporting tradition: the acronyms
8C and 6C in the 1930s and 1940s
distinguished racing and road
cars fitted with powerful eight-
and six-cylinder engines. The
2015 Alfa Romeo 4C model’s des-
ignation continues this tradition
with the latest all-aluminum 1750
cc four-cylinder engine.

The inspiration for the new
2015 Alfa Romeo 4C dates back
to the 1967 33 Stradale, the ho-
mologated version of the racing
Type 33, which, Wester said,
many consider “one of the most
beautiful cars of all time.”

Like the 33 Stradale that com-
bined extreme mechanical and
functional requirements with un-
deniable Alfa Romeo style and
performance, the 4C coupe
shares its body forms and fol-
lows this performance tradition
with an undoubtedly Italian-
styled composite body “cloth-
ing,” a state-of-the-art carbon
fiber and aluminum structure,
and a high-performance tur-
bocharged engine.

With a purpose-built cockpit
inspired by the legendary 1967
33 Stradale, entering the interior
of the all-new Alfa Romeo 4C
“means entering a world derived
from motorsport – only essential
components for performance are
integrated,” Wester said.

The vehicle has two compos-
ite-framed sport seats, thermo-
formed dashboard and exposed
carbon fiber monocoque high-
light the coupe’s technological
uniqueness, Wester said.

A driver-oriented cockpit with
flat-bottom performance steering
wheel with paddle-shift controls
and aluminum pedals speak to
the brand’s racing spirit, said
Cadiz.

Emphasizing the Alfa Romeo
4C’s advanced technology and
focus on lightweight technical
solutions, said Cadiz, is a seven-
inch full-color thin-film transistor
(TFT) instrument cluster that
displays simple, high-impact
graphics to keep the driver fo-
cused on the road, or track,
ahead.

The 4C also makes great use of
ultra-lightweight carbon fiber as
well as aluminum and composite
structures, Wester said. To cre-
ate the ultra-lightweight architec-
ture needed for maximum per-
formance and dynamic efficien-

cy, he said, Alfa Romeo 4C engi-
neers looked to Formula 1 and
only the most advanced super-
cars for state-of-the-art materi-
als. 

The result, Wester said, is a
monocoque made entirely of car-
bon fiber that delivers extraordi-
nary stiffness and strength. At-
tached to the Alfa Romeo 4C’s ex-
otic monocoque are front and
rear cell structures, roof rein-
forcements and an engine-
mounting frame made from light-
weight aluminum.

Alfa Romeo engineers contin-
ued the use of state-of-the-art
materials by creating the body-
work entirely of SMC (Sheet
Molding Compound), a low-den-
sity, high-strength composite ma-
terial that is 20 percent lighter
and dimensionally more rigid
than steel, Wester said.

Providing the ability to create
complex shapes while saving
weight by 20 percent compared
with steel are PUR-RIM (injected
polyurethane) fascias and rear
spoiler. Engineers optimized the
Alfa Romeo 4C’s windshield and
side windows by using 10 per-
cent thinner glass to reduce
weight by up to 15 percent.

Finally, Wester said, two sport
seats feature a carbon fiber and
fiberglass-reinforced composite
structure to deliver the strength
and seating position needed for
performance driving.

It also comes with a high-tech
powertrain for “exceptional”
track performance and drivabili-
ty, Wester said.

“The engine is the beating
heart of any Alfa Romeo, and for
the 4C, it beats to an all-new 1750
cc direct-injection 237 horsepow-
er aluminum engine,” Wester
said.

“To ensure exceptional per-
formance and drivability on the
racetrack or city streets, this
new engine features cutting-edge
technical solutions, including di-
rect-injection, intercooler, dual
(intake and exhaust) continuous
variable-valve timing (VVT),
eight counterweights, and intake
and exhaust systems optimized
for Alfa Romeo 4C’s mid-engine
layout.”

The 4C combines the best
technical and manufacturing
competencies of Alfa Romeo and
Maserati, Wester said.

In addition, Wester said, the
Alfa Romeo 4C was boosted by
the technological contributions
of Italian suppliers.

Alfa Romeo 4C Introduced
At Auto Show in New York

CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1
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CADILLAC A Prestige Automotive
Group Company

Showroom Hours: Mon. & Thurs. 8:30 a.m.-8 p.m. • Tue., Wed., & Fri. 8:30 a.m.-6 p.m. • Sat. 10 a.m.-4 p.m.

8333 EAST 11 MILE ROAD • I-696 & VAN DYKE • 888-548-8939
Visit our website: www.PrestigeCadillac.com for all our specials

*For qualified GM Employees, all prices are based on GMS pricing with all eligible discounts,conquest, rebates and or loyalty assinged to dealer.
Prices are plus tax, title and plate fee. Must qualify for Tier 1 thru Ally, GM Financial or US Bank.

For lease loyalty eligibility you need 2004 or newer Cadillac. Pictures may not represent actual vehicle. Expires 4/30/13. **Call Dealer for Details.
Not available with some other offers and residency restrictions apply.

2014 CADILLAC CTS

PER
MO

$$339999**
36 MONTH LEASE
10K MILES PER YEAR

2014 CADILLAC XTS

PER
MO

$$336699**
36 MONTH LEASE
10K MILES PER YEAR

2014 CADILLAC ATS

PER
MO

$$226699**
36 MONTH LEASE
10K MILES PER YEAR

2014 CADILLAC SRX

PER
MO

$$229999**
36 MONTH LEASE
10K MILES PER YEAR

ALL NEW 2014 CADILLAC ELR

PER
MO

$$669999****
39 MONTH LEASE
10K MILES PER YEAR

$5,300 DUE AT SIGNING

JOHN DEGRANDE
Sales & Leasing Consultant • 39 years experience

CADILLAC

SPRING EVENT

#42333 #21552#44296

475 SUMMIT DRIVE • 248-292-2502 • 5825 HIGHLAND RD. (M59) • WATERFORD

CALL
BRUCE LITVIN
– 24/7 & 365 –

40 YEARS
OF QUALITY SERVICE

CELL # 1-586-405-5175
blitvin@lunghamer.com

1-888-665-5438

All leases are 36 months and 10K miles per year.
All payment are plus tax,title, doc and plate fees. All payments are GMS pricing.

For the Cruze, must have Ally, or US bank lease in household.

‘14 CHEVROLETVOLT

Lease for 36 months

$219*
mo

ZZEERROO
DDOOWWNN

‘14 CHEVROLETCRUZE
MSRP $20,735

GM Employee Price 
$19,324

Lease for 36 months

0 DOWN NO SECURITY DEPOSIT REQUIRED

$159*
mo

PPRRIICCEESS
EEVVEENN LLOOWWEERR
IIFF YYOOUU HHAAVVEE OONNEE OOFF TTHHEE SSEELLEECCTT
RREECCAALLLL VVEEHHIICCLLEESS IINN YYOOUURR HHOOMMEE..

PPLLEEAASSEE CCAALLLL
FFOORR SSOOMMEE OOFF TTHHEE LLOOWWEESSTT LLEEAASSEE PPRRIICCEESS NNOOWW..

The Chevrolet Equinox and
GMC Terrain with available for-
ward collision alert technology
earned 2014 Top Safety Pick-plus
ratings from the Insurance Insti-
tute for Highway Safety.

The two vehicles were the only
midsize SUVs of nine evaluated
to earn Good ratings in the insti-
tute’s small overlap front crash
test, said GM spokesperson Jen-
nifer Ecclestone.

The Equinox and Terrain join
the 2014 Chevrolet Malibu mid-
size sedan in earning the insti-
tute’s highest safety rating.

The test, in which 25 percent
of a vehicle’s front end on the
driver side strikes a 5-foot-high
rigid barrier at 40 mph, is de-
signed to replicate what happens
when the front corner of a vehi-
cle strikes another vehicle or an
object like a tree or a utility pole,
Ecclestone said.

“Having the only two midsize
SUVs that earned the Top Safety
Pick Plus designation,” said Gay
Kent, director of General Motors
Global Safety Strategy and Vehi-
cle Programs, “speaks to GM’s fo-
cus on improving our vehicles by
offering advanced crash avoid-
ance technologies that can help
avoid a crash, and by enhancing
vehicle structure and occupant
protection if a crash occurs.

“We are very pleased that the
IIHS has recognized the safety of
both the Chevrolet Equinox and
GMC Terrain with this presti-
gious rating.”

Equinox and Terrain previous-
ly were named Top Safety Picks,
Ecclestone said.

The criteria for 2014 Top Safe-
ty Pick-plus status was revised to
include vehicles offering a frontal
crash protection system meeting
IIHS requirements, as well as
achieving a Good rating – IIHS’

highest classification – in four of
five crash tests, and no less than
an Acceptable rating in the fifth
test.

The 2014 Equinox and Terrain
received Good ratings in all five
crash tests.

The available forward collision
alert technology on Equinox and
Terrain uses a camera to detect
when a driver is at risk of hitting
the vehicle ahead, and delivers
visual and audible alerts, Eccle-
stone said.

It is part of a safety package
that also includes the vehicles’
lane departure warning and rear
park assist.

The package is available on
Equinox 2LT trim and standard
on the LTZ model.

On Terrain, it’s available on
SLE-2 and SLT-1 trims, and stan-
dard on SLT-2 and Terrain Denali
models.

Along with forward collision
alert, Equinox and Terrain are
equipped with six standard air
bags, including dual frontal air
bags, head curtain side air bags
and pelvic/thorax seat-mounted
side air bags – as well as an avail-
able rear-vision camera that
helps drivers identify objects be-
hind the vehicle, Ecclestone said.

Equinox, Terrain Earn Safety
Awards; Top Competitors

“We are pleased
that IIHS has

recognized the
safety of Equinox
and GMC Terrain.”

– Gay Kent
GM
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Picture may not represent actual sale vehicle. All applicable rebates including Lease Conquest or Lease Loyalty have been deducted from Sale Price/Payment and are subject to change by the manufacturer without notice
and are plus title, tax and plate fees. All leases are 39 months/10,000 miles per year, except where noted and are plus title, tax and plate fees. GM Employee Pricing to everyone excludes Corvette, SS, 2015 Tahoe and Sub-
urban. $3500 minimum trade-in guarantee is on 2003 or newer vehicles with under 115,000 actual miles. No branded titles. Certain restrictions may apply, see dealer for complete details. Sale ends 4/21/2014 @ 6:00PM.

2014 MALIBU “LT”
• 2 Yr/24,000 Scheduled Maintenance INCLUDED!

• 2.5L DOHC VVT Engine! • Automatic Transmission!
• Power Locks & Windows! • Cruise & Tilt Wheel!

• AM/FM/XM Radio W/CD!• Remote Keyless Entry!
• Aluminum Wheels!

• 36 MPG on the Highway!
Stk. #E17708

MSRP $24,435
NO 1ST PAYMENT

OR SECURITY DEPOSIT!

2014 CRUZE “LT”
• 2 Yr/24,000 Scheduled Maintenance INCLUDED!
• ECOTEC 1.4L “Turbo” Engine! • Automatic Transmission!

• Power Locks & Windows! • Cruise & Tilt Wheel!
• AM/FM/XM Radio W/CD!

• Remote Keyless Entry!
• Machined-Faced Alloy Wheels!

• 38 MPG on the Highway!
Stk. #E16495

MSRP $20,735
NO 1ST PAYMENT

OR SECURITY DEPOSIT!

2014 EQUINOX “LS”
• 2 Yr/24,000 Scheduled Maintenance INCLUDED!

• 2.4L DOHC Engine! • Automatic Transmission!
• Power Locks & Windows! • Cruise & Tilt Wheel!

• AM/FM/XM Radio w/CD!
• Remote Keyless Entry!
• 17” Aluminum Wheels!

• 32 MPG on the Highway!
Stk. #E16747

MSRP $25,450
NO SECURITY DEPOSIT!

Minimum $3,500 for Your Trade-In…GUARANTEED!

2014 SILVERADO “LT”

Starting At

$17,534
Starting At

$19,850

Starting At

$21,928
Starting At

$30,488

SPRING
SALE!

Celebrate With GM Employee Pricing to EVERYONE on EVERYTHING

Lease for Only!
$155OR $129
$$00DDoowwnn“Sign & Drive Just $999 Down

Lease for Only!
$185OR $159
$$00DDoowwnn“Sign & Drive Just $999 Down

• 2 Yr/24,000 Scheduled Maintenance INCLUDED!
• ECOTEC 4.3L Engine! • Automatic Transmission!

• Power Locks & Windows! • Cruise & Tilt!
• 17” Aluminum Wheels!

• 4.2” Color Screen Radio!
• Locking Rear Differential!
• 23 MPG on the Highway!

Stk. #2E7894
MSRP $38,330

NO SECURITY DEPOSIT!

4X4 DOUBLE DOOR

CHEVY 
OPEN
HOUSE
EVENT

Lease for Only!
$225OR$189
$$00DDoowwnn“Sign & Drive Just $999 Down

24 Month Lease!
$229OR$179
$$00DDoowwnn“Sign & Drive Just $999 Down

touch screen, Batey said. Trax al-
so will be the first in its class to
offer Siri Eyes Free.

Trax technologies also en-
hance passenger safety, Batey
said, with more standard air bags
than its competitors, a standard
rearview camera and available
rear park assist.

Additional vehicle highlights,
Batey said, include:

• Ecotec 1.4L turbocharged
engine that delivers the efficien-
cy of a small-displacement en-
gine with the power of a larger
engine on demand;

• Available all-wheel drive;
• Electric power steering;
• Available next-generation

OnStar and MyLink;
• Ten standard air bags, in-

cluding side-curtain and knee air
bags – and the segment’s only
rear seat-mounted thorax air
bags;

• Several storage areas, in-
cluding upper and lower glove
boxes – with a USB port and aux-
iliary jack in the upper glove box
for plug-in media;

• 60/40-split fold-flat rear seat
and fold-down front passenger
seatback for storing and trans-
porting items up to eight feet
long;

• Standard remote keyless en-
try and available remote start.

Trax will be offered in LS, LT
and LTZ trims. Pricing will be an-
nounced closer to the start of
production.

Batey said one of the strengths
of the Trax is that drivers don’t
have to sacrifice performance.

Trax is powered by a power-
dense Ecotec 1.4L turbocharged
four-cylinder engine backed by a
six-speed automatic transmis-
sion.

The engine is expected to be
rated at an SAE-certified 138
horsepower and 148 lb.-ft. of

torque between 1,850 and 4,900
rpm.

The wide rpm range for the
maximum torque – a specific
trait of turbocharged engines –
helps it deliver a more confident
driving experience, with a strong
feeling of power across the
rpm band, Batey said. The tur-
bocharger’s on-demand perform-
ance enables greater power
when needed with the lower fuel
consumption of a small-displace-
ment engine when it’s not, said
Batey.

The turbocharger is integrated
within the exhaust manifold
for reduced weight and greater
packaging flexibility.

A solid cast crankshaft and
forged connecting rods deliver
additional durability to support
the engine’s pressurized power
and torque.

A Hydra-Matic 6T40 six-speed
automatic transmission with
TAPShift control is matched with
the 1.4L turbo engine. It has a
unique design, Batey said, with
the planetary gearsets posi-
tioned on the same axis as the
engine crankshaft centerline,
making the entire powertrain
unit shorter fore-to-aft.

This design enables a shorter
overall vehicle length, increased
interior space, enhanced safety
crush zones and lower weight.

A “steep” first gear and a “tall”
overdrive top gear achieve a
wide ratio spread of 6.14:1. This
allows Trax to achieve robust ac-
celeration, as well as fuel effi-
ciency and lower engine noise at
highway cruising speeds, said
Batey.

“It is engineered with precise
suspension tuning to deliver one
of the segment’s quietest and
most refined driving experi-
ences,” Batey said.

The Trax also incorporates
technologies that help avoid
crashes and protect occupants.

New Trax Hits U.S. Market
CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1



Chevrolet is introducing the
2015 Cruze at the New York Inter-
national Auto Show.

The 2015 Cruze will come with
revised exterior styling, en-
hanced interior convenience and
greater connectivity – including
new Text Message Alerts, Apple
Siri integration and OnStar 4G
LTE with available Wi-Fi hotspot.

The new exterior styling cues
are inspired by the new Impala
and restyled 2014 Malibu, while
more intuitive controls update
the interior, said GM spokesper-
son Annalisa Bluhm.

New voice-controlled features
are designed to enhance safety
when responding to text mes-
sages in the vehicle, she said.

“We’ve simply made a great,
versatile car even better,” said
Steve Majoros, Chevrolet direc-
tor of passenger car and
crossover marketing.

“Chevrolet continues to de-
sign, build and sell the most com-
pelling small cars in its history
and the 2015 Cruze offers more
of the features, connectivity and
efficiency that are important to
today’s customers.”

The Cruze’s facelift for 2015 re-
freshes the appearance for LS, LT,
RS and LTZ models, Majoros said.
A prominent dual-port front fas-
cia takes styling cues from Im-
pala and Malibu, contributing a
more cohesive look across
Chevrolet’s sedan range – includ-
ing LED daytime running lamps
on LT and LTZ trims.

“They complement the Cruze’s
swept-back headlamps, for a
sportier presence,” Majoros said.
“Several new exterior and interi-
or colors will also be offered for
2015.”

Updates on the interior that
enhance convenience:

• Revised cupholders to make

it easier to insert and remove
cups;

• Trunk release relocated to
the center console;

• Door lock switches relocat-
ed from the center console to the
front doors.

In addition to LS, LT, RS and
LTZ models, the 2015 Cruze line-
up includes Cruze Eco (EPA-rated
42 mpg highway) and Cruze
Diesel (EPA 46 mpg highway), the
most efficient non-hybrid passen-
ger car in America, Bluhm said.

“That’s about 10 percent
greater efficiency than the Volks-
wagen Jetta TDI,” Majoros said.
“The Cruze also delivers more
horsepower (151 hp) and torque
(264 lb.-ft.) than the Jetta TDI
(140 hp/236 lb.-ft.). Cruze Diesel’s
driving range is up to 717 miles
per tank.”

Cruze offers more standard
safety features than any other
car in its class, including 2014
models of the Ford Focus and
Toyota Corolla, Majoros said.

Cruze has 10 standard air bags
– including side-impact and knee
air bags for front passengers –
and offers side blind zone alert,
rear cross traffic alert, rear park
assist and a rearview camera.

“Cruze remains a strong entry
in the compact segment, with
features that continue to bring
new customers to Chevrolet,”
said Majoros.

“Along with Spark, Spark EV,
Sonic and Volt, Chevy’s lineup of
efficient, technologically ad-
vanced small cars is one of the
industry’s most compelling.”

The enhanced connectivity
and convenience features for the
2015 Cruze include a new Text
Message Alerts feature for smart-
phone users with Bluetooth pro-
file (M.A.P.), which reads incom-
ing texts through the vehicle’s

speakers, and Siri Eyes Free for
iPhone iOS 6 and iOS 7 users to
enhance connectivity and con-
venience, Bluhm said. Each en-
ables voice-controlled connectiv-
ity, to help keep phones in pock-
ets and hands on the wheel.

Additional standard and avail-
able features include:

• Seven-inch-diagonal color
touch screen and additional USB
ports;

• Chevrolet Connected by On-
Star 4G LTE with built-in Wi-Fi
hotspot;

• Next-generation OnStar and
MyLink enhancements with en-
hanced voice recognition;

• Available Chevrolet App-
Shop (later availability);

• Available navigation.
OnStar 4G LTE with available

Wi-Fi hotspot provides a mobile
hub for drivers and passengers
with easy access to apps and
services that require a high-
speed data connection, Bluhm
said.

The Chevrolet AppShop allows
owners to view all available apps
and download them directly to
the vehicle, then organize, up-
date or delete them as needed,
Bluhm said. Available apps con-
nect drivers to vehicle data, mu-
sic, news, weather, travel infor-
mation and more.

This small-car strategy is pro-
ducing big-time results, Bluhm
said. Cruze is the cornerstone of

Chevrolet’s North American
small-car lineup, which is attract-
ing a greater share of the market
and more young, first-time cus-
tomers to Chevy showrooms.
Cruze is also Chevrolet’s best-
selling car around the world,
with more than 2.5 million sold
globally since its launch in mid-
2010.

“These new customers are dis-
covering the fun, value and dura-
bility Chevy stands for,” said Paul
Edwards, U.S. vice president,
Chevrolet Marketing. “In fact,
Chevrolet is second among buy-
ers under 25, as the brand con-
tinues to grow share in the small-
car segments.”

Collectively, the lineup in
America – including Spark, Spark
EV, Sonic, Cruze and Volt – saw a
15.4 percent increase in overall
sales in the first quarter of 2014,
Edwards said.

Since Cruze’s launch about
four years ago, and the additions
of the Spark and Sonic, Chevro-
let’s overall share of the small- ,
compact- and mini-car segments
has more than tripled – up 221
percent – with nearly half of the
customers new to Chevrolet.

“The diversity of Chevrolet’s
small-car lineups, from the effi-
ciency of the Cruze clean diesel
and the pure electric perform-
ance of the Spark EV, offers a
driving solution for everyone,”
Edwards said.
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Wally Edgar
Chevrolet Employee HQ

Be treated with the respect you deserve.
TOP DOLLAR FOR YOUR TRADE & the Best Deal PERIOD!!

Wally Edgar
Chevrolet

Located right o!
I-75 onM-24,

2minutes N. of the
Palace of Auburn Hills

1-866-906-0279

JAY CHAISER x117
Fax: 248-391-0189
Cell: 248-821-8026
Email:
jchaiser@wallyedgar.com

Sales Hours:
Mon. - Thur. 8:00 am - 8:00 pm
Fri. 8:00 am - 6:00 pm
Sat. 9:30 am - 3:00 pm 
Sun. Closed

CHEVY DEALER CODE 44085

www.wallyedgar.com • www.wallyedgar.com • www.wallyedgar.com • www.wallyedgar.com
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Make us your Michigan P.E.P. Car Connection

*Lease payment examples based on GM Employee Discount price plus tax, title, plate and first month payment (Except Cruze) due at sign-
ing with all rebates including USAA military rebate assigned to dealer. Lease responsible for excess wear and tear as well as exceeding con-
tracted mileage. Security deposit may be required by lender. Due to advertising deadlines, price subject to change.

2014 TRAVERSE

$207*

36 MONTH • 10K LEASE

2014 CRUZE
$109*

36 MONTH • 10K LEASE
$999 DOWN

FIRST PAYMENT WAIVED !

2014 VOLT

$229*

36 MONTH • 10K LEASE

Jeff Caul
586-274-0396
PEP QUOTES BY PHONE OR EMAIL:
JEFF CAUL AT JCAUL@BUFFWHELAN.COM

Free shuttle service to home, office or shopping.

buff whelan chevrolet
WHERE THE DEALS MAKE THE DIFFERENCE, EVERY DAY SINCE 1970!

Van Dyke • South of 18 Mile • Sterling Heights

☺ We guarantee the lowest price or it’s free! ☺ We guarantee the lowest price or it’s free!

☺ We guarantee the lowest price or it’s free! ☺ We guarantee the lowest price or it’s free!
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*See dealer for details. All Rebates/Incentives have been deducted from sale price/payment and are subject to change by manufacturer
without notice. GM Employee discount required except where noted. All leases include GM Lease Loyalty and are based on 10,000 miles
per year. + 1st payment, tax, title and plate fee due at signing unless otherwise noted. Offers expire 04/30/2014.

CONVENIENT HOURS:
Mon. & Thurs.

8:30 am – 9 pm
Tues., Wed., Fri.

8:30 am – 6:30 pm
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METRO PKWY.

18 MILE RD.

SINCE
1989

2.4L DOHC 4 Cylinder with VVT
FWD, 6 Speed Automatic

36 Month Lease/10,000 Miles

Stk.#42740

2014 EQUINOX LS

$222*+ Tax with
$0 Down

No Security Deposit Required

Stk.#42751

2014 CRUZE 1LT

Stk.#42267

2014 IMPALA LS

NO SECURITY
DEPOSIT

REQUIRED

NO FIRST
PAYMENT

OR SECURITY
DEPOSIT

REQUIRED

NO SECURITY
DEPOSIT

REQUIRED

1.4L Ecotec Turbo
6 Speed Automatic & More…

36 Month Lease/10,000 Miles

$156*+ Tax with
$0 Down

No Security Deposit Required • No First Payment

Ecotec 2.5L DOHC
6 Speed Automatic & More…

36 Month Lease/10,000 Miles

$252*+ Tax with
$0 Down

No Security Deposit Required

OVER 1,000
New Chevrolets in Stock!

WE GUARANTEE THEWE GUARANTEE THE
LOWEST PRICES OR IT’S FREELOWEST PRICES OR IT’S FREE☺☺

586-274-0396

buff whelan
chevrolet

Spring is here &
so are the DEALS!!! 

at

2015 Chevrolet Cruze LTZ

2015 Chevy Cruze, to Debut
Soon, Will Carry Facelift

Renovations to improve stu-
dent access into Macomb Com-
munity College’s South Campus
from 12 Mile Road was sched-
uled to begin this week.

Initial site work on campus
will not affect traffic on the road. 

The construction on Ma-
comb’s South Campus will pro-
vide improved pedestrian access
from 12 Mile Road into the interi-
or of the campus and its build-
ings, said school spokesperson
Jeanne Nicol.

Currently, there is no pedestri-
an route from the bus stops on
12 Mile Road at the college into
the campus proper. 

In addition to creating an actu-
al walkway for Macomb students
who rely on bus transportation
to attend classes, the renova-
tions and site work will also cre-
ate a direct link to a crosswalk
that will be constructed to span
12 Mile Road, Nicol said.

The crosswalk will connect
Macomb’s South Campus and
Wayne State University’s (WSU)
new Advanced Technology Edu-
cation (ATE) Center, which is lo-
cated across from the college on
the north side of 12 Mile Road. 

The crosswalk is scheduled to
open in August and will provide
students at both Macomb and
WSU’s ATE Center with a viable
pedestrian connection.

Beginning early July, the proj-
ect will affect traffic on 12 Mile
Road through single lane clo-
sures east- and westbound as
the crosswalk is constructed,
Nicol said.

The addition of the crosswalk
will also include installation of
a traffic signal as well as a medi-
an between opposing traffic
lanes.

The work is scheduled to con-
clude by mid-August. 

Crosswalk to Aid
MCC Students in
Crossing 12 Mile



Detroit carmakers have come
back – in style.

And Kelly Blue Book lets it be
known in its Brand Image
Awards.

The 2014 Brand Image Award
winners, based on annual new-
car buyer perception data, were
announced last week by Kelley
Blue Book, www.kbb.com.

Ford, GMC and Chevrolet came
up winners.

Reclaiming the top spot among
truck shoppers, Ford ousts last
year’s winner, Toyota, from the
Best Overall Truck Brand category.

Ford has won five out of the six
times Kelley Blue Book has an-
nounced this award. The F-150
and Super Duty F-250 and F-350
helped the manufacturer earn back
the award for 2014, as truck shop-
pers ranked the brand highest
among all other truck brands.

Benefiting from its upscale De-
nali trim models, GMC also wins its
first Brand Image Award as 2014’s
Most Refined Brand, with high
ratings for comfort, interior layout
and prestige/sophistication.

Mercedes-Benz has a second
consecutive win for this category
among luxury brands, and histor-
ically has scored very high in
prestige/sophistication since the
inception of the Brand Image
Awards in 2008.

Chevrolet reclaimed the Best
Car Styling Brand title from last
year’s winner, Ford.

“Chevrolet had a slew of re-
designs during the past year,
which have captured the consid-
eration of car shoppers,” said
Kelley Blue Book Senior Analyst

Arthur Henry. “Chevrolet decid-
ed to take a daring approach
with its styling and it paid off.
The models primarily driving the
success of Chevrolet's expres-
sive design efforts are the
Corvette Stingray and Camaro.”

The Kelley Blue Book Brand
Image Awards recognize au-
tomakers’ outstanding achieve-

ments in creating and maintain-
ing brand attributes that capture
the attention and enthusiasm of
the new-vehicle buying public.

Award categories are calculat-
ed among luxury, non-luxury and
truck shoppers.

Hwei-Lin Oetken, vice president
of market intelligence for Kelley
Blue Book, said, “The classic say-
ing, ‘perception is reality’ falls
true with the Kelley Blue Book
Brand Image Awards, as more than
12,000 in-market new-car shop-
pers have voiced their opinions
about today’s automakers.

“With strong marketing com-
munications coming from auto
manufacturers and dealers, and
the increased importance of peer
reviews and ratings, consumers
today are more influenced than
ever to take interest in a brand,
ultimately affecting their vehicle
purchase decisions.”
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ED RINKE We Are Professional Grade

EVERYONE GETS GM EMPLOYEE PRICING OR BELOW ON EVERYTHING

PULL-AHEAD IS BACK…GET OUT OF YOUR LEASE EARLY!!!

NEW SILVERADO

PURCHASE
FOR

$34,925*

LEASE
FOR

$279*
$999 DOWN

2014

NEW SILVERADO

PURCHASE
FOR

$29,315*

LEASE
FOR

$177*
$999 DOWN

2014

NEW CRUZE

PURCHASE
FOR

$17,375*

LEASE
FOR

$99*
$999 DOWN

2014

NEW MALIBU

PURCHASE
FOR

$19,775*

LEASE
FOR

$139*
$999 DOWN

2014

PUSH, PULL, DRAG, OR DRIVE - $3,500 GUARANTEED FOR YOUR OLD TRADE-IN!

SERVICE HOURS: Monday & Thursday 6:30am-9:00pm; Tuesday, Wednesday & Friday 6:30am-6:00pm • Shuttle at 6:30am - Pick-up Both Ways • All Day starting at 6:30am.

$2395
Fluid Level, 

Brake & Alignment Check Included.

Open Mondays & Thursdays until 8:30pm

We use Genuine GM Oil & Filter
No additional or hidden charges.
Out the door pricing.

Quick Oil Change EXPRESS
LANELUBE OIL FILTER

Excludes synthetic, Diesel & Med. Duty Trucks.
Most GM cars & trucks. One coupon per customer. Must
present coupon with order. Plus tax. Expires 4-30-14.

Up to 5 qts.

BODY SHOP
586-754-7000

ext 1231

INSURANCE
WRECK

AMENDED

WE REPAIR
ALL MAKES
& MODELS FREE OIL CHANGE

With Each Major Repair

TRANSPORTATION AVAILABLE
During Scheduled Repairs

GM SERVICE CENTER
MICHIGAN’S LARGEST

•SERVICE DEPT. •PARTS •BODY SHOP

866-452-1547
26125 Van Dyke @ 101/2 Mile

Center Line, MI  48015

EDRINKE • FAST  • FRIENDLY  • DISCOUNTS

VISIT OUR

QUICK LANE

NEW VERANO

PURCHASE
FOR

$21,565*

LEASE
FOR

$163*
$1,999 DOWN

2014

NEW SIERRA

PURCHASE FOR
$30,539*

LEASE
FOR

$167*
$1,999 DOWN

2014

NEW LACROSSE

PURCHASE
FOR

$27,881*

LEASE
FOR

$188*
$1,999 DOWN

2014

NEW REGAL

PURCHASE
FOR

$25,835*

LEASE
FOR

$169*
$1,999 DOWN

2014

NEW TERRAIN

PURCHASE
FOR

$23,611*

LEASE
FOR

$159*
$1,999 DOWN

2014

NEW ENCLAVE

PURCHASE
FOR

$33,175*

LEASE
FOR

$221*
$1,999 DOWN

2014

YUKON

PURCHASE FOR
$53,499*
2 LEFT AT THIS PRICE!

LEASE
FOR

$539*
$1,999 DOWN

2014

NEW ACADIA

PURCHASE
FOR

$30,350*

LEASE
FOR

$209*
$1,999 DOWN

2014

See us for your GM employee purchases.

1-877-451-7707
26125 Van Dyke at 101/2 Mile Rd.

Visit our website: edrinke.com
SHOWROOM HOURS: Mon. & Thurs. 8:30am-9:00pm; Tues., Wed., & Fri. 8:30am-6:00pm

All prices & payments include GM rebates. Pictures may not represent actual vehicle. Prices subject to change per GM incentives. Prices
and payments are inclusive of active GM Employee Discount (Unless otherwise stated). Leases are 36 months, 10,000 miles per year
w/ approved S Tier credit w/ $999 due at signing, (unless otherwise noted).  Prices & payments are plus tax, title, and plate fees. Re-
fundable security deposit required on certain vehicles – to be determined by lender. Must qualify for Conquest or Loyalty.  $3500 trade-
in guarantee for 2003 or newer vehicle in drive-able condition with less than 115,000 miles, less any reconditioning costs, no branded
titles, see sales person for details. **Certain restrictions may apply, see dealer for complete details. Expiration Date – 4/30/2014

Nicole
Dodge

nhuminski@edrinke.com

Jim
Pfeifle

jpfeifle@edrinke.com

Find Us on
FACEBOOK

NO DOC
FEES

Dennis
Thacker

dthacker@edrinke.com

Paul
Makowski

pmakowski@edrinke.com

See us for your GM employee purchases.

1-866-452-1300
24231 Van Dyke at 91/2 Mile Rd.

Visit our website: edrinke.com
SHOWROOM HOURS: Mon. & Thurs. 8:30am-9:00pm; Tues., Wed., & Fri. 8:30am-6:00pm

All prices & payments include GM rebates. Pictures may not represent actual vehicle. Prices subject to change per GM incentives. Prices and
payments are inclusive of active GM Employee Discount (Unless otherwise stated). Leases are 36 months, 10,000 miles per year w/ approved
S Tier credit w/ $999 due at signing, (unless otherwise noted). Terrain and Yukon leases are 39 months. Prices & payments are plus tax, title,
and plate fees. Refundable security deposit required on certain vehicles – to be determined by lender. Must qualify for Conquest or Loyalty.
$3500 trade-in guarantee for 2003 or newer vehicle in drive-able condition with less than 115,000 miles, less any reconditioning costs, no
branded titles, see sales person for details. **Certain restrictions may apply, see dealer for complete details. Expiration Date – 4/30/2014

NEW TRAVERSE

PURCHASE 
FOR

$27,305*

LEASE
FOR

$199*
$999 DOWN

2014

NEW EQUINOX

PURCHASE 
FOR

$21,792*

LEASE
FOR

$167*
$999 DOWN

2014

NEW CAMARO

PURCHASE 
FOR

$21,417*

LEASE
FOR

$217*
$999 DOWN

2014

NEW IMPALA

PURCHASE 
FOR

$24,343*

LEASE
FOR

$198*
$999 DOWN

2014

DBL. CAB
4X4

XL DENALI

MSRP 66,055

DBL. CAB
4X4

CREW
CAB.

Now looking for experienced salespeople to join our team!

WARREN URGENTCARE

“We Care”
URGENT CARE FOR ACCIDENTS AND INJURY

ADULT & PEDIATRIC ILLNESS
Digital X-Rays, EKG and Lab Work, On-Site Lab Service, Strep, Mono,
Pregnancy & Urine Testing, Vaccinations, Sports & School Physicals,

Occupational Medicine, Work-Related Injuries,
Pre-Hire Physicals (BAT & Urine Screening)

SPECIAL ON SPORTS PHYSICAL $25.00 State-of-the-Art Facility

8am-10pm • 7 Days a week • 365 Days a Year
“Bringing Quality Urgent Care To Your Neighborhood”

586-276-8200
31700 Van Dyke • Warren, MI 48093

On Van Dyke Rd., between 13 & 14 Mile in
St. John’s Windemere Park

OTHER CONVENIENT LOCATIONS:

ATTENTION
Chrysler, GM, Ford

Employees, we’re within
2 miles of your plants

HAP & BCN
NO Referrals Needed!
www.warrenurgentcare.com

FLU SHOTS

Woodland Urgent Care
22341 W. 8 Mile Road

Detroit

313-387-8700

N. East Macomb Urgent Care
43900 Garfield, Suite 121

Clinton Township

586-868-2600

Ford, GMC, Chevrolet Lead Brand Images

Ford Motor Company, in col-
laboration with the Charles H.
Wright Museum of African Amer-
ican History, will host the 16th
Annual Ford Freedom Award cer-
emonies May 21.

Deadline for nominations for
the award is May 2.

The theme of this year’s cele-
bration is “the power of perse-
verance.”

Ford Freedom honoree and for-
mer South African President Nel-
son Mandela, along with Ford
Freedom Award scholar and civil
rights activist Myrlie Evers-
Williams will be honored, said
event spokesperson Lisa Wilmore.

Additionally, a special award
will be presented to retired Lt. Col.
Alexander Jefferson, Tuskegee Air-
man pilot and World War II POW.

Each honoree will be recog-
nized for his or her persistent
and tenacious efforts in the face
of tremendous challenge. The
Ford Freedom Awards is a
fundraiser for the Charles H.
Wright Museum.

To commemorate this year’s
event, Ford is seeking Detroiters
who have demonstrated the pow-
er of perseverance, Wilmore said.

The community may nominate
living individuals who demon-
strate the power to endure in
pursuit of their goals.

Nominations should include a
brief but compelling summary of
three to four paragraphs de-
scribing what distinguishes the
individual from others.

Contact information for both
the nominator and nominee
should be included and emailed
to cstewa99@ford.com by May 2.

Selected honorees and their
nominators will receive tickets
to attend this year’s event.

Tickets are $40 per person, or
$35 for Wright Museum mem-
bers. A special VIP meet-and-
greet is available for $75, which
includes an afterglow experience
and photo opportunity with the
honorees.

For additional event and ticket
information, call the Music Hall
Box Office at 313-887-8581 or vis-
it www.fordfreedomaward.com.

16th Annual Ford
Freedom Awards
Set for May 21

“Chevrolet took a
daring approach
with its styling
and it paid off.”

– Arthur Henry
Kelley Blue Book
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